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BRITONS in their tens of thousands 
turned out to face down far-right 
thugs this week, following sever-
al days of sickening violence that 
threatened to tear the country apart.
	 Thousands of an-
ti-racist protesters took 
to the streets of several 
major cities and small-
er towns on Wednes-
day and Thursday in 
a show of love over 
hate - prompting the 
hate-mongers behind 
gatherings targeting 
immigration centres 
to backpedal on the 
gatherings ever being 
planned.
	 Around 100 hate-fu-
elled protests were 
planned across the 
country on Wednes-
day night, many of 
which were planned in 
now-deleted far-right 
groups on apps such as 
Telegram, with police 
deployed in their big-
gest mobilisation of re-
sources since the 2011 
riots.

chaos and disorder
	 Thugs had been using 
now-banned channels 
on the app to threaten 
the lives of anti-racism 
campaigners, make 
sick slurs and exchange 
tips on how to ‘hood 
up’. But their  promis-
es to turn up at immi-
gration centers at 8pm 

vanished into thin air 
in face of overwhelm-
ing opposition from 
law-abiding Britons.
	 Police estimated at 
least 25,000 anti-racist 
activists turned out in 
force in cities across the 
UK - and said that tem-
pers were also cooled 
by drizzly weather that 
hit southern parts of 
England on Wednes-
day night.
	 And to add to a 
strong sense that law 
and order was being re-
stored, scores of protes-
tors from violent clash-
es earlier in the week 
were arrested with 
dozens of convictions 
sealed in rapid time, as 
courts worked 24-hour 
shifts to process the 
backlog quickly and 
create a stern deter-
rent for other would-be 
troublemakers.
	 Almost a week of 
chaos and disorder was 
sparked by the stabbing 
deaths of three young 
girls at a Taylor Swift-
themed dance class in 
Southport on July 29.
	 In the days that fol-
lowed more than 100 
people were arrested 

and dozens of police 
injured in the biggest 
outbreak of nationwide 
public disorder in de-
cades. 

‘criminal thuggery’
	 The powder keg at-
mosphere exploded 
into full-blown may-
hem and disorder as 
mobs ran riot in major 
towns and cities across 
the UK, fuelled by base-
less social media claims 
and anonymous mes-
saging apps linked to 
Russian disinformation 
bot farms.
	 In some cases fami-

lies were forced to flee 
homes and businesses 
as protests hijacked by 
far-right thugs turned 
into full-scale riots, 
triggering “criminal 
thuggery”, ransacking 
and looting. 
	 Hundreds partici-
pated in widespread 
disorder in Liverpool, 
Manchester, Rother-
ham, Middlesbrough 
and other towns across 
the north of England in 
which police struggled 
to avoid being over-
whelmed. Many pro-
testers could be heard 
chanting “We want 

our country back” and 
“Tommy Robinson” 
the alter-ego of Ste-
phen Yaxley-Lennon, 
once the de-facto leader 
of the far-right group 
the English Defence 
League. Meanwhile 
their hero encouraged 
their actions via social 
media.... from the com-
fort of a sunbed at a re-
sort in Cyprus, where 
he is currently on holi-
day.
	  Robert Jenrick, the 
Tory leadership candi-
date and former immi-
gration minister, said: 
“You’ve got some far-

right thugs, you’ve got 
groups of yobs, morons 
joining in maraud-
ing around the streets 
smashing up shops, 
attacking communi-
ties [and] attacking a 
mosque, in one case.
	 “There is no justifi-
cation for the violence 
that we’re seeing on 
the streets and the mil-
lions of people in our 
country who feel an-
gry at mass migration 
should not be tarnished 
with the brush of what 
is happening in those 
towns and cities right 
now.”

UNITED AGAINST HATE

The PM vs the billionaire - page 3

Thousands come together to face down far-right rioters • Law enforcement delivers 
swift justice after country is racked by a week of anti-immigrant violence 

Thousands turned out in north London on Thursday to face down a demonstration planned by anti-immigrant groups
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cont. on page 5, col. 2

At least two grown men 
wept in the dock on 
Wednesday as courts 
began handing out jus-
tice for sickening riots 
sweeping the country.
	 More than 20 people 
including a boy of 14 ap-
peared in court charged 
with offences including 
violent disorder, bur-
glary, assaulting emer-
gency workers and arson.
	 It came as Home Sec-
retary Yvette Cooper 
warned thugs to expect 
police knocking on the 
door as she pledged swift 
justice and a “reckoning” 
for those involved in vio-
lence.
	 Andrew Smith, 41, of 
Sunderland, sobbed as 
he pleaded guilty to vi-
olent disorder in the city 
last Friday. At Newcastle 
Crown Court he was re-
manded in custody until 
his sentencing on Sep-
tember 2.
	 A 14-year-old, who can-
not be named, appeared 
at Liverpool Magistrates’ 
Court to admit violent 
disorder after setting off 
fireworks towards the 
public and a police car.
	 He was reported as 
saying “I’m sorry, I 
wasn’t firing them at you 
though” when he was ar-
rested by a police officer 

after giving chase.
	 At Sheffield Magis-
trates’ Court, Chris Coul-
son, 30, wiped away tears 
as he denied an offence of 
affray. 
	 He was remanded in 
custody and will go on 
trial next month. 
	 Eleven people ap-
peared in court in Liv-
erpool on Wednesday, 
seven of whom pleaded 
guilty to violent disorder 
and other crimes.
	 Adam Wharton, 28, in-
dicated a guilty plea for 
looting the city’s Spellow 
Library, which had been 
set alight during the riot.
	 Derek Drummond, 58, 
indicated guilty pleas to 
violent disorder and as-
saulting an emergency 
worker, after he allegedly 
punched a police officer 
in the face.
	 The oldest, William 
Morgan, 69, from Walton, 
admitted possessing an 
offensive weapon after 
being caught throwing 
bricks at police and hold-
ing a wooden baton.
	 Declan Geiran, 29, 
pleaded guilty to arson 
after using an “imple-
ment” to set fire to a po-
lice van.
	 In Sunderland, Josh 
Kellett, 29, who had worn 
a balaclava but was iden-

tified by “distinctive” tat-
toos, admitted throwing 
stones at police.
	 Three people also ap-
peared in court in Belfast.
	 Earlier, Ms Cooper 
warned courts were on 
“standby” to deal with 
thugs and all those in-
volved would “pay the 
price for their crimes” – 
including those inciting 
violence on social media. 	
The Home Secretary said: 
“If it’s a crime offline, it’s 
a crime online.
	 “You can’t just have the 
armchair thuggery or the 
people being able to in-
cite and organise violence 
and also not face conse-
quences for this.
	 “So we should be clear: 
there will be people who 
were thinking they were 
going on their summer 
holidays this week, and 
instead they will face a 
knock on the door from 
the police.”
	 Ms Cooper also became 
the first Government fig-
ure to use the term Islam-
ophobia to describe the 
actions of some rioters 
behind the unrest. 
	 She said: “We have cer-
tainly seen some targeted 
attacks on mosques and 
that clearly reflects Is-
lamophobia and people 
shouldn’t be targeted for 

IN A WORRYING de-
velopment for British 
democracy, it emerged 
this week that for-
eign-backed actors -  
mostly Russian - used 
bot accounts to share 
anti-immigration nar-
ratives to stoke divi-
sion and encourage this 
week’s riots.

	 Conversations be-
tween Russian trolls on 
Telegram appeared to 
speak about how they 
had infiltrated British 
far-right channels on 
the platform to organize 
anti-Muslim demonstra-
tions across the UK.
	 Other Russian lan-
guage channels spoke 

about ‘deliberately’ stir-
ring far-right channels 
to anger members, ac-
cording to  several news 
sources.
	 A Russian Telegram 
channel called ‘Old  En-
gland’ sent a screenshot 
from a far-right UK Tele-
gram channel, appearing 

their faith or for the co-
lour of their skin.
	 As more than 400 peo-
ple were arrested and 100 
charged for shocking acts 
of lawlessness, England’s 
top prosecutor said he 
would consider laying 
terrorism charges.
	 Director of Public Pros-
ecutions Stephen Par-
kinson said: “Where you 
have organised groups 
planning activity for the 
purposes of advancing 
an ideology…planning 
really, really serious dis-

ruption, then yes, we will 
consider terrorism offenc-
es.”
	 Mr Parkinson said he 
wanted online influenc-
ers abroad who stirred up 
unrest to face justice. He 
added:
	  “We have liaison pros-
ecutors spread around 
the globe who’ve got lo-
cal links with the local ju-
diciary and law enforce-
ment.”
	 To handle the expect-
ed prisoner surge, Justice 
Minister Heidi Alexander 

said 567 more jail places 
had been laid on, with 
6,000 specialist police of-
ficers at the ready.
	 She said overnight 
courts could be made to 
work because “these are 
extraordinary circum-
stances and we need to be 
delivering swift justice”.
	 The minister warned: 
“We will make sure any-
one who is given a custo-
dial sentence as a result 
of the riots and disorder, 
there will be a prison 
place waiting for them.”

Hard men turn soft when 
faced with stiff jail terms

n Courts work 24-hour shifts to jail riot ringleaders

Liam Ryan, 28, (left) from Bradford, West Yorkshire, wept as he entered a guilty 
plea following disturbances in Piccadilly Gardens in the city centre on Saturday, 

while Liam Powell (right) earned a 12-month suspended sentence

Amid a flurry of fake news stories, shadowy 
Russian bots stoked much of the disorder 

TELEGRAM: Conversations on the 
popular messaging app appear to link 

Russian channels to the UK riots
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cont. on page 4, col. 1

Elon Musk has clashed 
with Keir Starmer on X, 
accusing the Prime Min-
ister of discriminatory 
“two-tiered” policing as 
authorities scramble to 
clamp down on violent 
far-right riots against 
Muslims and immi-
grants that have rocked 
the country for a week.
	 The posts came after 10 
Downing Street on Mon-
day criticised earlier com-
ments by the billionaire 
and technology entrepre-
neur on his X platform, 
saying that Musk “does 
not speak for Britain”.
	 On Sunday, Musk 
tweeted that “civil war is 
inevitable,” in the UK, in 
response to a post claim-
ing that “open borders 
and migration” had led 
to the protests.

‘no justification’
	 The anti-migration nar-
rative that is being spread 
on social channels has 
been blamed for sparking 
the disorder in the first 
place, after misinforma-
tion spread online that a 
17-year-old suspect who 
killed three girls in a mass 
stabbing in Southport 
was a Muslim immigrant. 
That claim has since been 
debunked, as the suspect 
is confirmed to have been 
born in the UK.
	 The UK government 
condemned the post on 
Monday.
	 “There’s no justifica-
tion for comments like 
that,” a spokesperson for 
Starmer told reporters. 
“What we’ve seen in this 
country is organized, vi-
olent thuggery that has 
no place, either on our 
streets or online. We’re 
talking about a minority 
of thugs that do not speak 
for Britain … I think you 
can tell from that that the 
prime minister does not 
share those sentiments.”
	 The billionaire has 
since Monday retweet-
ed or commented under 
posts attacking UK au-
thorities for arresting and 
charging suspects arrest-

ed for taking part in the 
riots.
	 In one response to a 
post that claimed that an 
“armed Muslim” patrol 
group had attacked ci-
vilians and a news net-
work crew, Musk directly 
tweeted at Prime Minister 
Starmer, asking: “Why 
aren’t all communities 
protected?”
	 Musk has also tweet-
ed in support of those 
attacking officials for ar-
resting people believed 
to have posted offensive 
comments online, es-
pousing a “free speech 
absolutist” stance he has 
long pushed. He post-
ed a meme of a cartoon 
character strapped to 
an electrocution chair 
and likened the scene to 
the punishment people 
would face for posting 
their views online in the 
UK by 2030.
	 “Is this Britain or the 
Soviet Union?” he asked 
in yet another tweet.

‘very thin line’
	 Musk’s claims were dis-
missed by Lee McGowan, 
a professor studying far-
right groups at Belfast’s 
Queen’s University who 
said: “Musk and others 
would claim the right 
of free speech and for 
people to say what they 
want, but there is a very 
thin line here.... “These 
influencers are channel-
ling hate. In Belfast, we 
have seen some shops 
attacked even where the 
owners – who are paying 
taxes and contributing to 
society – and are legally 
entitled to be here, have 
had their premises at-
tacked and burnt out.”
	 Musk further 
tweeted the hashtag 
#TwoTierKeir, referenc-
ing controversial theories 
being spread that claim 
authorities are cracking 
down more severely on 
the protesting groups 
than on minorities.
	 London Met Police 
Commissioner Sir Mark 
Rowley told Sky News 

A WEALTHY British 
woman accused of being 
first to spread the fake ru-
mours about the South-
port killer which sparked 
nationwide riots  has 
been arrested.
	 Racist riots spread 
across the country after 
misinformation spread 
on  social media  claiming 
the fatal stabbing was car-
ried out by Ali Al-Shakati, 
believed to be a fictitious 
name, a  Muslim  aslyum 
seeker who was on an 
MI6 watchlist.
	 Bonnie Spofforth, a 
mother-of-three and the 
managing director of a 
clothing company, been 
arrested on suspicion of 
publishing written mate-
rial to stir up racial hatred, 
and false communication. 
She remains in police cus-
tody.
	 Chief Superintendent 
Alison Ross said: ‘We 
have all seen  the violent 
disorder that has taken 
place across the UK over 
the past week, much of 
which has been fuelled by 
malicious and inaccurate 
communications online.
	 ‘It’s a stark reminder of 
the dangers of posting in-
formation on social media 
platforms without check-
ing the accuracy.
	 Spofforth, 55, posted 
the false claim at 4.49pm 
on Monday, July 29, the 
day of the attack, saying: 
‘Ali Al-Shakati was the 
suspect, he was an asy-
lum seeker who came to 
the UK by boat last year 
and was on an MI6 watch 
list. If this is true, then 
all hell is about to break 
loose.’
	 The businesswoman, 
who lives in a £1.5mil-
lion farmhouse in 
Cheshire, denied she had 
made up the story, tell-
ing reporters she ‘first 
received this information 
from somebody in South-
port’.
	 ‘I’m mortified that I’m 
being accused of this. I 
did not make it up’, she 
said.

on Wednesday that the 
claim was “complete non-
sense”.
	 “We have commenta-
tors from either end of 
the political spectrum 

who like to throw accusa-
tions of bias at the police 
because we stand in the 
middle, we operate inde-
pendently under the law 
without fear or favour…

		  “The serious 
voices who echo those 
are of more concern to me 
because the risk is … they 
legitimise the violence 

Arrest for 
Southport 

killer rumor 
monger

Musk and Starmer clash over ‘two-tier’ policing
“Civil War is inevitable” claims the erratic billionaire, alleging British police crack 

down harder on far-right demonstrators than on militant Islamists

Musk also claimed Starmer planned to send rioters to camps on the Falkland Islands
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Shamima Begum’s law-
yers could take her case 
to the European Court 
of Human Rights.
	 The 24-year-old was 
this week denied the 
chance to challenge the 
removal of her British 
citizenship at the Su-
preme Court.
	 Last year, she lost 
her  appeal against the 
decision on national se-
curity grounds.
	 It was made after she 
was found in a Syrian 
refugee camp having 
travelled to so-called 
Islamic State-controlled 
territory in 2015.
	 On Monday justices 
at the UK’s highest 
court said Ms Begum 
could not appeal again 
after she lost a Court of 
Appeal bid in February.
	 Following the ruling, 
her lawyers said they 
“will take every possi-
ble legal step” on her 
behalf, including a peti-
tion to Strasbourg.
	 “The UK courts have 
for five years offered no 
exit route despite the 
critical humanitarian 
crisis in the camps.
	 “Instead the Supreme 
Court has today left 
resolution to another 
court, this time in Stras-
bourg.”

Robert Jenrick is the 
frontrunner in the race 
for the Tory leadership, 
polling shows.
	 The former immigra-
tion minister and stan-
dard-bearer for the Tory 
Right is ahead on 24.2%, 
a survey of 468 party 
members suggests.
	 To tackle the small 
boats crisis, he backs 
leaving the European 
Convention on Human 
Rights – something 86% 
of those polled agree 
with.
	 Shadow housing secre-
tary Kemi Badenoch and 
former home secretary 
Dame Priti Patel – both 
prominent figures on the 
Right – are close behind 
him on 23.4% and 21% 
respectively.
	 Shadow home secre-
tary James Cleverly is 
fourth with 4.9%, fol-
lowed by shadow secu-
rity minister Tom Tu-
gendhat on 3.4% while 
shadow work and pen-
sions secretary Mel Stride 
has 1.9%.
	 However, just over one 
in five said they were 
undecided in the survey 
carried out from July 31 
to August 5.
	 Mark Littlewood, di-
rector of Popular Con-
servatism, a Right-wing 
Tory faction which car-
ried out the research, 
said: “With a significant 

BRITONS are being 
urged to leave Lebanon 
urgently amid deepen-
ing tensions in the re-
gion.
	 UK forces have been 
deployed in the area to 
help with any evacu-
ations as tensions rise 
– with worries the “sit-
uation could deteriorate 
rapidly”.

‘tensions are high’
	 Consular experts were 
drafted in to help with 
plans as the RAF put 
transport helicopters on 
standby. Landing ship 
RFA Cardigan Bay and 
destroyer HMS Duncan 

are already in the Medi-
terranean to support hu-
manitarian efforts.
	 Foreign Secretary Da-
vid Lammy said: “Ten-
sions are high, and the 
situation could deterio-
rate rapidly. While we 
are working round the 
clock to strengthen our 
consular presence in 
Lebanon, my message to 
British nationals there is 
clear – leave now. 
	 “A widening of this 
conflict is in nobody’s in-
terest – the consequenc-
es could be catastrophic. 
That’s why we continue 
to call for de-escalation 
and a diplomatic solu-

tion.” 
	 Western diplomats are 
trying frantically to calm 
escalating tensions af-
ter the killing of Hamas 
political leader Ismail 
Haniyeh in Tehran by Is-
rael.

retaliation
	 The US has since 
urged Israel to seize the 
chance for a ceasefire. 
The killing of Haniyeh 
plus Israel’s assassina-
tion of a Hezbollah chief 
in Lebanese capital Bei-
rut have the region hold-
ing its breath. Retaliation 
against Israel is feared 
on either front or both 

after Iran and its terrorist 
proxies vowed to act.
	 Israel’s PM Benjamin 
Netanyahu had said re-
taliation would follow 
after a Hezbollah rocket 
strike in the Israel-oc-
cupied Golan Heights 
killed 12 children on July 
27.
	 With the potential 
for exits from Lebanon 
being limited or closed 
amid little warning if 
conflict widens, British 
citizens are being urged 
to go while commercial 
options remain avail-
able. 
	 Already several air-
lines have suspended, 

rescheduled or cancelled 
flights to and from Bei-
rut. Elsewhere, a Pales-
tinian knifeman killed 
two elderly civilians and 
wounded two more in a 
Tel Aviv suburb.
	 In the wake of that 
rampage, which ended 
when the attacker was 
shot dead by police, Is-
raeli strikes killed 18 
people in Gaza.
	 Hamas, which is at 
war with Israel in the 
enclave, called the stab-
bings a “natural re-
sponse” to Israeli attacks 
on Palestinians and 
to the assassination of 
Haniyeh last week.	

number still undecided, 
everything is to play for.
	 “It is imperative that 
Conservative MPs offer 
the membership a proper 
choice in the last two can-
didates from whom the 
members will choose.”

‘root and branch reform’
The poll also found an 
overwhelming 90% either 
strongly agree or agree 
that the Conservative 
Party needs to become 
more democratic, with a 
greater role for members 
in choosing leaders, poli-
cies and candidates.
	 More than three-quar-
ters said Rishi Sunak’s 
successor should wel-
come Reform UK MPs, 
candidates and members 
into the Tory fold.
	 Just over four in five 

said the Tories should fo-
cus on winning over the 
four million voters who 
backed Nigel Farage’s 
party at the general elec-
tion.
	 Mr Littlewood added: 
“Members want a return 
to popular Conservative 
policies. They want root-
and-branch reform of 
the party’s structures to 
make it more democratic 
and they want the wider 
Conservative family to 
unite to avoid a future 
defeat similar to July’s 
election defeat.
	 “Whoever becomes 
leader will have to ad-
dress those concerns – 
concerns which we hear 
from members every day. 
If they do, the party will 
have a route back into 
government.”

	 It follows a declaration 
by Dame Priti that she is 
the candidate to repair 
the party after its crush-
ing defeat.
	 She told GB News: 
“Having been a member 
for 30 years, I’ve been 
consistent in my views, 
my beliefs, my values.
	 “I am not a politician 
that’s had to go on a jour-
ney to rediscover my-
self or my views. People 
know what they get with 
me.”
	 Denying Conservatism 
has “failed”, she added: 
“We need to come togeth-
er and stand up for who 
we are and demonstrate 
to the British people our 
views are their views and 
actually we can represent 
the hard-working silent 
majority of our country.”

that the officers I’m send-
ing (out) today, will face 
on the streets … they are 
putting them at risk.”
	 And on Thursday 
Musk was at it again, 
sharing fake claims that 
convicted rioters would 
be sent to detention 
camps in the Falklands.
	 Musk deleted his post 
after about 30 minutes 
but not before it had gar-
nered nearly two million 
views. 
	 In it, Musk shared 
the image posted by the 
co-leader of the far-right 
group Britain First, Ash-
lea Simon, which she 
captioned with, “we’re 
all being deported to the 
Falklands”.
	 The fake piece, pur-
portedly written by a se-
nior news reporter for the 
Telegraph and mocked 
up in the newspaper’s 
style, said camps in the 
Falklands “would be 
used to detain prisoners 
from the ongoing riots as 
the British prison system 
is already at capacity”.
	 The Telegraph said 
on Thursday it had nev-
er published the article 
in question. In a state-
ment, a spokesperson 
for the Telegraph Media 
Group  said: “This is a 
fabricated headline for an 
article that does not exist. 
We notified relevant plat-
forms and requested that 
the post be taken down.”
	 Musk, who is the bil-
lionaire co-founder of 
SpaceX and chief exec-
utive of Tesla, bought 
Twitter in 2022 for $44bn. 
He rebranded it as X last 
year. There has been a 
string of controversies 
about the direction the 
platform has taken under 
his leadership, including 
accusations that he is not 
serious enough about re-
moving harmful content.
	 The Royal National 
Orthopaedic Hospital 
NHS trust said in a post 
on Thursday that it was 
closing its account on X 
after 13 years because the 
platform is “no longer 
consistent with our Trust 
values”. 

MUSK:
cont. from page 3

Jenrick emerges as man to beat

Jenrick is seen as the standard bearer for the party’s right wing

Begum may 
take UK to 
ECHR over 
citizenship

Brits urged: Get out of Lebanon now
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Mel Stride has become 
the first Tory leader-
ship candidate to rule 
out any deal with Nigel 
Farage or the Reform 
Party. 
	 After the first day of 
violent disorders across 
Britain last week, Mr 
Farage questioned 
whether the truth about 
the Southport stabbings 
was “being withheld 
from us”, adding “I 
don’t know the answer 
to that, but I think it is a 
fair and legitimate ques-
tion”. 
	 Mr Stride said: “In 
making these state-
ments he has linked the 
violence to community 
division resulting from 
immigration. He is irre-
sponsible and wrong to 
fuel the fires of rumour 
and in doing so, can 
only further damage so-
cial cohesion.”
	 The MP for Central 
Devon added: “As lead-
er I will reunite and re-
build trust in the Con-
servative Party. Some 
have suggested that a 
deal should be done 
with Mr  Farage as part 
of that process.
	 “That will not happen 
under my leadership.”

to show messages read-
ing ‘from  Russia  with 
love’ and ‘we support 
you’.
	 An investigation by 
leading British news out-
let Metro.co.uk  into the 
organising tactics of the 
far-right had revealed a 
sophisticated  network 
of influencers working 
to seed anti-Muslim and 
Islamophobic narratives, 
spread misinforma-
tion and stage violent 
demonstrations in some 
of the UK’s most vulner-
able communities.

‘misinformation’
	 Following the riot 
on July 30, more ads 
calling for anti-Islam 
demonstrations began 
to spread on local group 
chats, resulting in more 
than a hundred demon-
strations erupting across 
the country.
	 Technology Minister 
Peter Kyle said the Gov-
ernment had “seen bot 
activity online, much of 
which may well be am-
plified by foreign state 
actors amplifying some 
of the disinformation 
and misinformation that 
we’ve seen.
	 “Anyone who stokes 
this violence, whether 
on the internet or in per-
son, can be prosecuted 
and face prison.”
	 Kyle also met with 
tech firms to urge them 
to do more to clamp 

down on inflammatory 
and far-right content on-
line and to ensure they 
are not promoting in-
flammatory content.
	 Following his talks, 
he said: “The terrible 
violence we have wit-
nessed in recent days is 
disgraceful.
“I have been clear it is 
unacceptable that peo-
ple are using social me-
dia to cause damage, 
distress and destruction 
in our communities.
	 “Today I had useful 
meetings with Tiktok, 
Meta, Google and X, to 
make clear their respon-
sibility to continue to 
work with us to stop the 
spread of hateful mis-
information and incite-
ment.
	 “There is a significant 
amount of content cir-
culating that platforms 
need to be dealing with 
at pace.
	 Swift action by the 
government, law en-
forcement and 24-hour 
session courts during 
the week has resulted in 
stiff sentences for ring-
leaders of the violence, 
which has caused ten-
sions to go off the boil by 
the weekend, although 
the mood remained 
tense as the weekend 
approached.
	 With 6,000 riot officers 
mobilized by midweek, 
Prime Minister  Keir 
Starmer was able to de-
liver on his pledge that 
troublemakers be hand-
ed ‘substantive’ prison 
sentences ‘before the 
end of this week’.

Russia:
cont. from page two

Stride: No 
deal With 
Reform 
Party on 
my watch

Katie Price has been ar-
rested at Heathrow Air-
port for failing to attend 
court and taken into po-
lice custody.
	 An arrest warrant was 
issued for the former 
glamour model on 30 July 
after she failed to attend a 
court hearing relating to 
her bankruptcies.
	 The Metropolitan Po-
lice said a 46-year-old 
woman was arrested 
at Heathrow Airport at 

19:45 BST.
Ms Price will appear be-
fore a judge at the Royal 
Courts of Justice on Fri-
day.
	 Ms Price was detained 
after returning to the UK. 
Photos have emerged 
showing her with ban-
dages around her face, 
near police vans at the air-
port.
	 A judge at a previous 
hearing said she risked 
arrest if she did not attend 

further court dates, add-
ing that evidence must be 
provided if she could not 
appear.
	 Ms Price was declared 
bankrupt in November 
2019 and again in March 
this year.
	 At a hearing in Febru-
ary, she was ordered to 
pay 40% of her monthly 
income from the website 
OnlyFans for the next 
three years, in relation to 
her first bankruptcy.

Katie Price boobs again
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ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the matter of In the Matter of the 
Petition of Debora Chadorehi, an 
adult over the age of 18 years, on 

behalf of Alexa Marcella Hakimi, a 
minor under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed 

is under 18 years of age: Alexa 
Marcella Hakimi. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have the 

name changed from Alexa Marcella 
Hakimi to Alexa Hakimi

​Date: 08/16/2024. Time: 8:30am 
Dept. K

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: June 25, 2024.
Lawrence H Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SMCP00328
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024 and 08/10/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
400 Civic Center Plaza

Pomona CA 91766

In the matter of In the Matter of 
the Petition of Elizabeth Reyes, 

an adult over the age of 18 years, 
on behalf of Bibibella Genesis 

Soberanes, a minor under the age 
of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is under 18 years of age: 
Bibibella Genesis Soberanes. 

And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 

clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said peti-

tioner(s) desire to have the name 
changed from Bibibella Genesis 
Soberanes to Bibibella Genesis 

Windfield

​Date: 08/30/2024. Time: 10:00am 
Dept. K 4th Floor

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 

appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: June 27, 2024.
Peter A. Hernandez, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24PSCP00312
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024 and 08/10/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
300 East Walnut Street

Pasadena CA 91101

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Dulce Atenas Romero Lopez, 
an adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 09/06/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. P 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Dulce 
Atenas Romero Lopez. And 

a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Dulce Atenas Romero Lo-
pez to Dulce Atenas Romero 

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: June 15, 2024.
Robin Miller Sloane
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00362
Published: 07/20/2024, 
07/27/2024, 08/03/2024 and 
08/10/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition of Mol-
ly Beth Nickerson, an adult over 

the age of 18 years.

​Date: 08/30/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. M Room 350 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Molly 
Beth Nickerson. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 

have their name changed from 
Molly Beth Nickerson to Molly 

Beth Nickerson-Sikonia

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 12, 2024.
Gary Y Tanaka
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRCP00275
Published: 07/20/2024, 
07/27/2024, 08/03/2024 and 
08/10/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the matter of In the Matter of 
the Petition of Ryan Nielson and 

Sharon Clodfelter, adults over the 
age of 18 years, on behalf of Arch 
Augustus Clodfelter Nielson, a 
minor under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is under 18 years of age: Arch Au-
gustus Clodfelter Nielson. And a 
petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have the name changed 
from Arch Augustus Clodfelter 
Nielson to Silas Arch Clodfelter 
Nielson

​Date: 09/13/2024. Time: 8:30am 
Dept. K

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 15, 2024.
Lawrence H Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SMCP00371
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024 and 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024120748. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Jelly Cube 
Shop, 5407 Colfax Ave Apt. 127, 
North Hollywood CA 91601. County: 
Los Angeles. Joshua Roth, 5407 Col-
fax Ave Apt. 127, North Hollywood CA 
91601. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Joshua Roth, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/05/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/13/2024, 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024 
and 08/03/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024130271. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: H&T Gift 
Shop, 951 Sun Mun Way, Los Ange-
les CA 90012. County: Los Angeles. 
Shijie Shang, 951 Sun Mun Way, Los 
Angeles CA 90012. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Shijie Shang, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/18/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024 
and 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024133955. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Biohealth 
Nutrition; Legacy Supps, Legacy 
Nutrition, Legacy Fresh, Simply Raw, 
949 N Cataract Ave Building D, San 
Dimas CA 91773. County: Los An-
geles. Bio Core Brands, 949 N Cat-
aract Ave Building D, San Dimas CA 
91773. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Nicholas Vasiliou, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/24/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024 
and 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024136506. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: SoCal Fire-
front Solutions & Brush Clearance, 
3461 Redwood Ave. Los Angeles CA 
90066. County: Los Angeles. Pepper 
Mitigation Co. Inc., 3461 Redwood 
Ave. Los Angeles CA 90066. State 

of incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Shaun William Pep-
per, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/26/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024 and 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024138953. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: PHD’s Free-
lance Services, 13157 Mindanao Way 
Suite 781, Marina del Rey CA 90292. 
County: Los Angeles. Donald Dar-
ryl Biggles, 14611 1/2 Avis Avenue, 
Lawndale CA 90260. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
08/2017. Signed: Donald Darryl Big-
gles, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 06/28/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024 and 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024143115. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Rapid 
Connections, 14650 Parthenia St 
Spc F12, Panorama City CA 91402. 
County: Los Angeles. Christopher 
Mario De Los Santos, 36200 Para-
dise Ranch Rd Unit 43, Castaic CA 
91384. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Christopher Mario De Los 
Santos, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/05/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024 and 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024143626. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Flamingo 
Inn Motel; Ra-Ja Investment Part-
ners, Raja Investment Ptrs LLC, 5374 
Atlantic Ave, Long Beach CA 90805. 
County: Los Angeles. Yogesh Patel, 
5374 Atlantic Ave, Long Beach CA 
90805; Indravadan Patel, 5374 Atlan-
tic Ave, Long Beach CA 90805. This 
business is conducted by: a general 
partnership. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 02/1999. Signed: 

Yogesh Patel, general partner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/08/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024 
and 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024144940. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: JOAT; 
JOAT, LLC, 25876 The Old Road 
#318, Stevenson Ranch CA 91381. 
County: Los Angeles. Jack Of All Tech 
LLC, 9564 Topanga Canyon Blvd, 
Chatsworth CA 91311. State of orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 06/2019. Signed: Manuel 
Zamudio, member. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 07/09/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 07/20/2024, 
07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024145146. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ironstone 
Coach, 3746 Foothill Blvd, Glendale 
CA 91214. County: Los Angeles. 
Michael Brown, 3746 Foothill Blvd, 
Glendale CA 91214. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2024. Signed: Michael Brown, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/09/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024145730. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: E&G Clean-
ing Services, 1014 Sentinel Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90063. County: Los An-
geles. Erika Garcia Zamarripa, 1014 
Sentinel Ave, Los Angeles CA 90063. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2024. Signed: 
Erika Garcia Zamarripa, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/09/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
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Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024145828. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Blankspac-
es Venice, 606 Venice Blvd, Los 
Angeles CA 90291. County: Los An-
geles. Blankspaces Experience, LLC, 
309 Pine Ave, Long Beach CA 90802. 
State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Jerome Chang, managing 
member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/10/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024146560. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Cosmos Prospecting, 43824 20th 
St W. #2543, Lancaster CA 93539. 
County: Los Angeles. David Des 
Autels, 43824 20th St W. #2543, 
Lancaster CA 93539. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
07/2024. Signed: David Des Autels, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/10/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024147171. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Soleffect, 
10125 Freeman Ave, Santa Fe 
Springs CA 90670. County: Los An-
geles. Foralux, LLC, 10125 Freeman 
Ave, Santa Fe Springs CA 90670. 
State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Ron Bivas, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/11/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 

et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024147404. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Rinconci-
to Colombiano, 1614 1/2 W. 6th St, 
Los Angeles CA 90017. County: Los 
Angeles. Maria Jacqueline Orjuela 
Buitrago, 7125 De Longpre Ave Apt 
210, Los Angeles CA 90046. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 07/2024. Signed: Maria 
Jacqueline Orjuela Buitrago, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 07/11/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024147464. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
SMV Global, 9018 Balboa Blvd #315, 
Northridge CA 91325. County: Los 
Angeles. Ani Zakaryan, 16052 Dear-
born St, North Hills CA 91343. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Ani Zakaryan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/11/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024147741. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: All Zen 
Consulting; All Zen, 1012 E Jay St, 
Carson CA 90745. County: Los Ange-
les. AI#ON: 202461513037. All Zen 
Inspections LLC, 1012 E Jay St, Car-
son CA 90745. State of organization: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Clint Blatchford, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/11/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024148143. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lepiz Auto 
Detail, 5600 Orangethorpe Ave Apt 

2407, La Palma CA 90623. County: 
Orange. Crystal Luna, 5600 Oran-
gethorpe Ave Apt 2407, La Palma CA 
90623. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Crystal Luna, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024148169. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: HSH, LLC, 
Hotel Supplies Hub, LLC, 330 N 
Brand Blvd Suite 700, Glendale CA 
91203. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
202360311286. Eagle Eye Capital, 
LLC, 330 N Brand Blvd Suite 700, 
Glendale CA 91203. State of orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Sean Kumar, 
manager. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/12/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024148246. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Body Hun-
ny, 5211 Halison St, Torrance CA 
90503. County: Los Angeles. Cohe-
sive Marketing Solutions, Inc., 5211 
Halison St, Torrance CA 90503. State 
of incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Chelsea Vegter, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/12/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024148306. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Higher Ed 
Band, 19 Pomona Ave, Long Beach 
CA 90803. County: Los Angeles. 
Monica Lounsbery, 19 Pomona Ave, 
Long Beach CA 90803. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 

07/2024. Signed: Monica Lounsbery, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/12/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024148787. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Luna Azul 
Cookie Creations, 15815 Farnham 
Ct, Canyon Country CA 91387. 
County: Los Angeles. Amanda Cue-
vas-Tarabotto, 15815 Farnham Ct, 
Canyon Country CA 91387; Andrew 
Cuevas-Tarabotto, 15815 Farnham 
Ct, Canyon Country CA 91387. This 
business is conducted by: a mar-
ried couple. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Amanda 
Cuevas-Tarabotto, wife. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/15/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024148968. Current file: 
2024143626. The following person 
has abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious business name: Raja Invest-
ment Ptrs LLC, 5374 Atlantic Ave. 
Long Beach CA 90805. Yogesh Patel, 
5374 Atlantic Ave. Long Beach CA 
90805; Indravadan Patel, 5374 Atlan-
tic Ave. Long Beach CA 90805. The 
fictitious business name referred to 
above was filed on: 07/08/2024, in the 
County of Los Angeles. This business 
is conducted by: a general partner-
ship. Signed: Yogesh Patel, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/15/2024.  Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149256. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Los Vega 
Furniture, 6418 Lankershim Blvd, 
North Hollywood CA 91606. County: 
Los Angeles. Fernando Vega, 6418 
Lankershim Blvd, North Hollywood 
CA 91606. This business is conduct-
ed by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2015. 
Signed: Fernando Vega, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/15/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 

rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149440. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: LA Dental 
Lab Specialist, 810 E Manchester 
Blvd #1, Inglewood CA 90301. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 6240884. LA 
Dental Lab Specialist Corp, 810 E 
Manchester Blvd #1, Inglewood CA 
90301. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Walter Jose Alvarado Justiniani, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/15/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149636. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Total Solu-
tions Management, 321 W. Queen 
Street Unit 12, Inglewood CA 90301. 
County: Los Angeles. Tracy Robin-
son, 321 W. Queen Street Unit 12, 
Inglewood CA 90301. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
01/2005. Signed: Tracy Robinson, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/15/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149695. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Sinical Ex-
pressions, 43919 San Francisco Ave, 
Lancaster CA 93535. County: Los 
Angeles. Aurelio Aguirre, 43919 San 
Francisco Ave, Lancaster CA 93535. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Aurelio 
Aguirre, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 07/15/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., 
B&P Code.) Published: 07/20/2024, 
07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149834. The following person(s) 

is/are doing business as: Hilary Hope; 
Hilary Hope Voice Over, Hilary Hope 
VO 14806 Otsego Street, Sherman 
Oaks CA 91403. County: Los An-
geles. Hilary Zalon, 14806 Otsego 
Street, Sherman Oaks CA 91403. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Hilary 
Zalon, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/16/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024151135. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Tres Deli-
cias, 15206 Lassalette St, La Puente 
CA 91744. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 6305781. Tres Delicias Inc, 
15206 Lassalette St, La Puente CA 
91744. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Andres Adolfo Rodriguez, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/17/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024151242. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Lena Rose 
PR, 346 Hauser Blvd #2-418, Los 
Angeles CA 90036. County: Los 
Angeles. Charlotte Silverstein, 346 
Hauser Blvd #2-418, Los Angeles CA 
90036. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 05/2018. 
Signed: Charlotte Silverstein, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 07/17/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024151837. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Event Con-
struction, 6311 Van Nuys Blvd #238, 
Van Nuys CA 91401. County: Los 
Angeles. Even Tysse, 14901 Hamlin 
St, Van Nuys CA 91411. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
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business name or names listed here-
in on: 07/2024. Signed: Even Tysse, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/18/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/20/2024, 07/27/2024, 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 

MAURICE COHEN
Case No. 24STPB07949

	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, credi-
tors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, 
of MAURICE COHEN
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE 
has been filed by Peter Cohen in 
the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that Peter Cohen be ap-
pointed as personal representative 
to administer the estate of the dece-
dent.
	 THE PETITION requests the 
decedent’s will and codicils, if any, 
be admitted to probate. The will and 
any codicils are available for exam-
ination in the file kept by the court.
	 THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will 
be held on August 15, 2024 at 8:30 
AM in Dept. No. 11 located at 111 
N. Hill St., Los Angeles, CA 90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 
in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.

Attorney for petitioner:

WANDA G COUTEE ESQ
SBN 318744

HROMADKA GAULKE &
COUTEE LLP

11661 SAN VICENTE BLVD
STE 410

LOS ANGELES CA 90049-5112
CN108709 COHEN Jul 27, Aug 

3,10, 2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N Hill Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Guylynn Xana Gia, an adult over 

the age of 18 years.

​Date: 09/09/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. 9 Room 9 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Guylynn 

Xana Gia. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Guylynn Xana Gia to 
Gia Castellano Argenta

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 11, 2024.
Elaine Lu
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02199
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

280 W Compton Blvd
Compton CA 90220

In the matter of In the Matter of 
the Petition of Mirtala Caal, an 

adult over the age of 18 years, on 
behalf of Isis Betzabeth Gonzalez 
Caal, a minor under the age of 18 

years.

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is under 18 years of age: 
Isis Betzabeth Gonzalez Caal. 

And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the 

clerk of this Court, and it appearing 
from said petition that said peti-

tioner(s) desire to have the name 
changed from 

Isis Betzabeth Gonzalez Caal to 
Irene Alina Gonzalez Caal

​Date: 10/01/2024. Time: 8:30am 
Dept. A Room 904

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 

court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 12, 2024.
Michael Shultz
Judge of the Superior Court
24CMCP00103
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

6230 Sylmar Ave
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition of
 Luz S Miguel Garzon, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 08/23/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. W, Room 610 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: 
Luz S Miguel Garzon. And a pe-
tition for change of names having 
been duly filed with the clerk of 

this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 

from Luz S Miguel Garzon to 
Lus Mirakyan

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 9, 2024
Virginia Keeny
Judge of the Superior Court
24VECP00297
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
400 Civic Center Plaza

Pomona CA 91766

In the matter of In the Matter of 
the Petition of Fengqin Meng and 
Hai Lin, adults over the age of 18 
years, on behalf of Zixuan Lin, a 
minor under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is under 18 years of age: Isis Zix-
uan Lin. And a petition for change 

of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 

said petitioner(s) desire to have the 
name changed from Zixuan Lin to 

Milly Zixuan Lin

​Date: 09/13/2024. Time: 9:00am 
Dept. L

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the0 objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 9, 2024.
Bryant Y. Yang
Judge of the Superior Court
24PSCP00328
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Adi-Tamara Roslynn Cakobau 
Browne, an adult over the age of 

18 years.

​Date: 09/6/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept M 

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 

18 years of age: 
Adi-Tamara Roslynn Cakobau 

Browne. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 

said petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from Adi-Tamara 
Roslynn Cakobau Browne to 

Tamara Browne

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 15, 2024
Gary Y Tanaka
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRCP00280
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024136167. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Arleta His-
panic Foursquare Church, Cosecha 
De Dios, 9165 Woodman Ave, Ar-
leta CA 91331. County: Los Ange-
les. AI#ON: 0126840. International 
Church Of The Foursquare Gospel, 
1132 Glendale Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90026. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/1998. 
Signed: Jarrod D. Kula, CFO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
06/25/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024136406. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Hollywood 
House of Beauty, 7547 1/2 Santa 
Monica Blvd, West Hollywood CA 
90046. County: Los Angeles. Olga 
Tiutiun, 1241 N Flores St Apt 7, West 
Hollywood CA 90069. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2024. Signed: Olga Tiutiun, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 06/26/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024139988. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Twinkle 
Toys And More LLC, 931 W Norberry 
St, Lancaster CA 93534. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 2024613182828. 
Twinkle Toys And More LLC, 931 W 
Norberry St, Lancaster CA 93534. 
State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Evelyn Delmy Vasquez-Al-
varez, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/01/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 

Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024142329. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Juanita’s Beauty And Barber Salon, 
10249 Sepulveda Blvd, Mission Hills 
CA 91345. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: C6274423. Juanita’s Beauty 
And Barber Salon, Inc, 10249 Sep-
ulveda Blvd, Mission Hills CA 91345. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Juanita De 
Los Santos Ramirez Velasco, Pres-
ident. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/03/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024142816. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Queen of 
The Nile Beauty Salon, 3915 River-
side Dr, Burbank CA 91505. County: 
Los Angeles. Kasie Weinandt LLC, 
7200 Franklin Ae Apt 221, Los Ange-
les CA 90046. State of organization: 
California. This business is conduct-
ed by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2024. Signed: Kasie Weinandt, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/05/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024145065. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: LMC Mul-
tiservices, 7034 Newell St Apt B, 
Huntington Park CA 90255. County: 
Los Angeles. Lina Maria Castaneda 
Catano, 7034 Newell St Apt B, Hun-
tington Park CA 90255. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2024. Signed: Lina Maria Casta-
neda Catano, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/09/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
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2024145635. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: CJ Solution, 
525 Saint Albans Road, San Gabriel 
CA 91775. County: Los Angeles. Jie 
Chen, 525 Saint Albans Road, San 
Gabriel CA 91775. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Jie Chen, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/09/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024147767. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: 100X, 4001 
N Mission Rd Apt A-31, Los Ange-
les CA 90032. County: Los Angeles. 
Cesar I Peralta Macias, 4001 N Mis-
sion Rd Apt A-31, Los Angeles CA 
90032. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Cesar I Peralta Macias, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149020. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Market Vic-
tor, 131 S Utah Street, Los Angeles 
CA 90033. County: Los Angeles. Ab-
dul Faytrouni, 131 S Utah Street, Los 
Angeles CA 90033. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Abdul Faytrouni, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/15/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149066. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Sage Col-
lege Mentoring, 4220 Via Alondra, 
Palos Verdes Estates, CA 90274. 
County: Los Angeles. Jimmy Aguilar, 
3047 Live Oak St, Huntington Park 
CA 90255. Alexandra Hazard, 4220 
Via Alondra, Palos Verdes Estates, 
CA 90274. This business is conduct-
ed by: a general partnership. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 

business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Alexandra Hazard, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/15/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149108. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: D-Elegance 
Entertainment & Security LLC; D-El-
egance Solutions, 5021 Atlantic Ave. 
#55, Long Beach CA 90805. County: 
Los Angeles. D-Elegance Entertain-
ment & Security LLC, 5021 Atlantic 
Ave 55, Long Beach CA 90805. 
State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 01/2018. 
Signed: Dominick Wells, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/15/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024149142. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Monarquia Investment Enterprises; 
Galicia Real Estate, 6531 Fountain 
Ave, Los Angeles CA 90028. County: 
Los Angeles. Monarquia Investment 
Enterprises LLC, 6531 Fountain Ave, 
Los Angeles CA 90002, Los Angeles 
CA 90028. State of organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Ignacio Villa Perez, manag-
ing member. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/15/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149608. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Pekingese 
Podcasting, 9461 Charleville Blvd, 
Beverly Hills CA 90212. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 3801128. Peking-
ese Post Inc., 9461 Charleville Blvd, 
Beverly Hills CA 90212. State of in-
corporation: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 

on: 07/2024. Signed: Ashley Hydrick, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/15/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024149743. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Hindsight Growth, 5665 W. Wilshire 
Blvd #1443, Los Angeles CA 90036. 
County: Los Angeles. David Wil-
liams, 6035 South Croft Avenue, Los 
Angeles CA 90056. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2024. Signed: David Williams, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/16/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024149900. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Human-
root, 1240 S Golden West Ave Ste 
B, Arcadia CA 91007. County: Los 
Angeles. Ginseng Store, Inc, 1240 S 
Golden West Ave Ste B, Arcadia CA 
91007. State of incorporation: Califor-
nia. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Bonnie 
Hui, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/16/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024150682. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Traci Time 
Psychotherapy, 9250 Reseda Blvd 
#668, Northridge CA 91324. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Traci Time, 9250 
Reseda Blvd #668, Northridge CA 
91324. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2018. 
Signed: Traci Time, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/17/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 

Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024151005. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Make Me-
dia Studios; Derek May Photogra-
phy, Make Media Studios LLC, 3861 
Hackett Ave, Long Beach CA 90808. 
County: Los Angeles. Make Media 
Studios LLC, 3861 Hackett Ave, Long 
Beach CA 90808. State of organiza-
tion: California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 06/2022. Signed: Derek May, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/17/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024151574. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Kavik, 9018 
Balboa Blvd #315, Northridge CA 
91325. County: Los Angeles. Karmel-
la Vardanyan, 16052 Dearborn St, 
North Hills CA 91343. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Karmella Vardanyan, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/18/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024151696. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Family Mov-
ie Events, 21931 Burbank Blvd 6, 
Woodland Hills CA 91367. County: 
Los Angeles. CinemaCloudWorks 
Incorporated, 21931 Burbank Blvd 
6, Woodland Hills CA 91367-6456. 
State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 
Harmon Kaslow, President. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/18/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 

federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024152012. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Tomas 
Johnson, 400 S La Brea Ave 104, In-
glewood CA 90301. County: Los An-
geles. AI#ON: 4273892. NHC Con-
sulting Inc, 400 S La Brea Ave 104, 
Inglewood CA 90301. State of incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
01/2017. Signed: Tomas Johnson, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/18/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024152881. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Thai Kreation, 408 S Santa Anita Ave 
Unit 11, Arcadia CA 91006. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 6271228. 
Chokchai-Tewa, 408 S Santa Ani-
ta Ave Unit 11, Arcadia CA 91006. 
State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Kitikorn 
Chokchaiarcha, Treasurer. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/19/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024152910. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Okamochi, 
1521 W Rosecrans Ave, Gardena CA 
90249. County: Los Angeles. ANNJ 
LLC, 1521 W Rosecrans Ave, Garde-
na CA 90249. State of organization: 
California. This business is conduct-
ed by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Yurie Amano, managing 
member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/19/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-

ment: 2024152998. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Cox Properties, 4040 W. Washington 
Blvd #1234, Los Angeles CA 90019. 
County: Los Angeles. Julie Cox, 4040 
W. Washington Blvd #1234, Los 
Angeles CA 90019; Chantel Nishi-
ka Cox, 10736 Jefferson Blvd 1049, 
Culver City CA 90230; Stephanie 
Rene Cox, 2324 4th Ave. 104, Los 
Angeles CA 90018. This business is 
conducted by: a general partnership. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: n/a. Signed: Julie Cox, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/19/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024153058. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: K Village 
Apts, 135 E 33rd 2nd Floor, Los An-
geles CA 90011. County: Los Ange-
les. Sung Yong Kang, 5918 Ocean 
Terrace Drive, Rancho Palos Verdes 
CA 90275. State of organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
07/2024. Signed: Sung Young Kang, 
member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/19/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024153542. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Doorstep Dog-Spaw, 1643 206th Apt 
2, Torrance CA 90501. County: Los 
Angeles. Annie Vongnaphone, 1643 
206th Apt 2, Torrance CA 90501. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2024. Signed: Annie Vongna-
phone, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/22/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024153551. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Noorbakhsh 
Reynolds Law, 9350 Wilshire Blvd. 
Suite 203, Beverly Hills CA 90212. 
County: Los Angeles. Farrah Faranak 

Legal Notices
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Local News

Need a little reset?

Join us in our cozy Join us in our cozy 
Tea Room for Tea Room for 
Afternoon Tea  Afternoon Tea  
Wed-Sat 11.30-4pmWed-Sat 11.30-4pm

Enjoy a selection of sandwiches, pastries, 
sausage rolls and a glass of 

bubbly! Private parties available.

Ye Olde Kings Head • 116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica • 310.451.1402

Why you need dental insurance in retirement.

Medicare doesn’t pay for dental care.1

As good as Medicare is, it was never meant to cover 
everything. If you want protection, you need to purchase 
individual insurance.

Early detection can prevent small 
problems from becoming expensive ones.
The best way to avoid large dental bills is preventive 
care. Experts recommend checkups twice a year. 

Previous dental work can wear out.
Your odds of having a dental problem only go up as you age.2

Treatment is expensive — especially the 
services people over 50 often need.
Unexpected bills, like $190 for a filling, or $1,213 for a crown3

can be a real burden, especially if you’re on a fixed income.

Call for a FREE Information Kit!

1-855-537-2305
Dental50Plus.health/british
Product/features not available in all states. Contact us for complete details about this insurance solicitation. To fi nd a network provider, 
go to physiciansmutual.com/fi nd-dentist. This specifi c offer not available in CO, LA, NV, NY – call 1-800-969-4781 or respond for a similar 
offer in your state. Certifi cate C254/B465, C250A/B438 (ID: C254ID; PA: C254PA); Insurance Policy P154/B469, P150/B439 (GA: P154GA; NY: 
P154NY; OK: P154OK; TN: P154TN).
6247-0324

DENTAL Insurance
from Physicians Mutual Insurance Company

Product/features not available in all states. Contact us for complete details about this insurance solicitation. To fi nd a network provider, 

1 “Medicare & You,” Centers for Medicare & Medicaid Services, 2024. 2 “Aging changes in teeth and gums”, medlineplus.gov, 4/17/2022. 3 American 
Dental Association, Health Policy Institute, 2020 Survey of Dental Fees, Copyright 2020, American Dental Association.

When you’re 
comparing plans ...

 Look for coverage that 
helps pay for major services. 

 Look for coverage 
with no deductibles.  

 Shop for coverage 
with no annual maximum 
on cash benefits. 

Simply put — without 
dental insurance, there 
may be an important 
gap in your healthcare 
coverage.

Say “NO” to Cleaning
Out Your Gutters. 

Protect Your Home
With LeafFilter.

BEFORE AFTER

+

We’re looking to install our 
NEXT GENERATION gutter 

guard on your home!

LET THE PROS
HANDLE IT!™

++ We o� er fi nancing that fi ts your budget!1

20 10% %
OFF OFF

Your Entire Purchase* Seniors + Military

1-877-933-3022CALL TODAY FOR A
FREE INSPECTION!

FULL SERVICE GUTTER PROTECTION – SCHEDULE YOUR
FREE INSPECTION NOW! 1-877-933-3022FREE INSPECTION NOW! 1-877-933-3022

+ See Representative for full warranty details. *One coupon per household. No obligation estimate valid for 1 year. 1Subject to credit approval. Call for details.  AR 366920923, AZ ROC 344027, CA 1035795, CT HIC.0671520, 
FL CBC056678, IA C127230, ID RCE-51604, LA 559544, MA 176447, MD MHIC111225,  MI 262300173, 262300318, 262300328, 262300329, 262300330, 262300331, MN IR731804, MT 226192, ND 47304, NE 50145-22, 

50145-23, NJ 13VH09953900, NM 408693, NV 86990, NY H-19114, H-52229,  OR 218294, PA 179643, 069383, RI GC-41354, TN 10981, UT 10783658-5501, VA 2705169445, WA LEAFFNW822JZ, WV WV056912.

Sir Rod Stewart  has 
angered  Donald 
Trump  supporters by 
mocking the former 
President for his Tango 
complexion.
	 The Do Ya Think I’m 
Sexy rocker, 79, used a 
Las Vegas performance 
this week to pour scorn 
on Trump.
	 He hit out after the 
78-year-old presidential 
hopeful criticised his 
White House rival  Ka-
mala Harris  for “all 
of a sudden” turning 
“black”.
	 Rod, who has often 
been seen with his own 
glowing tan, stopped 
a gig at Sin City’s Col-
osseum to stick up a 
huge projection behind 
him on stage with four 
different pictures of 
Trump.
	 It showed how the 
MAGA loudmouth’s 
complexion had gone 
from pasty white to tan-
gerine.
	 Rod referenced 
Trump’s Kamala out-
burst on the huge cap-
tion he plastered on top 
of the image.
	 It said: “I didn’t know 
he was orange until a 
number of years ago, 
when he happened to 
turn orange.
	 “I respect either one, 
but he obviously doesn’t 
and now he wants to be 
known as Orange.
	 “All of a sudden he 
made a turn and became 

an Orange person.
	 “I think someone 
should look into that.”
	 Trump has yet to com-
ment on Rod’s mockery.
	 But Rod was target-
ed on social media by 
Trump disciples over 
the stunt.
	 One right-wing news 
outlet carried a headline 
claimed it prompted a 
“mass concert walk-
out”.
	 But the body of the ar-
ticle admitted the sing-

er was only left with 
“several empty seats” 
after the message was 
displayed to a crowd of 
thousands during his 
Vegas residency.
	 Fans of Trump’s told 
Rod to “shut up” after 
the orange jibe – with 
one fuming online: 
“Way to lose half your 
fans.”
	 Other keyboard war-
riors ordered the crooner 
to “stay out of politics” 
and “stick to singing”.

Sir Rod mocks Trump
“...he happened to turn orange,” said the Scottish singer of the ex-President
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2995 Thousand Oaks Blvd., Thousand Oaks. (parking in rear)
Open: Mon-Sat. 10.30-5.30 • Sun: 10-6 • Tel: (805) 495-4042

Teas • Candy • Pastries • Bangers • 
Meat Pies • Heinz Beans • 

China Teapots • Tea Cozies • Gifts
Now featuring delicious, traditional handmade pies and 

pasties from Deli-SA. Chicken curry pasties, Cornish 
pasties, Steak & Kidney...and much more

Quality Imports from the British Isles...

Direct Contact: 
Annie 

(310) 710 8224

The Hare 
and Hounds

ARIES: Be extra careful while out and about thse next few days as it is a bit 
wobbly for you in general. This period is over by early next week ahead so lay 
low until then.
TAURUS: You are in a good time frame for interactive family times and events. 
However be careful with overspending as you may be feeling overly generous.
GEMINI: Whatever you are planning that is important be sure to complete it 
soonest. Your plans may be changed at short notice.
CANCER: This next week stay away from any drama or negative vibes. You 
are sensitive enough without the planets in fire that are powerful now. 
LEO: You may be feeling like you are ready to just get away from it all. This is 
just the beginning of your new year. You can be sure it’s a temporary feeling. 
Happy Birthday!
VIRGO: Life is good if you look at what matters most to you. The sun in Leo is 
pushing you to get a move on. You are getting ready for your new year soon. 
Clear out some space to prepare.
LIBRA: Your boss planet Venus is moving slowly backwards. This can be very 
good for your career or work area as things on hold might be opening up.
SCORPIO: Trust that the easier time overall you are (or will be) experiencing 
soon is well deserved. Do not be concerned about your future financial outlook.
SAGITTARIUS: Your boss Jupiter is keeping busy in your well-being area. 
Whatever you need to take care of be sure you complete soonest and it’s look-
ing positive by the end of next week.
CAPRICORN: You are very involved in family or friend’s life currently. Some 
of it you can help with and most is not your problem. Just know the difference 
and act accordingly.
AQUARIUS: The ups and downs of the past few weeks have left you a little 
weary. Be sure to let go of past worries. The recent full moon in your sign will 
help you.
PISCES: Time to make decisions that you have put off or thought were not 
possible. All kind of things can get accomplished in this next couple of weeks.

Stargazing with 
Annie Shaw

Local News

O’Briens was packed 
to the rafters with triv-
ia players last Tuesday 
as fourteen teams bat-
tled to win the latest 
Brits in LA Pub Quiz.
	 As usual there was 
plenty of prizes to go 
round, including a de-
licious dessert for the 
winners of the musical 
round, the Steve Ban-
non Tapes (right).
	 But a team of just 
two players, Vardy FC, 
outpaced them all to se-
cure their goal of victo-
ry.
	 Join quizmaster San-
dro Monetti and the 
quest for prizes at the 
Santa Monica trivia hub 
when the popular con-
test returns next Tues-
day, August 13, at 8pm

Vardy FC outfoxes them all
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Noorbakhsh Reynolds, 9350 Wilshire 
Blvd. Suite 203, Beverly Hills CA 
90212. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 
Farrah Faranak Noorbakhsh Reyn-
olds, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/22/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024154202. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Vacation 
365, 6712 Kraft Ave, North Hollywood 
CA 91606. County: Los Angeles. 18 
Pizza Co LLC, 6712 Kraft Ave, North 
Hollywood CA 91606. State of orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Arutyun Tom-
bulyan, managing member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024154417. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Dancyger 
Automotive Parts, 11964 Azure Pl, 
Los Angeles CA 90049. County: Los 
Angeles. Andrew Dancyger, 11964 
Azure Pl, Los Angeles CA 90049. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 07/2024. Signed: Andrew Dan-
cyger, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/23/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024154644. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Daniel Knox 
Counseling; Palisades Intervention 
& Counseling, 860 Via De La Paz 
Ste F2, Pacific Palisades CA 90272. 
County: Los Angeles. Tanya Jacob 
Clinical Psychology Inc, 860 Via De 
La Paz Ste F2, Pacific Palisades CA 
90272. State of incorporation: Califor-
nia. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 

listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 
Daniel Knox, Vice President. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024155064. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Sean’s 
Mobile Barber, 4223 10th Avenue, 
Los Angeles CA 90008. County: Los 
Angeles. Sean Loupe, 4223 10th Av-
enue, Los Angeles CA 90008. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 07/2024. Signed: Sean Loupe, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/23/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024155420. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Advanced 
Liquidators, 200 S. Barrington Ave-
nue #49750, Los Angeles CA 90049. 
County: Los Angeles. Franklin Lincoln 
Construction, Inc., 200 S. Barrington 
Avenue #49750, Los Angeles CA 
90049. State of incorporation: Califor-
nia. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Alex 
Soofer, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/24/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024155890. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: V.S. Electric, 
1146 E. Lexington Dr. #210, Glendale 
CA 91206. County: Los Angeles. 
Vehans Shahian, 1146 E. Lexington 
Dr. #210, Glendale CA 91206. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 07/2024. Signed: Vehans Sha-
hian, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/24/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-

ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 07/27/2024, 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024 and 08/17/2024.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
400 Civic Center Plaza

Pomona CA 91768

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Joyce Yan Zhong, an adult over 

the age of 18 years.

​Date: 09/06/2024. Time: 9.00am 
Dept. O Room: 5th Floor 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Joyce Yan 
Zhong. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Joyce 
Yan Zhong to Hai Lan Chung

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 5, 2024
Christian R. Gullon, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24PSCP00321
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd.
Norwalk CA 90650

In the matter of In the Matter of 
the Petition of Jasmine Acevedo, 
an adult over the age of 18 years, 
on behalf of Isaac Arrue, a minor 

under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is under 18 years of age: Isaac 
Arrue. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 

said petitioner(s) desire to have the 
name changed from Isaac Arrue 

to Isaac Acevedo

​Date: 09/23/2024. Time: 9:30am 
Dept. C Room 312

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 29, 2024.
Judge Olivia Rosales
Judge of the Superior Court
24N WCP00285
Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

312 N. Spring St
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the matter of In the Matter of the 
Petition of Kymberli Thomas, an 
adult over the age of 18 years, on 
behalf of Khloi Sabrina Pitts, a 
minor under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is under 18 years of age: Khloi 
Sabrina Pitts. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 

have the name changed from Kh-
loi Sabrina Pitts to Khloi Sabrina 

Thomas

​Date: 09/09/2024. Time: 9:30am 
Dept. 9 Room 9

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 12, 2024.
Elaine Lu
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02221
Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk  Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650

In the matter of In the Matter of 
the Petition of Heather O’Leary, 
an adult over the age of 18 years, 
on behalf of Landon Workman, a 
minor under the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is under 18 years of age: Landon 

Workman. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 

filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have the name changed from 
Landon Workman to Landon 

O’Leary

​Date: 09/30/2024. Time: 9:30am 
Dept. C Room 312

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 25, 2024.
Judge Olivia Rosales
Judge of the Superior Court
24NWCP00279
Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

6230 Sylmar Ave Room 107
Van Nuys CA 91401

In the Matter of the Petition of Jill 
Johnson Bennett, an adult over 

the age of 18 years.

​Date: 09/16/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. T Room 600

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Jill 
Norvelle Johnson Bennett. And 

a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 

from Jill Norvelle Johnson 
Bennett to Jill Norvelle Johnson 

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 31, 2024.
Virginia Keeny
Judge of the Superior Court
24VECP00344
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

9425 Penfield Ave
Chatsworth CA 91311

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Natalia Mukhortova Kim, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 09/30/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. F49 

It appearing that the following 
person whose name is to be 

changed is over 18 years of age: 
Natalia Mukhortova Kim. And 

a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Natalia Mukhortova Kim to 

Natalia Mukhortova

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 29, 2024.
David B. Gelfound
Judge of the Superior Court
24CHCP00290
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024133556. The fol-
lowing person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Abraham Services, 
17081 San Jose St, Granada 
Hills CA 91344. County: Los 
Angeles. Abraham Chldryan, 
17081 San Jose St, Granada 
Hills CA 91344. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Abraham Chldryan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 06/21/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business 
name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
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lished: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024135605. The fol-
lowing person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Betonarte, 15101 
Magnolia Blvd Unit B9, Sher-
man Oaks CA 91403. County: 
Los Angeles. Arash T Mashhad, 
15101 Magnolia Blvd Unit B9, 
Sherman Oaks CA 91403. This 
business is conducted by: an in-
dividual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2024. Signed: Arash T 
Mashhad, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 06/25/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024141333. The follow-
ing person(s) is/are doing busi-
ness as: Ignite Mediterranean 
Grill, 3527 Artesia Blvd, Tor-
rance CA 90504. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 6279951. MK 
Food Services Inc, 3527 Artesia 
Blvd, Torrance CA 90504. State 
of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a cor-
poration. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Mirna Kalaja, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/02/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024147751. The 
following person(s) is/are do-
ing business as: Jaime’s Body 
Shop, 10045 Artesia Boulevard, 
Bellflower CA 90706. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 2382999. 
Jaime’s Auto Glass, Inc., 10045 
Artesia Boulevard, Bellflower 
CA 90706. State of incorpora-
tion: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under 
the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 
10/2010. Signed: Jaime Casta-
neda, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with 

the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 07/11/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024151982. The follow-
ing person(s) is/are doing busi-
ness as: KJ Law Firm, 11312, 
Venice Blvd., Los Angeles CA 
90066. County: Los Angeles. 
JK Injury & Accident Lawyers, 
PC, 11312, Venice Blvd., Los 
Angeles CA 90066. State of 
incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a cor-
poration. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2024. Signed: Aleksey 
Katmissky, President. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/18/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024152437. The 
following person(s) is/are do-
ing business as: Green Home 
Construction, 2704 Ablano Ave, 
Rowland Heights CA 91748. 
County: Los Angeles. Stanley 
Hu, 2704 Ablano Ave, Rowland 
Heights CA 91748. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an indi-
vidual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Stanley Hu, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/19/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024155182. The 
following person(s) is/are do-
ing business as: Encomiendas 
Morales, 830 S Hoover St, Los 

Angeles CA 90005. County: Los 
Angeles. Marvin Alberto Mo-
rales Mendez, 288 1/2 50th St, 
Los Angeles  CA 90011. This 
business is conducted by: an in-
dividual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
07/2024. Signed: Marvin Alberto 
Morales Mendez, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/24/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024156057. Current 
file: 2020003047. The following 
person has abandoned the use 
of the fictitious business name: 
Sunny Dumpling House, 18481 
Colima Rd, Rowland Heights 
CA 91748. USA Thompson 
Trading Co. Ltd, 4070 N Palm St 
Suite 701, Fullerton CA 92835. 
The fictitious business name 
referred to above was filed on: 
01/06/2020, in the County of 
Los Angeles. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability 
company. Signed: Yue Zhang, 
Secretary. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/24/2024. Pub-
lished: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024156422. The fol-
lowing person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Coldwell Banker 
Edge, 713 W Duarte Rd. EKTO 
Holdings, Arcadia CA 91007. 
County: Los Angeles. Agent 
Collective, 713 W Duarte Rd. 
#236, Arcadia CA 91007. State 
of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a cor-
poration. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Erwin Pineda, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/25/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024156454. The fol-
lowing person(s) is/are doing 

business as: Zoom Movers, 
6600 Sunset Blvd Ste 227, Los 
Angeles CA 90028. County: Los 
Angeles. Firuza Mamatkhano-
va, 6600 Sunset Blvd Ste 227, 
Los Angeles CA 90028. This 
business is conducted by: an in-
dividual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
07/2024. Signed: Firuza Mamat-
khanova, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 07/25/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024156480. The follow-
ing person(s) is/are doing busi-
ness as: Project Prefab, Prefab 
Project, Extra Build, 19761 
Bahama St, Northridge CA 
91324. County: Los Angeles. 
Kevin Davoodi, 19761 Bahama 
St, Northridge CA 91324. This 
business is conducted by: an in-
dividual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed here-
in on: 06/2024. Signed: Kevin 
Davoodi, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 07/25/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024156585. The follow-
ing person(s) is/are doing busi-
ness as: Nothing Bundt Cakes, 
4431 Candlewood Street, Lake-
wood CA 90712. County: Los 
Angeles. Bundtastic Lakewood 
LLC, 2875 Park Ave, Tustin CA 
92782. State of organization: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Stephanie Nishira-
no, managing member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/25/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 

Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024157799. The follow-
ing person(s) is/are doing busi-
ness as: Quantum Engineering 
Solutions, 155 N. Lake Ave., 
Suite 800, Pasadena CA 91101. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
4556016. Joe Bar Consulting, 
155 N. Lake Ave., Suite 800, 
Pasadena CA 91101. State of 
incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a cor-
poration. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Jose Barrero, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/25/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024157802. The follow-
ing person(s) is/are doing busi-
ness as: Dennis King Computer 
Services, 6714 Platt Ave, West 
Hills CA 91307. County: Los An-
geles. AI#ON: 4581496. DSKE2 
Inc., 6714 Platt Ave, West Hills 
CA 91307. State of incorpora-
tion: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Dennis King, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/26/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024157805. The follow-
ing person(s) is/are doing busi-
ness as: Prosperity Gold Group, 
8150 Etiwanda Ave., Reseda 
CA 91335. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 201727710282. Pre-
cious Metals Investment LLC, 
8150 Etiwanda Ave., Reseda 
CA 91335. State of organization: 
California. This business is con-

ducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
02/2018. Signed: Ashley  James 
Castellino, manager. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/26/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024157808. The fol-
lowing person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Tiny Tennis, 6014 
Evenhaim Lane, Tarzana CA 
91356. County: Los Angeles. 
Desislava Joyner, 6014 Even-
haim Lane, Tarzana CA 91356. 
This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Regis-
trant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious 
business name or names list-
ed herein on: 05/2019. Signed: 
Desislava Joyner, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/26/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of 
the rights of another under fed-
eral, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/03/2024, 
08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 and 
08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158159. The follow-
ing person(s) is/are doing busi-
ness as: Plumbing Techs, 3327 
Sabina Street Apt. 1419, Los 
Angeles CA 90023. County: Los 
Angeles. Luis R Mausss, 3327 Sabi-
na Street Apt. 1419, Los Angeles CA 
90023. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Luis R Mausss, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/26/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158427. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
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as: Basak Travel; Wilshire Exhibit, 
4215 Jackson Ave, Culver City CA 
90232. County: Los Angeles. Basak 
International LLC, 4215 Jackson 
Ave, Culver City CA 90232. State 
of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2013. 
Signed: Sevgi Basak, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158625. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Benedek Law, 3655 Torrance Blvd 
Suite 300, Torrance CA 90503. 
County: Los Angeles. Patrick Bene-
dek, 3655 Torrance Blvd Suite 300, 
Torrance CA 90503. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 10/2018. Signed: Patrick Bene-
dek, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/29/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 
and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158708. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Smooth Savage DBA, 453 S 
Spring Street Suite 400, Los Ange-
les CA 90013. County: Los Angeles. 
Smooth Savage LLC, 453 S Spring 
Street Suite 400, Los Angeles CA 
90013. State of organization: Cali-
fornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Garfield Senior, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024159106. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Armonia Y Figura, 8526 Internation-
al Ave 22, Canoga Park CA 91304. 
County: Los Angeles. Stephani 
Sepulveda, 8526 International Ave 

22, Canoga Park CA 91304. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 
Stephani Sepulveda, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024159318. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
The Coupon Beach, 1110 N Virgil 
Ave #97976, Los Angeles CA 90029. 
County: Los Angeles. Elizabeth Stol-
fi, 1110 N Virgil Ave #97976, Los 
Angeles CA 90029. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2024. Signed: Elizabeth Stolfi, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 07/29/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 
and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024159451. The following per-
son(s) is/are doing business as: Ul-
tima Cares, 24228 Hawthorne Blvd, 
Torrance CA 90505. County: Los 
Angeles. Amirmohammad Alkabir, 
24228 Hawthorne Blvd, Torrance CA 
90505. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Amirmohammad Alkabir, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 07/29/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 
and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024159536. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Civicreach, 
237 N Park Avenue, Montebello CA 
90640. County: Los Angeles. Darius 
Thatcher LLC, 237 N Park Avenue, 
Montebello CA 90640. State of orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: David Torres, 

President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/30/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024 
and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024159610. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Zipped Up Films, 235 N Kenilworth 
Ave, Glendale CA 91203. County: 
Los Angeles. Karen Zipor, 43098 
Weatherwood Drive, Ashburn VA 
20147. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Karen Zipor, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024160463. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Adaptive Minds Psychiatry; Lav-
ish NP, 16530 Ventura Blvs Suite 
400, Encino CA 91436. County: 
Los Angeles. Brookins & Associ-
ates Nursing Corporation, 16530 
Ventura Blvd Suite 400, Encino CA 
91436. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024 
Signed: Micole Brookins, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024160930. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Craft Ads, 
944 E. Howard St., Pasadena CA 
91104. County: Los Angeles. Modest 
Conspiracy, LLC, 944 E. Howard St., 
Pasadena CA 91104. State of orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 
David Matthew Lawrene, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 

07/31/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/03/2024, 08/10/2024, 
08/17/2024 and 08/24/2024

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 

C KENNETH GRAILER 
AKA CHARLES KENNETH 

GRAILER 
CASE NO. 24STPB08532

To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interest-
ed in the will or estate, or both, 
of: C KENNETH GRAILER AKA 
CHARLES KENNETH GRAILER
A Petition for Probate has been filed 
by MARY JO FEHR in the Superior 
Court of California, County of LOS 
ANGELES.
The Petition for Probate requests 
that MARY JO FEHR be appointed 
as personal representative to ad-
minister the estate of the decedent.
The Petition requests authority to 
administer the estate under the 
Independent Administration of Es-
tates Act. (This authority will allow 
the personal representative to take 
many actions without obtaining 
court approval. Before taking cer-
tain very important actions, how-
ever, the personal representative 
will be required to give notice to 
interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
A hearing on the petition will be held 
in this court on 9/12/2024 at 8:30 
A.M. in Dept. 5 Room N/A located 
at 111 N. HILL STREET, LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90012.
If you object to the granting of the 
petition, you should appear at the 
hearing and state your objections or 
file written objections with the court 
before the hearing. Your appear-
ance may be in person or by your 
attorney.
If you are a creditor or a contingent 
creditor of the decedent, you must 
file your claim with the court and 
mail a copy to the personal repre-
sentative appointed by the court 
within the later of either (1) four 
months from the date of first issu-
ance of letters to a general personal 
representative, as defined in sec-
tion 58(b) of the California Probate 
Code, or (2) 60 days from the date 
of mailing or personal delivery to 
you of a notice under section 9052 
of the California Probate Code.
Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as 
a creditor. You may want to consult 
with an attorney knowledgeable in 
California law.
You may examine the file kept by 
the court. If you are a person in-
terested in the estate, you may file 
with the court a Request for Special 
Notice (form DE-154) of the filing of 
an inventory and appraisal of estate 
assets or of any petition or account 
as provided in Probate Code sec-
tion 1250. A Request for Special 
Notice form is available from the 
court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner: DAVID 
SCHECHET, ESQ., 1901 AVE OF 
THE STARS, 2ND FLOOR, LOS 
ANGELES, CA 90067, Telephone: 
310-286-9925
8/10, 8/17, 8/24/24
CNS-3840774#

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

600 East Broadway
Glendale CA 91208

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Gabriiela Mercedes Jarboe, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/03/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. E 

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 

18 years of age: 
Gabriiela Mercedes Jarboe. 

And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from said 
petition that said petitioner(s) desire to 

have their name changed from 
Gabriiela Mercedes Jarboe to 

Gabriiela Mercedes Jarboe-Amoroso

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 25, 2024.
Ashfaq G. Chowdhury, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00393
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

300 E Walnut St
Pasadena CA 91101

In the matter of In the Matter of 
the Petition of Xiangyan Ji and 
Gustav Alexander von Schulz, 

adults over the age of 18 years, on 
behalf of Keyan Ji and Catalina Ji 
Vertsman, minors under the age 

of 18 years.

It appearing that the following 
person(s) whose name is/are to 

be changed is/are under 18 years 
of age: Keyan Ji and Catalina 
Ji Vertsman. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have the name changed from 

Keyan Ji to Matthias Alexander 
von Schulz and from Catalina Ji 
Vertsman to Catalina Isabella 

von Schulz

​Date: 09/20/2024. Time: 9:00am 
Dept. A

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 

is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 31, 2024
Robin Miller Sloan
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00414
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N Hill St
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Damian Francisco Morales, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/07/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. 9 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Damian 

Francisco Morales. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this 
Court, and it appearing from said 

petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Damian Francisco Morales 

to Damian Campos

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 5, 2024.
Elaine Lu
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02448
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

300 E Walnut Street
Pasadena CA 91101

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Xiangbo Wenyu, an adult over 

the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/18/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Xiangbo 
Wenyu. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
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their name changed from Xiangbo 
Wenyu to David Xiangbo Wenyu

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 5, 2024.
Curtis A Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02440
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

300 E Walnut St
Pasadena CA 91101

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Xiangyan Ji, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/09/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. 3 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Xiangyan 

Ji. And a petition for change of 
names having been duly filed with 
the clerk of this Court, and it ap-

pearing from said petition that said 
petitioner(s) desire to have their 

name changed from Xiangyan Ji 
to Isabella Clara von Schulz

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: July 30, 2024.
Robin Miller Sloan
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00412
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N Hill St
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of Pa-
tricia Skyla Pepars, an adult over 

the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/18/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836 

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Patricia 
Skyla Pepars. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, 

and it appearing from said petition 
that said petitioner(s) desire to 
have their name changed from 

Patricia Skyla Pepars to 
Miranda Pat Cardenas

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 2, 2024.
Curtis A Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02429
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

12720 Norwalk Blvd
Norwalk CA 90650-3107

In the Matter of the Petition of 
Samuel Adolfo Contreras Castillo, 

an adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 09/20/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. C Room 312 

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 

18 years of age: Samuel Adolfo 
Contreras Castillo. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from 

Samuel Adolfo Contreras Castillo 
to Samuel Adolfo Castillo C

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 

weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 1, 2024.
Judge Olivia Rosales
Judge of the Superior Court
24NWCP00305
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024139676. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
A-Plus Dentistry Carson, 441 E Car-
son St Suite N, Carson CA 90745. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
6262551. Ndidi Denal Corporation, 
441 E Carson St Suite N, Carson 
CA 90745. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 01/2024. Signed: Ndidi Uka, 
President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/01/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024152350. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as:  
K9 Plus, 842 Clearwater Ct, Walnut 
CA 91789. County: Los Angeles. 
K9 N You Inc, 842 Clearwater Ct, 
Walnut CA 91789. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 07/2024. Signed: Jia Lu, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 07/18/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024152379. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
IE Construction; IEConstruction, 
3929 Guasti Rd Ste F, Ontario CA 
91761. County: San Bernadino. In-
tegrated Energy Group, LLC, 3929 
Guasti Rd Ste F, Ontario CA 91761. 
State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Jennifer Hisey, Vice 
President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/19/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 

the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024152416. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: ABC Tax Solutions, 13107 Ter-
ra Bella St, Pacoima CA 91331. 
County: Los Angeles. Francisco 
Arvizu Garcia, 13107 Terra Bella 
St, Pacoima CA 91331. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individu-
al. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 
Francisco Arvizu Garcia, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 07/19/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024152784. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Firefly Craft Works, 10839 
Morrison St #1, North Hollywood 
CA 91601. County: Los Angeles. 
Heidi Schofield, 10839 Morrison 
St #1, North Hollywood CA 91601. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Heidi Schofield, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 07/19/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024155004. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Los Angeles Bookkeeping, 
8484 Wilshire Blvd, Suite 515D, 
Los Angeles CA 90211. County: 
Los Angeles. Brian Hill, 31692 Via 
Cervantes, San Juan Capistrano 
CA 92675. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2024. Signed: Brian Hill, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 

Angeles County on: 07/23/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024155830. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: The Reiman Agency, 11750 
Wilshire Blvd Apt. 1702, Los An-
geles CA 90025. County: Los An-
geles. Izea Worldwide, Inc., 1317 
Edgewater Dr #1880, Orlando FL 
32804. State of Incorporation: Ne-
vada. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Peter Biere, CFO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/24/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024157423. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
NOINU, 414 W Grand Ave, Alham-
bra CA 91801. County: Los Angeles. 
Lok Cheung Ho, 414 W Grand Ave, 
Alhambra CA 91801. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Lok Cheung 
Ho, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/26/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024157597. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
HUMANKORP, 17000 Gramercy 
Place, Gardena CA 90247. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Laurence Konishi, 
17000 Gramercy Place, Gardena 
CA 90247. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Laurence Konishi, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 

filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/26/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158166. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Nena Couture, 13245 Roscoe 
Boulevard, Sun Valley CA 91352. 
County: Los Angeles. Julia Valen-
tin Estrada, 13245 Roscoe Boule-
vard, Sun Valley CA 91352; Makoto 
Kerns, 13245 Roscoe Boulevard, 
Sun Valley CA 91352. Sandy Es-
trada Barillas, 13245 Roscoe Bou-
levard, Sun Valley CA 91352. This 
business is conducted by: a gen-
eral partnership. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 01/2019. 
Signed: Makoto Kerns, general 
partner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/26/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158357. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Health-Wise Your Journey Travel 
Agency, 43430 E Florida Ave 292, 
Hemet CA 92544-6492. County: 
Riverside. Suszie Campbell, 3430 
E Florida Ave 292, Hemet CA 
92544-6492. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2024. Signed: Suszie Camp-
bell, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/29/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158361. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Digital Dream Mama, 24717 
Sand Wedge Lane, Santa Clarita 
CA 91355. County: Los Angeles. 
Aubrey Eggiman, LLC, 24717 Sand 
Wedge Lane, Santa Clarita CA 
91355. State of Organization: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
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by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 07/2024. Signed: Au-
brey Eggiman, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/29/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158453. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Lucy Kirakos, 345 E Verdugo 
Avenue 205, Burbank CA 91502. 
County: Los Angeles. Lyusi Kirako-
syan, 345 E Verdugo Avenue 205, 
Burbank CA 91502. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 07/2024. Signed: Lyusi 
Kirakosyan, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/29/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158802. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Ari. Hair Studio, 7909 Atlantic 
Ave Suite 50, Cudahy CA 90201. 
County: Los Angeles. Ariadna 
Hernandez Ramos, 1054 1/4 W 
58th Pl, Los Angeles CA 90044. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Ariadna Hernandez Ramos, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/29/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024159922. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Elevated Tax Pros, 24303 Woolsey 
Canyon Rd Spc 9, Canoga Park CA 

91304. County: Los Angeles. Steph-
any Jazmin Luna, 24303 Woolsey 
Canyon Rd Spc 9, Canoga Park CA 
91304. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Stephany Jazmin Luna, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/30/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024160611. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Tacos Morales Estilo Sinaloa, 
13103 Goller Ave, Norwalk CA 
90650. County: Los Angeles. Hec-
tor Morales Cobarruvia, 13103 
Goller Ave, Norwalk CA 90650. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Hector Morales Cobarru-
via, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/31/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024160640. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Liquor Castle, 12521 Victory 
Blvd, North Hollywood CA 91606. 
County: Los Angeles.  AI#ON: 
C4736437. Grind to the Grill, 12521 
Victory Blvd, North Hollywood CA 
91606. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Sarkis Bislamyan, Presi-
dent. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 07/31/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-

ment: 2024161417. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Rise Studios, 3023 Prospect Ave, 
Santa Monica CA 90405. County: 
Los Angeles. Good Place Prop-
erties LLC, 3023 Prospect Ave, 
Santa Monica CA 90405. State of 
Organization: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a limited li-
ability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Jeanie Davidson, manag-
er. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 07/31/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024161586. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Gsosa Productions, 13109 Verdura 
Ave, Downey CA 90242. County: 
Los Angeles. Gilberto Sosa, 13109 
Verdura Ave, Downey CA 90242. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Gilberto Sosa, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/01/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024161615. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: IR Buildings Solutions, 15021 
Ventura Blvd. #401, Sherman Oaks 
CA 91403. County: Los Angeles. 
IR Tech Inc., 15021 Ventura Blvd. 
#401, Sherman Oaks CA 91403. 
State of Incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Itai Rabinovich, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/01/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-

lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024161777. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Naturaleza Pura Wholesale, 825 
E Mission Blvd. Suite D, Pomona 
CA 91766. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 6285291. Naturaleza Pura 
Wholesale Inc, 12005 Poutous Ct, 
Moreno Valley CA 92557. State of 
Incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Pablo San-
tacruz, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/01/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024162232. Current file: 
2022099049. The following person 
has abandoned the use of the fic-
titious business name: Ritual LA, 
617 W Dryden Street #1, Glendale 
CA 91202. Alexandra Lane Rosen-
thal, 617 W Dryden Street #1, 
Glendale CA 91202. The fictitious 
business name referred to above 
was filed on: 05/04/2022, in the 
County of Los Angeles. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
Signed: Alexandra Lane Rosenthal, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/01/2024. 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024162262. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Allen & Sons Appliance, 6415 
De Soto Ave., Woodland Hills 
CA 91367. County: Los Angeles.  
AI#ON: 3769590. My Appliance 
Service, Inc, 26500 W Agoura 
Rd Suite 102-500, Calabasas CA 
91302. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Fred Pesin, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/01/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024162265. The following 

person(s) is/are doing business 
as: MNMLOVE, 5902 Lubao Ave, 
Woodland Hills CA 91367. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Liat Zucker, 5902 
Lubao Ave, Woodland Hills CA 
91367. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Liat Zucker, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/01/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024162577. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: All Trust Appliance Repair, 
421 Palm Dr Unit 2, Glendale CA 
91202. County: Los Angeles. A&Y 
Appliances, 421 Palm Dr Unit 2, 
Glendale CA 91202. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business 
is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 
Mikayel Poghosyan, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 08/02/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024162714. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Carlos M. Clark & Associates, 628 
E 85th St, Los Angeles CA 90001. 
County: Los Angeles. Carlos M. 
Clark Jr, 628 E 85th St, Los An-
geles CA 90001. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 04/2012. Signed: Carlos 
M. Clark Jr, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/02/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024162721. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Quality Shower Pans, 16912 
Chaparral Ave, Cerritos CA 90703. 
County: Los Angeles. Daisy V Ro-
driguez Ferreira, 16912 Chaparral 
Ave, Cerritos CA 90703. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 05/2004. Signed: 
Daisy V Rodriguez Ferreira, own-
er. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 08/02/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024163404. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Trop De Chocolat, 1725 E Cortez 
St, West Covina CA 91791. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Vivian Yu, 1725 E 
Cortez St, West Covina CA 91791. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Vivian Yu, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/05/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024163450. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: LAS BEST HOME CLEANING, 
2539 West Blvd, Los Angeles CA 
90016. County: Los Angeles. Clan-
cy Lane Media, LLC, 2539 West 
Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90016. State 
of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Josh Houghton, manager. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/05/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
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14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024164361. Current file: 
2022170281. The following person 
has abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious business name: BLEMISHRX, 
265 W 223rd St, Carson CA 90745. 
Vanessa Aveiro, 265 W 223rd St, 
Carson CA 90745. The fictitious 
business name referred to above 
was filed on: 08/01/2022, in the 
County of Los Angeles. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
Signed: Vanessa Aveiro, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all in-
formation in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Ange-
les County on: 08/05/2024. Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024164398. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
JUSHINE, 4216 Pacific Coast Hwy 
1338, Torrance CA 90505. County: 
Los Angeles. Madelene Kim, 4216 
Pacific Coast Hwy 1338, Torrance 
CA 90505. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Madelene 
Kim, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 

statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024164586. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: The Not So Wild Animals LLC, 
4178 6th Avenue, Los Angeles 
CA 90008. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 202463215146. The Not 
So Wild Animals LLC, 4178 6th Av-
enue, Los Angeles CA 90008. State 
of Organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Reyniesha Tucker, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/06/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 

state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024164619. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Kelsey S McNeal Photogra-
phy, KLC Photo, Kelsey S McNeal 
Photography, 29243 Piani Rd., 
Pearlblossom CA 93553. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Kelsey McNeal, 
29243 Piani Rd., Pearlblossom CA 
93553. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 01/2009. 
Signed: Kelsey McNeal, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/06/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024164772. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Learn More With Less, 6110 Ven-
ice Blvd, Los Angeles CA 90034. 

County: Los Angeles. Learning 
Equipment Supply Service, 6110 
Venice Blvd, Los Angeles CA 
90034. State of Incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 12/2012. 
Signed: Glen Chung, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/06/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this 
statement does not of itself autho-
rize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024165394. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Vannessa Carroll Coaching; Re-
veal The Real Me, 11650 Riverside 
Drive PH 1, Studio City CA 91602. 
County: Los Angeles. Vannessa 
Carroll, 11650 Riverside Drive PH 
1, Studio City CA 91602. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Van-
nessa Carroll, owner. Registrant(s) 

declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/06/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024165745. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: GP BB Consultants, Inc., 1171 
S. Robertson Blvd Suitre 450, Los 
Angeles CA 90035. County: Los 
Angeles. GP BB Consultants, Inc., 
3507 Rockrose Drive 1171 S. Rob-
ertson Blvd. Suite 450, Los Angeles 
CA 90035. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2024. Signed: Stacy Lyles, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 08/07/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 

Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself au-
thorize the use in this state of a fic-
titious business name in violation of 
the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024166545. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Dani Handyman, 8148 Shadyglade 
Ave, North Hollywood CA 91605. 
County: Los Angeles. Harutyun 
Martirosyan, 8148 Shadyglade 
Ave, North Hollywood CA 91605. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 02/2013. 
Signed: Harutyun Martirosyan, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/07/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Ficti-
tious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024 and 08/31/2024

Aging in Place?
Consider an AmeriGlide stair lift 
to keep you safe on your stairs.

Benefits of an AmeriGlide stair lift:

Eliminate the risk of falls. 

Enjoy a comfortable ride up  
and down all of your home.

Enjoy comfortable, safe  
and easy access to all of 
your home.

More affordable than 
options such as moving.

Custom fit to 
your staircase

Indoor and  
Outdoor options

Fast delivery 
and installation

SAVE $200

1-866-654-6288

CALL NOW TO Call today to get your FREE, 
no obligation quote  
in minutes!ON ANY STAIR LIFT!

WE CANCEL TIMESHARES
Many people believe their timeshares cannot be cancelled, but they
often can be. Our founder and CEO, Chuck McDowell, has successfully
helped over 30,000 families get rid of their timeshare and he can
likely help you too. If you were misled, lied to, or pressured, you
may have an easy exit with a 100% money back guarantee.

•  Start with a FREE consultation to tell your story.

•  If we see that the circumstances of your situation qualify
   you to exit the timeshare, you’ll be assigned a specialist to walk
   you through the process. Don’t think for another minute that you

are stuck with this. What we do is help
you cancel your timeshare along with all
of the debt and fees associated with it.
Guaranteed.

“Wesley Financial was awesome 
to work with. They were pro-
fessional and very understanding
of the situation we were in.
Thank you all so much. This has
been a huge burden and you 
all helped relieve that burden.
Thank you.”

- Kyle S
Wesley Financial Group, LLC client

Chuck McDowell, Founder & CEO

•  Our Resolution Department works quickly to have your
  timeshare and all related fees permanently terminated.   

We’ve been able to help many timeshare owners that 
contact us. You could be one phone call away from complete
peace of mind.

We have a dedicated team waiting for your call.

How Does the Cancellation Process Work?  

Call 1.877.854.0943

4.7 based on 1,103 reviews 4.9 based on 463 reviews 4.7 based on 833 reviews

Get your free information kit and see if you qualify:

*This is an Advertisement. Wesley Financial Group, LLC (“WFG”) and/or its a liates, successors, or assigns are
not lawyers and/or a law firm and does not engage inthe practice of law or provide legal advice or legal

representation. Actual results depend on each client’s distinct case and no specific outcome is guaranteed. 
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PARIS 2024: All the British medals so far
Gold medal winners: 13
Equestrian – Team Eventing: Rosalind Canter, Laura Collett and Tom McEwen
Mountain Biking – Cross Country: Tom Pidcock
Men’s Shooting – Trap Final: Nathan Hales
Swimming – Men’s 4x200m Freestyle Relay Final): Matt Richards, James Guy, Tom Dean and Duncan Scott
Triathlon – Men’s: Alex Yee
Rowing – Women’s Quadruple Sculls: Lauren Henry, Lola Anderson, Hannah Scott and Georgina Brayshaw
Rowing – Women’s Lightweight Double Sculls: Emily Craig and Imogen Grant
Trampoline – Women’s: Bryony Page
Equestrian – Team Jumping: Ben Maher, Harry Charles and Scott Brash
Rowing – Men’s Eight: Sholto Carnegie, Rory Gibbs, Morgan Bolding, Jacob Dawson, Charlie Elwes, Tom Digby, James Rudkin, Tom 
Ford and cox Harry Brightmore
Cycling – Women’s Team Sprint: Emma Finucane, Sophie Capewell and Katy Marchant
Athletics – Women’s 800m: Keely Hodgkinson
Kite Sailing – Women’s: Ellie Aldridge

Silver medal winners: 17
Cycling – Women’s Time Trial: Anna Henderson
Swimming – Men’s 100m Breaststroke: Adam Peaty
Diving – Men’s Synchronised 10m Platform: Tom Daley and Noah Williams
Canoe – Men’s Slalom Singles: Adam Burgess
Swimming – Men’s 200m Freestyle): Matt Richards
BMX – Men’s Freestyle: Kieran Reilly
Rowing – Women’s Four: Helen Glover, Esme Booth, Sam Redgrave and Rebecca Shorten
Rowing – Men’s Pair: Oliver Wynne-Griffiths and Tom George
Swimming – Men’s 50m Freestyle: Ben Proud
Swimming – Men’s 200m Individual Medley: Duncan Scott
Shooting – Women’s Skeet: Amber Rutter
Golf – Men’s: Tommy Fleetwood
Kayak – Men’s Cross: Joe Clarke
Cycling – Men’s Team Sprint: Jack Carlin, Ed Lowe and Hamish Turnbull
Athletics – Men’s 1500m: Josh Kerr
Cycling – Men’s Team Pursuit: Ethan Hayter, Charlie Tanfield, Ethan Vernon, Daniel Bigham and Oliver Wood
Athletics – Men’s 400m: Matthew Hudson-Smith

Bronze medal winners: 20
Diving – Women’s Synchronised 3m Springboard: Yasmin Harper and Scarlett Mew Jensen
Canoe Slalom – Women’s Kayak: Kimberley Woods
Equestrian – Individual Eventing: Laura Collett
Triathlon – Women’s: Beth Potter
Diving – Women’s Synchronised 10m Platform: Andrea Spendolini-Sirieix and Lois Toulson
Rowing – Women’s Double Sculls: Mathilda Hodgkins-Byrne and Becky Wilde
Rowing – Men’s Four: Oli Wilkes, David Ambler, Matt Aldridge and Freddie Davidson
Diving – Men’s Synchronised 3m Springboard: Jack Laugher and Anthony Harding
Rowing – Women’s Eight: Heidi Long, Rowan McKellar, Holly Dunford, Emily Ford, Lauren Irwin, Eve Stewart, Harriet Taylor, Annie 
Campbell-Orde and Henry Fieldman
Sailing – Women’s IQFoil Windsurfing: Emma Wilson
Equestrian – Team Dressage: Lottie Fry, Becky Moody and Carl Hester
Gymnastics – Men’s Floor: Jake Jarman
Athletics – 4x400m Mixed Relay): Samuel Reardon, Laviai Nielsen, Alex Haydock-Wilson and Amber Anning
Equestrian – Individual Dressage: Lottie Fry
Gymnastics – Men’s Vault: Harry Hepworth
Triathlon – Mixed Team Relay: Beth Potter, Alex Yee, Sam Dickinson and Georgia Taylor-Brown
Kayak – Women’s Cross: Kimberley Woods
Skateboarding – Women’s Park: Sky Brown
Boxing – Men’s 71kg: Lewis Richardson
Cycling – Women’s Team Pursuit: Elinor Barker, Josie Knight, Anna Morris and Jessica Roberts

Striker Richarlison says 
he wants to stay at Tot-
tenham Hotspur after 
turning down a move to 
Saudi Arabia.
	 The Brazil forward, 27, 
joined Spurs from Ever-
ton in 2022 for a club-re-
cord fee of £60m.

	 He has scored 15 goals 
in 66 appearances for 
Tottenham and was 
not always a starter last 
season under manager 
Ange Postecoglou.
	 Richarlison, whose 
contract runs until 2027, 
has attracted interest 

from a number of clubs 
in Saudi Arabia, with 
one unnamed team ta-
bling a bid.
	 However, he says he 
wants to remain in En-
gland in order to im-
prove his chances of con-
tinuing his international 

career with Brazil.
	 “There has been an 
offer but my dream of 
playing for the Brazil-
ian Selecao and in the 
Premier League speaks 
louder,”  Richarlison 
told ESPN Brazil,  exter-
nal.
	 Spurs are interested 
in signing a striker this 
summer and have iden-
tified  Bournemouth’s 
Dominic Solanke  as a 
target.
	 The Cherries are keen 
to keep Solanke, who 
scored 21 goals in 42 
games for Bournemouth 
last season but was over-
looked for England’s 
Euro 2024 squad.
	 He has a £65m re-
lease clause in his 
Bournemouth contract 
- which has three years 
left on it - but Totten-
ham value the striker at 
a lower price.

PRICEY: Richarlison cost Spurs £60m in 2022

Richi rejects Saudi switch

Chelsea winger Raheem 
Sterling says he miss-
es playing for England 
because it is “one of the 
best feelings you can ever 
have”.
	 The 29-year-old has not 
played for his country 
since the 2022 World Cup, 
when he flew home to at-
tend a family emergency 
during the tournament in 
Qatar.
	 Former Three Lions boss 
Gareth Southgate left the 
forward out of multiple 
squads after that, includ-
ing his party for Euro 2024.
	 Southgate resigned fol-
lowing the defeat against 
Spain in the final and the 
Football Association is yet 
to appoint his successor, 
but  Under-21 boss Lee 
Carsley is expected to take 
interim charge for the Na-
tions League games in Sep-
tember.
	 When asked if he misses 
being around the England 
camp, Sterling said: “Of 
course, I love playing for 
England. It is one of the 
best feelings you can ever 
have.
	 “To see the boys out 
there brought me joy. To 
be honest they were the 
only games I watched - the 
England ones.” 

BW SPORT
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Brits in LA

THE CRICKET world 
was this week mourning 
English batsman Gra-
ham Thorpe, who has 
died aged 55.
	 The doughty left-
hander will be remem-
bered as one of the best 
batters of his generation.
Across his 100 Tests be-
tween 1993 and 2005, 
Thorpe was a world-class 
player in a struggling 
England side and a key 
part in the upturn that 
followed.
	 With his trademark 
headband in place, he 
could grind out runs 
against some of the 
game’s greats or lead 
a brave counter-attack 
with a flurry of boundar-
ies.
	 Between his playing 
and coaching careers, 
Thorpe spent nearly 30 
years as a key part of the 
England set-up.
	 Thorpe’s skill was 
developed on the club 
grounds of Surrey, the 
county he would go on to 
represent throughout his 
entire first-class career 
from 1988 to 2005.
	 On his England debut 
against Australia in 1993 
he scored a second-in-
nings 114 not out, having 
come in with the hosts in 
a precarious position.
	 It was a clear sign of 
what was to come.
	 Thorpe, who hit 2,380 

runs in 82 one-day in-
ternationals, would go 
on to score 6,744 runs in 
100 Tests at an average of 
44.66, with 16 hundreds.
	 He scored a swash-
buckling 200 not out, his 
highest Test score, from 
231 balls against New 
Zealand in 2002, having 
dug in for 118 from 301 
against Pakistan in La-
hore 16 months earlier 
- a knock containing just 
two boundaries.
	 Fearless against pace 
and one of England’s 
best against spin, Thorpe 
averaged 45.17 at home, 
47.85 in Asia and 48.18 in 
Australia - a player for all 
situations.
	 Ask his former captain 
Nasser Hussain to rank 
England’s best players 
of that era and Thorpe’s 
name would be near the 
top, if not number one, in 
the list.
	 “When people reel off 
the list of England greats, 
he seems to slip people’s 
minds, but he was a man 
for a crisis, for a battle,” 
Hussain said in 2021.
	 Thorpe was the stern-
faced rock in a batting 
line-up that faltered all 
too often - the one En-
gland fans could usually 
rely on.
	 In one of that side’s 
greatest victories, against 
Pakistan in Karachi in 
2000, it was Thorpe who 

hit the winning runs in 
the gloom, ending 64 not 
out.
	 He was also a fine 
fielder and particularly 
accomplished in the slips.
	 But it was not all suc-
cess.
	 After he had previous-
ly missed tours because 
of the challenges of life 
on the road, Thorpe’s 
first marriage publicly 
broke down in 2002.
	 He subsequently took 
an indefinite break from 
cricket and, despite ini-
tially making himself 
available, pulled out of 
England’s 2002-03 Ashes 
squad to face Australia.
	 Thorpe would miss 
more than a year at in-
ternational level, but he 
returned with what he 
described as his finest in-
nings.
	 After being recalled in 
2003 for the final Test of 
the summer at the Oval, 
he scored 124 in the first 
innings against South Af-
rica.
	 In typically composed 
style he held his arms 
aloft and punched the 
air after reaching three 
figures, his home crowd 
giving an emotional, ex-
tended ovation from the 
stands.
	 “There were times 
when I thought I wasn’t 
going to play again and 
more importantly I had 

to wipe away the memo-
ry of how I walked away 
from cricket last year,” 
he said afterwards.
	 “I didn’t want to leave 
cricket like that, and you 
couldn’t have written it 
better to get a century on 
your home ground.”
	 That innings marked 
the start of a resurgence 
for Thorpe in the latter 
years of his career.
	 After his recall, he 
scored 1,635 runs at 56.37 
as England’s fortunes im-
proved under new cap-
tain Michael Vaughan.
	 Thorpe hit five cen-
turies in that period, in-
cluding one packed with 
his trademark grit, bat-
ting with a broken finger 
against West Indies.
	 He played his 100th 
Test against Bangladesh 
early in the 2005 season, 
but it proved to be his 
last.
	 Having played in five 
unsuccessful Ashes se-
ries, Thorpe was left out 
when Vaughan’s side 
famously won back the 

urn in 2005, the young-
er batting options of Ian 
Bell and Kevin Pietersen 
preferred.
	 After retiring that 
summer, Thorpe began 
coaching in Australia 
with New South Wales.
	 He soon returned to 
work with Surrey and by 
2010 was again involved 
in the England set-up, as 

batting coach of the de-
velopment Lions side be-
fore moving up to assist 
the senior men’s side.
	 He left his role as as-
sistant coach in February 
2022 after a 4-0 Ashes 
defeat in Australia, but 
also had been part of the 
backroom team for En-
gland’s 50-over World 
Cup win in 2019.

Atletico Madrid have 
agreed an £81.5m deal 
to sign Manchester City 
forward Julian Alvarez.
The fee is made up of an 
initial £64.4m (75m eu-
ros) with a further £17.1m 
(20m euros) in potential 
add-ons.
	 It would be a record 
sale for City, surpassing 
the £50m Chelsea paid 
for Raheem Sterling in 
2022.
Alvarez said he  would 
wait until Argentina’s 
involvement in the 2024 
Olympics football end-

ed  before making a de-
cision on his future. The 
team were knocked out 
by hosts France last Fri-
day.
	 City manager Pep 
Guardiola had been keen 
to keep the 24-year-old, 
and said earlier in Au-
gust he “counted” on Al-
varez before the start of 
the season.
	 “I count on him, but he 
said in the news that deci-
sions will be made all to-
gether,” said Guardiola.
	 But, as has been the 
case in the past with 

Ilkay Gundogan, Riyad 
Mahrez and Aymeric 
Laporte, City will not 
stand in the way of a 
player who wants to 
leave.
	 Atletico, who have 
also agreed a deal to 
sign Chelsea midfielder 
Conor Gallagher, are yet 
to agree personal terms 
with Alvarez.
	 The Argentine, 
who joined City in 2022 in 
a £14.1m deal from River 
Plate, has scored 36 goals 
in 106 appearances for 
Guardiola’s side.

BW SPORT

Leading England batsman 
Graham Thorpe dead at 55

n Doughty left-hander enjoyed stellar careeer for county and country

Thorpe scored 21,937 first-class runs for Surrey and England

ON TARGET: Julian Alverez has been Manchester City’s third highest scorer 
in all competitions since signing for the club in 2022

Alvarez off to Atleti
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PUB & RESTAURANT:
116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 451-1402
Happy Hour Mon-Fri. 4-7

(food specials)
SHOPPE:

132 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 394-8765
Open 10am-6pm

Thurs/Fri/Sun: 10am-7pm
Sat: 10am-8pm

Sat 8/10 Community Shield: 
7am Man Utd vs Man City 
Womens Olympic Final:

8am Brazil vs USA
Wed 8/14 UEFA Super Cup: 

Noon Real Madrid vs Atalanta
Fri. 8/16 English Premier League:

Noon: Man Utd vs Fulham
Sat. 8/17 English Premier League:
9.30: West Ham vs Aston Villa

Sun 8/18 English Premier League:
8.30am: Chelsea vs Man City

Mon 8/19 English Premier League:
Noon: Leicester vs Spurs

BRITISH ATHLETICS 
has a new golden girl 
and her name is Keely 
Hodgkinson.
	 On a steamy night in 
northern Paris on Mon-
day, the 800m star did not 
just live up to her billing 
as a gold medal certainty, 
she did so with a genera-
tional performance.
	 The 22-year-old Lan-
cashire flyer lit up the 
City of Light with a re-
markable performance 
securing Team GB’s first 
Olympic gold medal in 
athletics for eight years 
while upgrading the sil-
ver she bagged in Tokyo 
in 2020.
	 Wigan-born Keely has 
now emulated her hero 
Dame Kelly Holmes who 
won 800m and 1,500m 
gold in an unforgettable 
Athens Olympics double 
20 years ago.
	 Leading from start to 
finish, Keely made light 
work of the two-lap race 
and on crossing the line 
sobbed after realising her 
life’s dream.
	 She said: “I have 
worked so hard for this 
and you could see how 
much it meant to me 
when I crossed the line. I 
am the Olympic champi-
on for the next four years 
and no one can take that 
away from me.”
	 Draped in a Union 
flag, she sought out her 
emotional mum and dad, 
Dean and Rachel, in the 
crowd at the Stade de 
France.
	 She went to the front 
with just over 500m left, 
and dictated matters until 
crossing the line in 1min 
56.72secs, comfortably 
ahead of Ethiopia’s Tsige 
Duguma and Kenya’s 
Mary Moraa. In fact, she 
dictated matters from the 
off.
	 As she pulled away in 
the home straight, Hod-
gkinson even had time to 

look up at the giant screen 
to see her epic finish in all 
its cinematic glory.
	 Then came the emotion, 
then came the celebra-
tions.
	 The smiling blonde, 
who describes herself as 
a “risk-taker with a rebel-
lious stride”, now has the 
world at her feet.
	 Among the many 
wanting to embrace her 
was Lord Coe, the double 
Olympic champion over 
1500m who gathered two 
silvers at 800m to boot. 
	 He is an all-time great 
of middle-distance run-
ning and that is what 
Hodgkinson will now 
surely become.
	 Such is her self-belief, 
though, such is her talent, 
Hodgkinson might even 
think about doubling up 
with the 1500m.
	 But that is all to come. 
In a city made for this 
most stylish of athletes, 
the youngster will enjoy 
this magnificent feat for 
now. 

Cycling gold
	 There was also joy for 
Team GB on a night of 
high drama at a blister-
ingly hot Saint Quen-
tin-en-Yvelines velo-
drome, where the female 
track cycling sprint trio 
of Katy Marchant, Sophie 
Capewell and Emma Fi-
nucane, who set a world 
record in qualifying, 
then sealed gold and an-
other new world record 
cheered on by Sophie, 
Duchess of Edinburgh.
	 The victory was par-
ticularly emotional for 
Capewell, 25, whose dad 
Nigel came fourth in 
Paralympic track cycling 
at Atlanta 1996 and Syd-
ney 2000. He passed away 
in 2021.
	 On the water Joe Clarke, 
31, grabbed silver in the 
men’s canoe slalom while 
reigning world champion 

Keely’s just golden!

Kimberley Woods, 28, 
snatched a bronze in the 
women’s equivalent to go 
with her earlier kayak sla-
lom third place finish.
	 In an event making its 
Olympic debut Clarke, 
overlooked for Tokyo 
2020, had to settle for sec-
ond after missing out on 
a medal in the men’s kay-
ak single final. He said: 
“I came here for gold. 
I’ve got silver, which I’m 
very proud of. What a 
Games.” 

triathlon bronze
	 Earlier, defending 
champions Britain were 
forced to settle for bronze 
in the triathlon mixed 
team relay after initially 
being announced as sil-
ver medallists following 
a photo finish with the 
USA. Amid chaos and 
confusion after a thrilling 
race lasting 1hr 25 mins 
and 39 seconds, the Team 
GB quartet of Alex Yee, 
Georgia Taylor-Brown, 
Samuel Dickinson and 
Beth Potter were down-
graded after officials re-
viewed the photo finish.
	 The podium place was 
a third triathlon medal for 
Team GB at the Games 
after individual gold for 
Yee and bronze for Potter.

BW SPORT/PARIS 2024

n Lancashire flyer ends Team GB’s long 
wait for Olympic athletics gold with 

dominating performance in 800m
ON TOP OF THE WORLD: 

Keely  Hodgkinson takes gold 
in Paris on Monday night


