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GREED, dishonesty and complacency put Grenfell Tow-
er on a “path to disaster” that ended with the tragic loss 
of 72 lives, a damning report has declared.
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GRENFELL: 72 KILLED BY ‘DISHONESTY, 
INDIFFERENCE AND COMPLACENCY’

n Damning report exposes ‘path to disaster’ that turned Grenfell Tower into death trap

	 After a seven-year in-
quiry found decades of 
wrongdoing, failures 
and negligence prior 
to the inferno, Sir Keir 
Starmer apologized on 
behalf of the state. 
	 The Prime Minister 
admitted that victims 
and their families were 
“let down very badly” 
before, during and after 
the London tower block 
blaze fire in 2017.
	 But despite the re-
port’s hard-hitting find-
ings, bereaved relatives 
still face a long fight for 
justice, since any crimi-
nal prosecutions are un-
likely to start for at least 
18 months.
	 Yvette Williams, from 
campaign group Jus-
tice4Grenfell, said: “The 
wheels of justice turn 
very slowly, especially 
when communities like 
ours are the victims and 
the perpetrators are the 
wealthy and powerful.
	 “We cannot under-
stand why the police 
need another 18 months 
when they have all the 
forensic evidence they 
need from the tower and 
should have been gath-
ering evidence from the 
inquiry along the way.”
	 The painstaking in-

vestigation by retired 
judge Sir Martin Moore-
Bick into the horror on 
June 14, 2017 declared 
that every one of the 72 
deaths could have been 
prevented.

‘badly failed’
	 His 1,700-page report 
detailed failures by ar-
chitects, refurbishment 
firms, regulators, the lo-
cal council and different 
governments.
	 Sir Martin said: 
“Those who lived in the 
tower were badly failed 
over a number of years 
and in a number of dif-
ferent ways by those 
who were responsible 
for ensuring the safety 
of the building and its 
occupants.”
	 He named architects 
Studio E, principal con-
tractor Rydon Mainte-
nance and some of its 
sub-contractors, includ-
ing Harley Curtain Wall, 
which became Harley 
Facades.
	 The report also crit-
icized the tenant man-
agement group, makers 
of Grenfell’s cladding 
and officials who certi-
fied its suitability for use 
on high-rises. Sir Martin 
said: “Not all of them 

bear the same degree 
of responsibility for the 
eventual disaster but…
all contributed to it in 
one way or another, in 
most cases through in-
competence but in some 
cases through dishones-
ty and greed.”
	 He said that no one 
involved in the design 
of external walls or the 
choice of materials, such 
as Studio E, “acted in ac-
cordance with the stan-
dards of a reasonably 
competent person in 
their position”. The firm 
had a “cavalier attitude” 
to fire safety regulations 
while Rydon and Har-
ley relied on experience 
rather than technical 
analysis or expertise.

‘dishonest scheme’
	 There were emotion-
al scenes as Sir Martin 
addressed the bereaved 
and survivors at Dor-
land House, West Lon-
don.
	 The inquiry’s sev-
en-volume findings 
showed people in po-
sitions of responsibility 
did not heed or act on 
warnings from earlier 
blazes. A year before 
Grenfell, the then-Tory 
government was “well 

aware” of the risks of 
combustible cladding 
and insulation, particu-
larly in high-rises, “but 
failed to act”.
	 A drive to cut red tape 
years before meant that 
safety fears were “ig-
nored, delayed or dis-
regarded” despite the 
Lakanal House fire that 
killed six in Camberwell 
in 2009.
	 Three companies 
were subject to partic-
ularly heavy criticism: 
Cladding firm Arcon-
ic “concealed from the 
market the true extent 
of the danger” of using 
its product, particularly 
on high-rises; Kingspan, 
which “knowingly cre-
ated a false market in in-

sulation” for buildings 
over 60ft high and  Ce-
lotex, which wanted to 
tap into that market, 
“embarked on a dishon-
est scheme to mislead its 
customers”.
	 Sir Martin said: “One 
very significant reason 
why Grenfell Tower 
came to be clad in com-
bustible materials was 
systematic dishonesty 
on the part of those who 
made and sold the rain-
screen cladding panels 
and insulation.” The 
blaze was “the culmina-
tion of decades of failure 
by central government 
and other bodies in po-
sitions of responsibility 
in the construction in-
dustry to look carefully 

into the danger of incor-
porating combustible 
materials into the ex-
ternal walls of high-rise 
residential buildings”.
	 Sir Keir now aims to 
stop firms involved in 
the disaster from re-
ceiving government 
contracts. He said it was 
“imperative that there 
is full accountability, 
including through the 
criminal justice process, 
and that this happens as 
swiftly as possible”.
	 Baroness Theresa 
May, the Prime Min-
ister at the time of the 
disaster, said national 
and local government, 
regulators and industry 
“must all acknowledge 
their part”.

NOWHERE TO ESCAPE: “Those who lived in the tower were badly 
failed over a number of years,” the official report said this week 
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News from Britain

The mother of one of 
Britain’s youngest crim-
inals involved in last 
month’s riots has been 
summonsed by a judge 
after missing her 12-year-
old son’s court appear-
ance to go on holiday to 
Ibiza.
	 District Judge Joanne 

Hirst told Manchester 
Magistrates’ Court she 
was ‘frankly astonished’ 
that the boy’s mother had 
decided to fly abroad for a 
five-day sunshine break, 
with her son due in court 
having admitted two 
counts of violent disorder.
	 Judge Hirst adjourned 

sentencing of the boy and 
ordered a parental sum-
mons so the mother must 
appear before the court to 
explain herself.
	 The youngster, who 
was accompanied to court 
by his uncle, had earlier 
admitted being part of a 
mob that attacked a bus 

THE wife of a   Conser-
vative councillor has ad-
mitted sending a social 
media message stirring 
up racial hatred against 
asylum seekers on the 
day of the Southport at-
tacks.
	 Lucy Connolly, who 
is married to West 
N o r t h a m p t o n s h i r e 
councillor Raymond 
Connolly, pleaded 
guilty at Northampton 
Crown Court on Mon-
day to a charge of incit-
ing racial hatred by pub-
lishing and distributing 
“threatening or abusive” 
written material on 
Twitter/X.
	 Details of the offence 
were not opened by the 
prosecutor in the case 
but a previous hearing 
was told the 41-year-
old childminder posted 

a message which read: 
“Mass deportation now, 
set fire to all the f****** 
hotels full of the bas-
tards for all I care… If 
that makes me racist, so 
be it.”
	 Connolly, of Parkfield 
Avenue, Northampton, 
entered her guilty plea 
via a video-link to HMP 
Peterborough during a 
hearing lasting just sev-
en minutes.

‘racist mindset’
	 Connolly spoke only 
to enter her plea and 
confirm that she could 
hear the judge.
	 Adjourning Connol-
ly’s case for sentence 
at Birmingham Crown 
Court on October 17, 
Judge Adrienne Lucking 
KC told her the ordering 
of pre-sentence reports 

was no indication of the 
likely sentence.
	 The judge said the case 
was being transferred to 
Birmingham to avoid 
any potential appear-
ance of bias given Con-
nolly’s husband held a 
political post in the local 
area.
	 Judge Lucking told 
Connolly: “Sentencing 
will entirely be a matter 
for the judge on the next 
occasion but it’s likely to 
be a substantial custodi-
al sentence.
	 “In the meantime, you 
are remanded in custo-
dy.”
	 A father-of-three was 
jailed at Northampton 
Crown Court for 38 
months on August 9 
after re-posting part of 
Connolly’s Twitter/X 
message.

	 Tyler Kay, 26, of Ell-
field Court, Northamp-
ton, admitted a charge 
of publishing material 
intended to stir up ra-
cial hatred.
	 Passing sentence on 
Kay after he pleaded 
guilty, Judge Lucking 
told him: “You posted 
as you did because you 
thought there were no 

consequences for your-
self from stirring up ra-
cial hatred in others.
	 “The overall tone of 
the posts clearly re-
veals your fundamen-
tally racist mindset.
	 “I am sure that when 
you intentionally cre-
ated the posts you in-
tended that racial ha-
tred would be stirred 

up by your utterly 
repulsive, racist and 
shocking posts that 
have no place in a ci-
vilised society.”
	 Connolly issued an 
apology for her Twit-
ter/X post before her 
arrest last month, say-
ing she had acted on 
“false and malicious” 
information.

Tory councillor’s wife facing 
‘substantial’ jail term for urging 

attacks on asylum seekers 

Lucy Connolly, who pled guilty guilty to inciting racial hatred, is 
married to West Northamptonshire councillor Raymond Connolly

outside a hotel housing 
asylum seekers in Man-
chester on July 31.
	 Days later on August 3, 
in Manchester city centre, 
he was part of a group 
filmed kicking the win-
dows of a vape shop and 
throwing a missile at a po-
lice van.
	 Dozens of towns and 
cities saw violence erupt 
following the killing of 
three young girls at a Tay-
lor Swift themed dance 
class in Southport on July 
29.

‘serious situation’
	 District Judge Hirst 
was told the boy’s moth-
er was not present, hav-
ing booked a holiday in 
July and gone abroad on 
Sunday and was only 
due to fly back to the UK 
on Thursday, missing his 
sentencing hearing on 
Monday.
	 She thanked the boy’s 
uncle for accompanying 
his nephew to court in 
his mother’s absence, but 
added: ‘One day before 
the hearing we find out 
the mum has gone on hol-
iday and is not with her 
son who played a great-

er part in the recent civil 
disorder than any adult 
or child I’ve seen coming 
through these courts.
	 ‘I’m frankly astonished.
	 ‘I will require a full ex-
planation from mum on 
her decision to go on hol-
iday one day before her 
12-year-old son comes to 
court facing a potential 
custodial sentence.
	 ‘This is a serious situa-
tion, it has now deteriorat-
ed in my view because of 
the actions of the mother.
	 ‘She is on notice, I will 
be challenging her about 
this decision.’
	 Addressing the boy as 
she adjourned sentencing 
to September 11, Judge 
Hirst told him: ‘Boys like 
you need their mums in 
their lives. I need your 
mum here.’
	 In a separate hearing in 
the same court, a 16-year-
old boy was told he was 
being given ‘the biggest 
chance in your life’ by 
Judge Hirst, who decid-
ed to pass a referral order 
rather than jail the young-
ster.
	 The teenager, accompa-
nied by his mother, had 
admitted violent disorder 

by throwing a bottle at a 
police horse during wi-
descale trouble in Bolton 
town centre last month.
	 The court heard the 
youngster’s father had 
died and his mother, 
who accompanied him to 
court, was having treat-
ment for cancer.
	 He was asked by the 
judge: ‘What were you 
thinking?’
	 The boy replied: ‘I was 
not really thinking any-
thing. We came into town 
and everything just erupt-
ed. Adrenaline. I’m dis-
gusted with myself.’
	 The youngster’s moth-
er told the court: ‘He’s 
frightened to death of go-
ing to prison. I think this 
has been a massive wake-
up call.’
	 The judge warned the 
youngster he had nar-
rowly avoided custody 
and instead gave him a 
12-month referral order 
with intensive supervi-
sion and a curfew.
	 She added: ‘It was 
mindless violence. I’m go-
ing to give you a chance. 
This is the biggest chance 
in your life that you will 
get.’

Judge ‘astonished’ as mum 
misses 12-year-old son’s court 
date - to jet off for Ibiza holiday
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Six children and a preg-
nant woman are among 
at least 12 people who 
died this week after a 
boat carrying dozens of 
asylum seekers to the 
UK was “ripped open” 
in one of the worst 
Channel tragedies since 
the small boats crisis 
began.
	 In a major test for Keir 
Starmer’s government, 
which is facing demands 
from charities to  open 
up safe routes  for those 
wanting to come to the 
UK, the French authori-
ties said that 10 of those 
who had lost their lives 
were female and many 
are believed to be from 
Eritrea.
	 The French interior 
minister, Gérald Darm-
anin, said more than 50 
people had been rescued 
including two who are 
in a critical condition 
from the “terrible ship-
wreck” off Cap Gris-Nez 

on Tuesday morning. 
Only eight of the 70 pas-
sengers were wearing 
lifejackets, according to 
French officials.
	 The incident, in which 
everyone on board was 
plunged into the sea, is 
believed to have caused 
the second highest num-
ber of fatalities to befall 
people while attempting 
to reach the UK since the 
small boats crisis began.
	 After the latest fatali-
ties, the prime minister is 
facing calls to open legal 
routes so that potential 
refugees are not forced 
to take such desperate 
journeys before claim-
ing asylum in the UK. In 
a further development, 
Darmanin called for a 
new migration treaty to 
be negotiated between 
the UK and EU to ease 
the path for asylum 
seekers.
	 The UK home secre-
tary, Yvette Cooper, de-

scribed the incident as 
“horrifying and deeply 
tragic”, as she said “vi-
tal” efforts to dismantle 
“dangerous and crimi-
nal smuggler gangs” and 
to boost border security 
“must proceed apace”.
	 Cooper said she was 
in touch with the French 
government and was be-
ing kept updated on the 
situation.
	  “Our hearts go out 
to the loved ones of all 
those who have lost their 
lives and all those who 
have been seriously in-
jured,” she said.
	 The French authori-
ties were called to the 
incident when a dinghy 
was reported to have got 
into trouble off Le Portel 
on the northern French 
coast, about 28 miles 
south-west of Calais.
	 All of the people on 
board ended up in the 
water, many of whom 
were not wearing life-

jackets, according to the 
French coastguard. It 
is understood the ship-
wreck took place in 
French waters and UK 
search and rescue ves-
sels are on standby.
	 The Boulogne-sur-
Mer prosecutor Guirec 
Le Bras said that at least 
12 people died – includ-

ing six minors and 10 
females. He added that 
those killed were “pri-
marily of Eritrean ori-
gin”, but that officials 
“do not have consoli-
dated details that would 
allow us to specify the 
exact nationalities”.
	 Frédéric Cuvillier, the 
mayor of Boulogne-sur-

Mer, told the BBC that 
a pregnant woman was 
among the victims.
	 In the past week more 
than 2,000 people seek-
ing asylum have arrived 
in the UK on small boats. 
More than 600 arrived 
on 28 August in 10 boats, 
while 351 arrived on 2 
September in six vessels.

12 asylum seekers dead as 
boat ‘ripped open’ in Channel  

More than 2,000 people have arrived in the UK on small boats this week 

The UK has defended 
its decision to suspend 
some arms sales to Isra-
el Benjamin Netanya-
hu called the decision 
“shameful”.
	 The Israeli Prime Min-
ister posted on social me-
dia that the decision “will 
only embolden Hamas”.
	 But Husam Zomlot, 
the Palestinians’ top en-
voy to the UK, called the 
partial ban an “important 
first step” to the UK’s ful-
filment of its “legal obli-
gations under domestic 
and international law”.
	 On Monday, the UK 
suspended around 30 out 
of 350 weapons export li-
cences to Israel.
	 But Defence Secretary 
John Healey insisted the 
UK remained a “staunch 
ally” of Israel, and in-
sisted Israel’s security 
would not be weakened 
by the decision.
	 Government ministers 
say the weapons could 
be used in Gaza to violate 
international law. 
	 Human rights group 

Amnesty International 
UK said the measures 
were “too limited”. 
	 Others have criticised 
the timing of the an-
nouncement for coming 
on the same day funerals 
took place for six hostag-
es killed by Hamas last 
week.
	 Mr Healey told report-
ers it was “agonising” 
seeing the faces of the 
dead hostages, but said 
the timing was “driven 
by the fact that this was 
a legal process” and the 
need to report to Parlia-
ment.
	 Foreign Secretary 
David Lammy said on 
Monday  the suspension 
would affected equip-
ment such as parts for 
fighter jets, helicopters 
and drones.
	 Mr Healey said these 
were chosen because 
they supplement equip-
ment used in Gaza for 
“offensive purposes”, 
while the “vast majority 
of other parts our coun-
try exports to Israel are 

either not related to the 
conflict or maybe used 
for Israel’s defence”.
	 UK arms sales to Israel 
are small in comparison 
to other allies, contribut-
ing just 1% of the coun-
try’s defence imports.
	 The UK exports arms 
to multiple countries in-
cluding Ukraine, Saudi 
Arabia and Turkey.
	 The US is by far the 
largest supplier of arms 
to Israel, accounting for 
69% of its imports of ma-
jor conventional arms 
between 2019 and 2023, 
according to the Stock-
holm International Peace 
Research Institute.
	 In a statement, Mr 
Zomlot said that the Pal-
estinian Mission to the 
UK would “continue 
working” with the UK 
government towards a 
“full arms embargo”.
	 Amnesty International 
UK accused the govern-
ment of “gesture poli-
tics”, given less than 10% 
of arms export licences 
were suspended. 

UK defends Israel arms cut
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A 14-year-old boy has 
been charged with the 
murder of an 80-year-
old man in a park.
	 Bhim Kohli died on 
Monday after an attack at 
Franklin Park in Braun-
stone Town, Leicester-
shire, while walking his 
dog on Sunday.
	 The youth, who cannot 
be named for legal rea-
sons, has been remanded 
into custody.
	 A post-mortem exam-
ination showed Mr Kohli 

had died of a neck inju-
ry from a large bladed 
weapon.
	 Paying tribute earli-
er on Wednesday, Mr 
Kohli’s family said “our 
hearts have been com-
pletely broken”.
	 They added: “Bhim was 
a loving husband, dad 
and grandad. He was 
also a son, brother and 
uncle.
	 “He adored his grand-
kids with all his heart 
and loved spending time 

with them. He really was 
such a loving, caring 
person whose life was 
centred around his fam-
ily.
	 “He has always been a 
very hardworking man 
and even at the age of 80 
he was still very active.
	 “One of his great pas-
sions was his allotment, 
he would go every day 
to tend to his plots and 
was so proud of them. 
He also enjoyed walking 
the family dog Rocky on 

the park many times a 
day.
	 “Bhim loved to laugh. 
He was always very 
happy and talkative, the 
joker of the family and 
always loved to out-
smart us with a smile.”
	 Four other children 
who were arrested in 
connection with the at-
tack were released with 
no further action.
	 Andrew Baxter, deputy 
chief crown prosecutor 
for the Crown Prosecu-

The Danger Mouse writ-
er Brian Trueman has 
died at the age of 92.
	 His son Jonathan an-
nounced the death in a 
Facebook post, saying he 
died in Stepping Hill hos-
pital in Stockport on Sun-
day night “after a short 
illness”.
	 “If you knew him, 
we’re sure you’ll appre-
ciate that he wouldn’t 
want a sentimental trib-
ute here,” he said. “But 
we’re equally sure that, 
if you knew him, you’ll 
know just how much he’ll 
be missed.”
	 Trueman spent 20 
years at Granada TV and 
while there he wrote and 
presented the TV series 

OASIS fans were left 
frustrated and infuriat-
ed in equal measure this 
week after a ticketing fi-
asco which has prompt-
ed Sir Keir Starmer to 
promise the Govern-
ment will get a “grip” 
on “surge pricing”.
	 His invention follows 
hundreds of complaints 
from the rockers’ fans.
	 Standard tickets 
more than doubled in 
price from £148 to £355 
on Ticketmaster, which 
admitted they reflected 
high levels of demand. 

It said prices were set by 
the “event organiser, ac-
cording to their market 
value”.
	 An estimated 14 mil-
lion people spent Satur-
day battling to secure 
their chance to see broth-
ers Noel and Liam Gal-
lagher on stage during 
next year’s 17-date tour, 
which is now sold out.
	 The Prime Minister 
said: “This is really im-
portant, because this 
isn’t just an Oasis prob-
lem. This is a problem 
for tickets for all sorts of 

events, where people go 
online straight away…
and within seconds 
sometimes, sometimes 
minutes, all the tickets 
are gone, and the prices 
start going through the 
roof, which means many 
people can’t afford it.
	 “You have to stop 
that. We’re consulting 
on that.
	 “I do think there are a 
number of things that we 
can do and we should 
do, because otherwise 
you get to the situation 
where families simply 

can’t go, or are absolute-
ly spending a fortune on 
tickets. So we’ll grip this 
and make sure that actu-
ally tickets are available 
at a price that people can 
actually afford.”
	 Culture Secretary 
Lisa Nandy called the 
saga “incredibly de-
pressing”.
	 Ms Nandy said: “This 
Government is commit-
ted to putting fans back 
at the heart of music. So 
we will include issues 
around the transparency 
and use of dynamic pric-

ing, including the tech-
nology around queuing 
systems which incentiv-
ise it, in our forthcoming 
consultation on consum-
er protections fort re-
sales.”
	 Minister Lucy Pow-
ell says she was among 
those hit by dynamic 
pricing, buying two tick-
ets for £350 each for Hea-
ton Park in July, origi-
nally quoted at £148.50, 
not including a £2.75 
booking fee.
	 Fans said the “in 
demand” pricing was 

“sickening” and “scan-
dalous”. Before the fu-
rore, the Government 
had vowed to “bring in 
protections to stop peo-
ple being ripped off by 
touts”. 
	 There has also been 
concern about non-of-
ficial sellers Viago-
go, which had a seat 
at Wembley listed at 
£5,289.
	 The secondary seller 
defended the practice 
saying fans sell the tick-
ets and “resale is legal in 
the UK”.

Tributes flow for Danger Mouse creator

Cinema and conceived, 
produced, wrote and pre-
sented House for the Fu-
ture.
	 However, he was best 
known for his work writ-
ing for the animation 

company Cosgrove Hall 
Films, particularly Chorl-
ton and the Wheelies, 
some of the scripts for 
Count Duckula, and the 
original Danger Mouse 
episodes, which were 

voiced by Sir David Jason.
	 Cosgrove Hall Films 
Archive paid tribute to 
Trueman on Instagram, 
saying: “We’re very sad 
to hear of the passing of 
Brian Trueman.

	 “For many years Bri-
an worked for Cosgrove 
Hall Films as writer, voice 
actor and narrator.
	 “Brian’s writing and 
humour had the unique 
ability to appeal to both 

adults and children, 
which contributed to the 
success of Cosgrove Hall 
series such as Danger 
Mouse, The Wind in the 
Willows, Jamie and the 
Magic Torch.”

Brian Trueman, who was best known for his animation 
work, enjoyed a long and productive career at Granada TV

Brian Trueman: a talented British creator of entertainment for adults and children. (above): Danger Mouse and sidekick Penfold 

tion Service, said: “The 
CPS  has reviewed a file 
of evidence from Leices-
tershire Police and has 
authorised a charge 
of murder against a 
14-year-old boy in rela-
tion to the death of Bhim 

Sen Kohli.
	 “The Crown Prosecu-
tion Service reminds all 
concerned that criminal 
proceedings against this 
defendant are now ac-
tive and that the youth 
has a right to a fair trial.”

KNIFE CRIME BRITAIN: Boy charged 
with murder of 84 year-old dog walker

Bhim Kohli: ‘loving husband, dad and grandad’

Fans look back in anger over Oasis ticket fiasco
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A new street in Prague 
has been named after 
Sir Nicholas Winton, the 
British man who helped 
save hundreds of mostly 
Jewish children from the 
Nazis.
	 On Sunday four of 
them – now in their 80s 
and 90s – attended a cere-
mony for the street, which 
runs past a small train sta-
tion from where tens of 
thousands of Czechoslo-
vak Jews were deported 
during the Holocaust.
	 It coincided with the 
85th anniversary of the 
last planned Kindertrans-
port journey from Prague, 
which was prevented 
from departing due to the 
outbreak of World War 
Two.
	 “This was my passport 
to freedom,” said Lady 
Milena Grenfell-Baines, 
clutching a document the 
size of a birthday card.
	 The card, slightly yel-
lowed with age, showed 
that Milena Fleischmann 
(her maiden name), aged 
nine, was granted leave 
by His Majesty’s Govern-
ment to enter the United 
Kingdom.
	 A photo of a cheer-
ful girl wearing a smart, 
white-collared shirt was 
stuck to the front. The re-
verse was stamped with a 
swastika.
	 Clutching this docu-

ment, and with a name 
tag hung around her 
neck, Milena travelled 
by train across Nazi Ger-
many, watching over her 
three-year-old sister, Eva.
	 From there, they and 
dozens of other unaccom-
panied Jewish children 
crossed into Holland, be-
fore boarding a boat for 
England.
	 “We were all given 
cups of tea with milk. 
Nobody had ever had tea 
with milk. We all poured 
it out,” she said.

‘no eyewitnesses’
	 Eventually Milena and 
Eva were reunited with 
their parents, who also 
managed to escape. The 
Fleischmanns were the 
lucky ones. Many of their 
friends and relatives were 
not.
	 “I think it’s so import-
ant, because very soon, 
no eyewitnesses will be 
here anymore,” Milena, a 
youthful 94, told the BBC.
	 She spoke sitting on 
a chair on the same rail-
way platform where tens 
of thousands of Czecho-
slovak Jews were herded 
onto trains bound for the 
Theresienstadt ghetto. 
Most would later be mur-
dered at Auschwitz.
	 The station – Praha 
Bubny – has since been 
transformed into a me-

morial, and a much 
larger, modern station 
is being built nearby. A 
path for pedestrians and 
cyclists running beneath 
the tracks will from now 
on be known as Nicholas 
Winton Street.
	 “People need to re-
member why that street 
is called Nicholas Winton 
Street,” Milena went on. 
“Because there is a big 
generation – thanks to 
him – alive today.”
	 She and three other 
‘children’ were brought 
to Prague to attend the 
ceremony organised by 
the Association of Jewish 
Refugees (AJR).
	 “In remembering Sir 
Nicholas, we also hon-
our the parents who sent 
away their children to an 
uncertain future, as well 
as the foster families who 
gave sanctuary to the 
youngest victims of Nazi 
oppression,” said Michael 
Newman, head of the 
AJR.
	 Milena didn’t find out 
that the card – and there-
fore her survival – was 
largely the work of a 
29-year-old British stock-
broker until the 1980s, 
when the story appeared 
on the BBC programme 
That’s Life. 
	 In now legendary foot-
age, a speechless Winton 
, who was dubbed the 

“British Schindler” in 
reference to the German 
businessman whose ex-
ploits were immortalized 
in the film Schindler’s 
List,  was reunited with 
dozens of the then chil-
dren he had helped to 
save in the final months 
before the outbreak of 
war.
	 In subsequent inter-
views he was always at 
pains to stress the opera-
tion was a team effort. 

	 Apart from a month 
spent in Prague from 
Christmas 1938 to January 
1939, most of the work – 
badgering politicians and 
diplomats, finding foster 
families, sometimes creat-
ing fake documents - was 
done from the safety of 
his home in London.
	 He was knighted in 
2003 and died in 2015 at 
the age of 106.
	 Most of all, he remained 
haunted by the children 

he was unable to save.
	 Milena’s train was the 
eighth – and final – trans-
port to leave occupied 
Prague.
	 A ninth – the largest, 
carrying some 250 chil-
dren – was scheduled 
to leave on September 
1st, 1939. But war inter-
vened, and the train nev-
er left the station. All but 
a handful of the children 
are believed to have per-
ished.

Prague street is named in 
honor of ‘Britain’s Schindler’
n Sir Nicholas Winton saved hundreds of Jewish schoolchildren 

from almost certain death in the months leading up to WWII

A large mural of Sir Nicholas can be seen from the Prague street named after him. 
The British civil servan remained modest about his achievements to the end 
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Legal Notices

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition of Satjot 
Kaur Khalsa, an adult over the age 

of 18 years.

​Date: 10/11/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 
18 years of age: Satjot Kaur Khalsa. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) de-
sire to have their name changed from 

Satjot Kaur Khalsa to Christina 
Pam Jojo Santoscoy

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: May 13, 2024.
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SMCP00426
Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
400 Civic Center Plaza

Pomona CA 91766

In the Matter of the Petition of Cristi-
na Cervania Medina, an adult over 

the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/04/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 
18 years of age: Cristina Cervania 
Medina. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 

said petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from Cristina Cer-
vania Medina to Cristina Bautista 

Cervania

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 

copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: July 10, 2024.
Allison L. Westfahl Kong/Judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24PSCP00331
Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
300 East Olive Avenue

Burbank CA 91502

In the matter of In the Matter of the 
Petition of Solmaz Burak and Ali 
Burak, adults over the age of 18 

years, on behalf of 
Seyed Mohammad Daniel 

Moosavi Reyshahri, a minor under 
the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is un-
der 18 years of age: Seyed Moham-
mad Daniel  Moosavi Reyshahri. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have the name changed 
from Seyed Mohammad Daniel  

Moosavi Reyshahri to 
Daniel Burak

​Date: 10/04/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. B

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 9, 2024.
Robin Miller Sloan
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00441
Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1427 West Covina Parkway
West Covina CA 91790

In the Matter of the Petition of Wing 
Bun Tam, an adult over the age of 

18 years.

​Date: 10/11/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. 06 

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 

18 years of age: Wing Bun Tam. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Wing Bun Tam to Keith Tam

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-

titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: July 30, 2024.
Lynette Gridiron Winston/Judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24PSCP00360
Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition of Mary 
Beth Archie, an adult over the age 

of 18 years.

​Date: 10/04/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K Room A-203 

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 
18 years of age: Mary Beth Archie. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) de-
sire to have their name changed from 

Mary Beth Archie to Mimi Archie

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 9, 2024.
Lawrence Cho, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24SMCP00422
Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

150 West Commonwealth Avenue
Alhambra CA 91801

In the matter of In the Matter of the 
Petition of Adia Joelle Larkin and 
Kelvin Larkin, adults over the age 

of 18 years, on behalf of Quinn Sim-
one Noelle Larkin, a minor under 

the age of 18 years.

It appearing that the following person 

whose name is to be changed is un-
der 18 years of age: Quinn Simone 

Noelle Larkin. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have the 
name changed from Quinn Simone 

Noelle Larkin to Quinn Simone 
Noelle Larkin

​Date: 09/20/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. V

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 7, 2024.
Robin Miller Sloan
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00291
Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024144823. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Tacos El Barbas, 8611 
California Ave F, Southgate CA 90280. 
County: Los Angeles. Abigail Berenice 
Rosales Sevilla, 8611 California Ave F, 
Southgate CA 90280. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 01/2024. Signed: Abigail Bereni-
ce Rosales Sevilla, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/09/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024155133. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Create Something 
Amazing LLC, Diana Sabb Events & De-
signs LLC, CSA Studios, Oh Snap, 1000 
W 8th St 3306, Los Angeles CA 90017. 
County: Los Angeles. Create Something 
Amazing LLC. , 1000 W 8th St 3306, Los 
Angeles CA 90017. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 07/2024. Signed: Diana Sabb, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 07/24/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024162830. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Re-Up EV Charge 
Spot, 6400 Green Valley Circle 318, Cul-
ver City CA 90230. County: Los Angeles. 
Hyperspace Children’s Learning Zone LLC, 
6400 Green Valley Circle 318, Culver City 
CA 90230. State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Isa-Allena Corozone, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in 

the statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/02/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024163467. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Bear Cloud Coffee, 2108 
N St Ste N, Sacramento CA 95816. County: 
Sacramento. Bear Cloud Coffee LLC, 2108 
N St Ste N, Sacramento CA 95816. State 
of Organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Alan 
Zhou, manager. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/05/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Statement of Abandonment of Use of Ficti-
tious Business Name: 2024164194. Current 
file: 2021203542. The following person has 
abandoned the use of the fictitious business 
name: C J Massage Spa, 8702 N. Sepulve-
da Blvd. North Hills CA 91343. Linh Ly, 899 
E. San Felipe Hill, Azusa CA 91702. The 
fictitious business name referred to above 
was filed on: 09/13/2021, in the County of 
Los Angeles. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. Signed: Linh Ly, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 08/05/2024. Pub-
lished: 08/10/2024, 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024 
and 08/31/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024164221. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: C J Massage Spa, 8702 
N. Sepulveda Blvd. North Hills CA 91343. 
County: Los Angeles. Zuhui Liu, 8702 N. 
Sepulveda Blvd. North Hills CA 91343. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Zuhui Liu, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/05/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024164545. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Vial Market, Arcadia 
Vial Market, 1801 Flower Ave #B4, Duarte 
CA 91010. County: Los Angeles. Will And 
Petros LLC, 1801 Flower Ave #B4, Duarte 
CA 91010. State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Noha Isaac, member. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/06/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024166662. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Legacy Video Pros; 
Eyegate Productions, 10561 Limerick Ave., 
Los Angeles CA 91311. County: Los Ange-
les. Sean Garrett Taylor, 10561 Limerick 
Ave., Los Angeles CA 91311. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 01/2024. Signed: 
Sean Garrett Taylor, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 

County on: 08/08/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024166935. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Shine & Go Mobile Car 
Wash, 15717 Three Palms St, Hacienda 
Heights CA 91745. County: Los Angeles. 
Jose Eduardo Prieto, 15717 Three Palms 
St, Hacienda Heights CA 91745. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 
Jose Eduardo Prieto, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/08/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does not 
of itself authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state or com-
mon law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024166948. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Four Kings General Site 
Services, 19404 Leal Circle, Cerritos CA 
90703. County: Los Angeles.  Four Kings 
Pressure Washing LLC, 19404 Leal Circle, 
Cerritos CA 90703. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names list-
ed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: Adrian 
Ramos, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/08/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
20241667159. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Ace Skincare Mas-
sage Spa, 1381 E Las Tunas Dr #4, San 
Gabriel CA 91776. County: Los Angeles. Z 
& Z Beauty Spa Inc, 1381 E Las Tunas Dr 
#4, San Gabriel CA 91776. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Guangyue Zhao, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/08/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024167565. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Solutions Education 
Consulting, 16637 Tuba St, North Hills CA 
91343. County: Los Angeles. Melissa Mi-
chele Proctor, 16637 Tuba St, North Hills 
CA 91343. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Melissa Michele Proctor, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/08/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024167916. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Wynne Company, 1725 
Ocean Front Walk #430, Santa Monica CA 
90401. County: Los Angeles. Jeffrey Wyn-
ne, 1725 Ocean Front Walk #430, Santa 
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Monica CA 90401. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names list-
ed herein on: n/a. Signed: Jeffrey Wynne, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/09/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024168267. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Pure-Business, 
Pure-Business.Solutions, WickedMadness, 
WickedMadness Productions, 4242 Ken-
wood Avenue, Los Angeles CA 90037. 
County: Los Angeles. Pure Enterprise 
Group, Inc., 4242 Kenwood Avenue, Los 
Angeles CA 90037. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
07/2024. Signed: Tina Brown, CEO. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/09/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed pri-
or to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
202416393. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: S&E Heating And Air 
Conditioning, 12718 De Foe Ave, Sylmar 
CA 91342. County: Los Angeles. Francisco 
Javier Ortiz, 12718 De Foe Ave, Sylmar CA 
91342. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
08/2024. Signed: Francisco Javier Ortiz, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/09/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024168602. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: LG Management 
Group, 18641 Saticoy St Unit 1, Reseda CA 
91335. County: Los Angeles. Lilian B. Gal-
mez, 18641 Saticoy St Unit 1, Reseda CA 
91335. This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Lilian B. Galmez, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/12/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed pri-
or to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024168814. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Velvet Quill Pub-
lishing, 5832 S Chariton Ave, Los Ange-
les CA 90056. County: Los Angeles. JM 
James, LLC, 5832 S Chariton Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90056. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names list-
ed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Michelle 
James, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 

Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024168835. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: JK Market, 2501 
E 4th St, Los Angeles CA 90033. County: 
Los Angeles. Basuta Supermarket Inc, 204 
W Mission Rd #B, San Gabriel CA 91776. 
State of Incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: 
Jagtar Singh, President. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024168845. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: RMR Services, 6950 
Remmet Ave #4, Canoga Park CA 91303. 
County: Los Angeles. Marites Ramos 
Ramirez, 6950 Remmet Ave #4, Canoga 
Park CA 91303. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 01/2020. Signed: Marites Ramos 
Ramirez, owner.  Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024168882. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Dot Dash Write, Hitched 
Design Studio, 2415 Rockefeller Lane Unit 
A, Redondo Beach CA 90278. County: Los 
Angeles. IDHI LLC, 2415 Rockefeller Lane 
Unit A, Redondo Beach CA 90278. State of 
Organization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Laura Obagi, managing member.  
Registrant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/12/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed pri-
or to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024168919. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Flight Path Museum; 
Flight Path Museum LAX, 6661 W. Impe-
rial Hwy, Los Angeles CA 90045. County: 
Los Angeles. AI#ON: 1990244. Flight Path 
Leaning Center of Southern California, 6661 
W. Imperial Hwy, Los Angeles CA 90045. 
State of Incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 10/2003. Signed: 
Jean-Christophe Dick, President.  Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/12/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed pri-
or to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024169056. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: WeHo Testosterone 
Optimization, 8335 W Sunset Blvd., West 
Hollywood CA 90069. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 4786926. Matthew Montgomery, 
MD Inc., 9440 S Santa Monica Blvd, Ste 
301, Beverly Hills CA 90210. State of Incor-
poration: California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Matthew Mont-

gomery, President.  Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024169173. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: LA Builders Studio, 
17757 Saticoy St., Reseda CA 91335-3550. 
County: Los Angeles. LA Floor Covering 
Studio, Inc., 17757 Saticoy St., Reseda CA 
91335-3550. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Monserrat Mat-
loubian, President.  Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024169400. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Mi Ae Kim Therapy, 502 
S. Genesee Ave, Los Angeles CA 90036. 
County: Los Angeles. Mi Ae Kim, 502 S. 
Genesee Ave, Los Angeles CA 90036. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Mi Ae Kim, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024169860. The following person(s) is/are 
doing business as: Ladies Lounge; Siempre 
Permanent Jewelry, 14030 Lambert Rd, 
Whittier CA 90605. County: Los Angeles. 
Alissa Marie Mitchell, 14030 Lambert Rd, 
Whittier CA 90605. This business is con-
ducted by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 01/2019. Signed: Alissa Marie 
Mitchell, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/13/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024170230. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Roya Art Creations, 
32 Argonne Avenue #1, Long Beach CA 
90803. County: Los Angeles. Roya Tiziana 
Azali, 32 Argonne Avenue #1, Long Beach 
CA 90803. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2023. Signed: Roya Tiziana Azali, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/13/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024170251. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Sweetfarm, 11715 
S Manhattan Pl, Los Angeles CA 90047. 

County: Los Angeles. Sweetfarm LLC, 
11715 S Manhattan Pl, Los Angeles CA 
90047. State of Organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Joshua Granados, Presi-
dent. Registrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk of 
Los Angeles County on: 08/13/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. A new Fic-
titious Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name in vi-
olation of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024170919. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Grownow Los An-
geles, 3120 4th Street Apt 2, Santa Monica 
CA 90405. County: Los Angeles. Womack 
Coaching LLC, 3120 4th Street Apt 2, Santa 
Monica CA 90405. State of Organization: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Erin 
Womack, manager. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/14/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024171184. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: All-State Plastics, 
15352 Proctor Ave., City of Industry CA 
91745. County: Los Angeles. ASP Indus-
tries, Inc., 15352 Proctor Ave., City of In-
dustry CA 91745. State of Incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein on: 
11/1999. Signed: Patrick Minyard, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This state-
ment is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/14/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be filed pri-
or to that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024171464. The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: Envision Yoga, 1720 
Taft Ave Apt 308, Los Angeles CA 90028. 
County: Los Angeles. Leah Davis, 1720 Taft 
Ave Apt 308, Los Angeles CA 90028. This 
business is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 09/2024. Signed: 
Leah Davis, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/14/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the rights of 
another under federal, state or common 
law (see Section 14411, et seq., B&P 
Code.) Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 
MICHAEL E. McCARDLE

Case No. 24STPB09026
	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, cred-
itors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, of 
MICHAEL E. McCARDLE
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE has 
been filed by Marytelma Thompson 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that Marytelma Thompson 
be appointed as personal represen-
tative to administer the estate of the 
decedent.

	 THE PETITION requests the 
decedent’s will and codicils, if any, be 
admitted to probate. The will and any 
codicils are available for examination 
in the file kept by the court.
	 THE PETITION requests authority 
to administer the estate under the In-
dependent Administration of Estates 
Act. (This authority will allow the per-
sonal representative to take many ac-
tions without obtaining court approval. 
Before taking certain very important 
actions, however, the personal rep-
resentative will be required to give 
notice to interested persons unless 
they have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The indepen-
dent administration authority will be 
granted unless an interested person 
files an objection to the petition and 
shows good cause why the court 
should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will be 
held on Sept. 26, 2024 at 8:30 AM in 
Dept. No. 99 located at 111 N. Hill St., 
Los Angeles, CA 90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objections 
or file written objections with the court 
before the hearing. Your appearance 
may be in person or by your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the court 
and mail a copy to the personal repre-
sentative appointed by the court with-
in the later of either (1) four months 
from the date of first issuance of let-
ters to a general personal represen-
tative, as defined in section 58(b) of 
the California Probate Code, or (2) 60 
days from the date of mailing or per-
sonal delivery to you of a notice under 
section 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and legal 
authority may affect your rights as a 
creditor. You may want to consult with 
an attorney knowledgeable in Califor-
nia law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file kept 
by the court. If you are a person in-
terested in the estate, you may file 
with the court a Request for Special 
Notice (form DE-154) of the filing of 
an inventory and appraisal of estate 
assets or of any petition or account 
as provided in Probate Code section 
1250. A Request for Special Notice 
form is available from the court clerk.

Attorney for petitioner:
MARC A BRONSTEIN ESQ

SBN 75933
BRETT J WASSERMAN ESQ

SBN 315058
MARC A BRONSTEIN

A PROFESSIONAL LAW
CORPORATION

3205 OCEAN PARK BLVD
STE 200

SANTA MONICA CA 90405
CN109331 MCCARDLE Aug 24,31, 

Sep 7, 2024

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF: 

JAMES ORAN WHITE 
CASE NO. 24STPB09261

To all heirs, beneficiaries, creditors, 
contingent creditors, and persons 
who may otherwise be interested 
in the WILL or estate, or both of 
JAMES ORAN WHITE.
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE 
has been filed by JOHN RAYFIELD 
NIEPOETTER in the Superior 
Court of California, County of LOS 
ANGELES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that JOHN R. NIEPOET-
TER be appointed as personal rep-
resentative to administer the estate 
of the decedent.
	 THE PETITION requests the 
decedent’s WILL and codicils, if 
any, be admitted to probate. The 
WILL and any codicils are available 
for examination in the file kept by 
the court.
	 THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 

allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will 
be held in this court as follows: 
09/18/24 at 8:30AM in Dept. 29 lo-
cated at 111 N. HILL ST., LOS AN-
GELES, CA 90012
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 
in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.
Attorney for Petitioner
HENRY H. DEARING - SBN 
060946
GIFFORD, DEARING & ABER-
NATHY, LLP
515 S. FIGUEROA ST., STE. 2060
LOS ANGELES CA 90071
Telephone (213) 626-4481
8/24, 8/31, 9/7/24
CNS-3845289#

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main Street
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Braden Scott Schumitzky, an 

adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/11/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Braden 
Scott Schumitzky. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Braden 

Scott Schumitzky to Braden Scott 
Sanders

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
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petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 16, 2024.
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SMCP00435
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition of Chris-
tine Marie Beck, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/04/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. 8 Room 504

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is 
over 18 years of age: Christine 
Marie Beck. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 

said petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from Christine Marie 
Beck to Christine Marie Markham

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 9, 2024
Ronald F. Frank
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRCP00319
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N Hill Street Room 118
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of Ciera 
Rose Franco, an adult over the age 

of 18 years.

​Date: 11/01/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 
18 years of age: Ciera Rose Franco. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 
said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 

from Ciera Rose Franco to Ciera 
Rose Abad

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 14, 2024.
Curtis A Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02567
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main St
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition of Coby 
Tyler Schumitzky, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/11/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is 
over 18 years of age: Coby Tyler 

Schumitzky. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 

said petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from Coby Tyler 

Schumitzky to Coby Tyler Sanders

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 16, 2024.
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SCP00434
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main St
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition 

of Elizabeth Chase Loskutoff, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/11/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is 
over 18 years of age: Elizabeth 
Chase Loskutoff. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Elizabeth 

Chase Loskutoff to Elizabeth 
Chase Rantze Loskutoff

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 15, 2024.
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SCP00433
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

150 West Commonwealth Avenue
Alhambra CA 91301

In the Matter of the Petition of Erika 
Karlin Der Sarkissian, an adult over 

the age of 18 years.

​Date: 11/04/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. T

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is 

over 18 years of age: Erika Karlin 
Der Sarkissian. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 

said petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from Erika Karlin 
Der Sarkissian to Erika Winkler

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 20, 2024.
Robin Miller Sloan, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24PNNCP00469
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave.
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition of Jessi-
ca Brittany Cabot, an adult over the 

age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/04/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. P Room 4409

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: Jessica 
Brittany Cabot. And a petition for 

change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 

said petitioner(s) desire to have their 
name changed from Jessica Britta-

ny Cabot to Jessica Kim Cabot

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 5, 2024.
Judge David K. Reinert
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRCP00308
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N Hill Street Room 118
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of Marika 
Berthe Jacqueline Tjelios, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/04/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is 

over 18 years of age: Marika Berthe 
Jacqueline Tjelios. And a petition 
for change of names having been 

duly filed with the clerk of this Court, 
and it appearing from said petition 

that said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Marika 

Berthe Jacqueline Tjelios to 
Marika Tjelios

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 

before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: July 16, 2024.
Curtis A Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02238
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

1725 Main St
Santa Monica CA 90401

In the Matter of the Petition of Saki-
neh Vaziri, an adult over the age of 

18 years.

​Date: 10/18/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. K

It appearing that the following person 
whose name is to be changed is over 

18 years of age: Sakineh Vaziri. 
And a petition for change of names 
having been duly filed with the clerk 
of this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) de-
sire to have their name changed from 

Sakineh Vaziri to Simin Vaziri

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a written 
petition that includes the reasons for 
the objection at least two court days 
before the matter is scheduled to be 
heard and must appear at the hearing 
to show cause why the petition should 
not be granted. If no written objection 
is timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in the 
British Weekly, a newspaper of gen-
eral circulation for the County of Los 
Angeles, for four successive weeks 
prior to the date set for hearing of said 
petition. 

Dated: August 19, 2024.
Lawrence H. Cho
Judge of the Superior Court
24SCP00440
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024157497. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Fiesta Sea-
food, 1438 Madrid Dr, Pomona CA 
91766. County: Los Angeles. Fernan-
do G Vazquez Pena, 1438 Madrid Dr, 
Pomona CA 91766. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Fernando G Vazquez Pena, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 07/26/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-

der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024158725. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: SkipNServe 
Process Server Service, 28649 S 
Western Ave 6848, San Pedro CA 
90734. County: Los Angeles. Chris-
topher Demirdjian, 28649 S Western 
Ave 6848, San Pedro CA 90734. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Christopher Demirdji-
an, owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/29/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024159103. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Wonder 
Cha, Wonder Consulting, WonderCha, 
Wonder Cha Tea Place, 10401 Ven-
ice Blvd Suite 102, Los Angeles CA 
90034. County: Los Angeles. Wonder 
Cha LLC, 12430 Pacific Ave Apt 104, 
Los Angeles CA 90066. State of orga-
nization: California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability compa-
ny. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 07/2024. Signed: Angela Lin, Pres-
ident. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 07/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024159378. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Aethos 
Landscape, 8605 Santa Monica Blvd. 
#177732, West Hollywood CA 90069. 
County: Los Angeles. Ethos Real Es-
tate Corporation, 8605 Santa Monica 
Blvd. #177732, West Hollywood CA 
90069. State of incorporation: Califor-
nia. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Chris Hopkins, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 07/29/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024159840. The following person(s) 
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is/are doing business as: SKARCHI-
TECTS, SKA, SK Architects, 4040 
Palos Verdes Dr N 201, Rolling Hills Es-
tates, CA 90274. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 3019112. SKARTCHITECTS, 
4040 Palos Verdes Dr N Suite, Rolling 
Hills Estates, CA 90274. State of incor-
poration: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2007. 
Signed: Sina Khajavi, President. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 07/30/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it 
was filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024160833. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Millennium 
Courier Service, 11617 Keswick Street, 
North Hollywood CA 91605. County: 
Los Angeles. Zoltan Vnoucsek, 11617 
Keswick Street, North Hollywood CA 
91605. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 03/2007. Signed: Zol-
tan Vnoucsek, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 07/31/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024162087. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Sky Above 
Cloud 3159 Waverly Drive, Los Ange-
les CA 90027. County: Los Angeles. 
Carlyn Sylvester, 3159 Waverly Drive, 
Los Angeles CA 90027. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Carlyn Sylvester, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/01/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it 
was filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024163387. Current file: 2023239250. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Silver Mexican Jewelry, 9021 Alondra 
Blvd Space 2, Bellflower CA 90706. 
Janneth Juarez Alejo, 9021 Alondra 
Blvd Space 2, Bellflower CA 90706. 
The fictitious business name referred to 
above was filed on: 11/06/2023, in the 
County of Los Angeles. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. Signed: 

Janneth Juarez Alejo, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/01/2024. 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024162486. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Chance Hold-
ing Dealership, 10142 Samoa Ave Unit 
6, Tujunga CA 91042. County: Los 
Angeles. Chance Holding Inc, 10142 
Samoa Ave Unit 6, Tujunga CA 91042. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Samvel Machkalian, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/01/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024164408. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Riptide Films 
And Videography, 3525 Emerald St Apt 
#5, Torrance CA 90503. County: Los 
Angeles. Niccolo Esquivelzeta Sohn, 
3525 Emerald St Apt #5, Torrance CA 
90503. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Nic-
colo Esquivelzeta Sohn, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/05/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it 
was filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024167139. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: 3-B’z Paint-
ing Co., 5919 Matilija Ave., Valley Glen 
CA 91401. County: Los Angeles. Anita 
Kohavi, 5919 Matilija Ave., Valley Glen 
CA 91401. This business is conduct-
ed by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 04/1998. Signed: Anita 
Kohavi, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/08/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024169102. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Carbon Re-
modeling, 9918 Durant Drive, Beverly 
Hills CA 90212. County: Los Angeles. 

Carbon Development Group, Inc., 
9918 Durant Drive, Beverly Hills CA 
90212. State of incorporation: Califor-
nia. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Charles 
Finkelstein-Sharpe, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 08/12/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024169202. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: A G Mainte-
nance, 331 S Ardmore Ave Apt 215, 
Los Angeles CA 90020. County: Los 
Angeles. Alan Galicia, 331 S Ardmore 
Ave Apt 215, Los Angeles CA 90020. 
This business is conducted by: an indi-
vidual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 08/2024. Signed: Alan Galicia, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/12/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024170206. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Skyview RE 
Partners, 10940 Wilshire Blvd Suite 
1600, Los Angeles CA 90024. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. ENS Realty, 10940 
Wilshire Blvd Suite 1600, Los Angeles 
CA 90024. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names list-
ed herein on: 07/2024. Signed: Shanna 
Naim, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/13/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024170242. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: UniqueCorn 
Productions, 5151 Buffalo Avenue Apt. 
16, Sherman Oaks CA 91423. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Kenya Crayton, 5151 
Buffalo Avenue Apt. 16, Sherman Oaks 
CA 91423. This business is conduct-
ed by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Kenya 
Crayton, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 

County on: 08/13/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024170487. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ameci Pizza & 
Pasta, 3869 W Rancho Vista Blvd #C, 
Palmdale CA 93551. County: Los An-
geles. AI#ON: 6305377. AMV Desert 
Group Inc, 3869 W Rancho Vista Blvd 
#C, Palmdale CA 93551. State of in-
corporation: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Verina Aziz, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/13/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the date it 
was filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024171788. Current file: 2022043910. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Fotile CA, 18351 Colima Rd Suite 126, 
Rowland Heights CA 91748. L&C Inter-
national Trade Inc, 18351 Colima Rd 
Suite 126, Rowland Heights CA 91748. 
The fictitious business name referred 
to above was filed on: 02/24/2022, in 
the County of Los Angeles. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
Signed: Miaomiao Cai, President. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/15/2024. 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024171839. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Select Le-
gal Consulting, 11878 La Grange 2nd 
Floor, Los Angeles CA 90025. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Turner Law Firm, A 
Professional Corporation, 11878 La 
Grange 2nd Floor, Los Angeles CA 
90025. State of incorporation: Califor-
nia. This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Keith Turn-
er, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/15/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024171880. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: C.T. Solu-
tions, 29125 Saint Tropez Place, 

Castaic CA 91384. County: Los Ange-
les. Christina Laura Quintero, 29125 
Saint Tropez Place, Castaic CA 91384. 
This business is conducted by: an indi-
vidual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Christina Laura 
Quintero, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/15/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024171899. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: On Record, 
1200 Wilshire Blvd Suite 408, Los An-
geles CA 90017. County: Los Angeles. 
Robert S. Mac Tavish, 1557 Indiana 
Ave, South Pasadena CA 91030. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 11/1986. Signed: Robert S. Mac 
Tavish, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/15/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024171933. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Kush Com-
pany; KushCo, 7601 Eastern Ave, 
Bell Gardens CA 90201. County: Los 
Angeles. BG Flower LLC, 100 N Brand 
Blvd 605, Glendale CA 91203. State of 
organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Aram Ekimyan, man-
ager. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/15/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024172001. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Better Surfac-
es & Services; BS&S, 7758 Balboa Blvd 
Unit D, Van Nuys CA 91406. County: 
Los Angeles. Wilmer Omar Lopez, 
7758 Balboa Blvd Unit D, Van Nuys CA 
91406. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names list-
ed herein on: 08/2008. Signed: Wilmer 
Omar Lopez, owner. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los An-

geles County on: 08/15/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024172019. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Piramide 
Products Inc, Piramide Products, 
14430 Victory Blvd, Van Nuys CA 
91401. County: Los Angeles.  AI#ON: 
4211395. Piramide Products Incorpo-
rated, 14430 Victory Blvd, Van Nuys 
CA 91401. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names list-
ed herein on: 08/2011. Signed: Wilmer 
Omar Lopez, CEO. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 08/15/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024172036. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: La Magia De 
Mictlan, Mictlan’s Magic, 6663 Enfield 
Ave, Reseda CA 91335-5609. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Wilmer Omar Lopez, 
6663 Enfield Ave, Reseda CA 91335-
5609. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Wilmer Omar 
Lopez, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/15/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024172324. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: X Home, 
17510 Castleton St, City of Industry CA 
91748. County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 
4838779. L&C International Trade Inc, 
17510 Castleton St, City of Industry 
CA 91748. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Miaomiao 
Cai, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/15/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 

Legal Notices
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Worth a Look

THIS WEEK brings the 
very welcome return of 
Slow Horses on Apple 
TV, reuniting us with 
the dysfunctional fam-
ily of British misfit in-
telligence operatives 
presided over by the 
gloriously unkempt 
Jackson Lamb.
	 The fourth season of 
the show, which de-
buted on Wednesday, 
has been hailed by 
many critics as its best 
outing yet, solidifying 
its reputation as one of 
the most engaging es-
pionage dramas of re-
cent years. Based on the 
novels by Mick Herron, 
the show focuses on a 
small group of intelli-
gence service misfits 
who have been relegat-
ed, either through bad 
luck or human error, to 
Slough House, the din-
gy London office build-
ing housing where they 
ply their trade.	
	 This season picks up 
where the previous one 
left off, with the team 
diving deeper into a 
complex web of in-
trigue and betrayal. The 
show opens with the 
bombing of a London 
shopping mall and the 
seeming death of one of 
their own, before devel-
oping into a wider sto-
ry of conspiracy, rogue 
agents and bad actors 
both within and with-
out the British govern-
ment.
	 This season’s scripts 
remain tight as a drum, 
with writer Will Smith 
continuing to balance 
sharp, cerebral story-
telling with moments 
of genuine tension 
and dark humor, as he 
weaves together mul-
tiple plot threads in a 
way that is both intri-
cate and accessible. The 
character development 
is particularly notewor-
thy; the show continues 
to explore the nuances 

of its flawed, compel-
ling characters, reveal-
ing new dimensions to 
their personalities and 
relationships.
	 Gary Oldman returns 
as Jackson Lamb, the 
irascible, flatulent but 
fiercely loyal head of 
the Slough House team, 
with his signature blend 
of gravitas and cyni-
cism. Other familiar fac-
es include Kristin Scott 
Thomas as the formida-
ble Diana Taverner, Jack 
Lowden as the earnest 
River Cartwright and 
Jonathan Pryce, delight-
fully batty but endless-
ly shrewd as River’s 
grandfather David. 
Veteran actress Saskia 
Reeves also returns as 
Catherine Standish, the 
alcoholic ex-agent who 
knows where all the 
bodies are buried, as 
well as Rosalind Elea-
zar as Louisa Guy who 
is still struggling to 
process the death last 
season of her lover, and 
Christopher Chung as 
the eternally awful com-
ms whiz, Roddy Ho.
	 There are also a hand-
ful of new faces join-
ing the cast this time 

around, all of whom 
bring something new 
to the table. In Slough 
House, the overeager 
Moira (Joanna Scanlan) 
works to get back to her 
old job as soon as pos-
sible, while the dead-
eyed J.K. (Tom Brooke) 
sits and twitches in the 
corner. Over at the Park, 
the slick-bit-out-of-his-
depth new First Desk 
Claude (James Callis) 
butts heads with Tav-
erner, who, as usual, 
leaves her male counter-
parts in the dust.	
	 But the most notable 
additional is its villain: 
Frank Harkness (Hugo 
Weaving), who runs a 
sort of mercenary home 
for boys, one of whom 
might just be respon-
sible for the bombing 
that sets off the season’s 
course of events. Hark-
ness reads as an almost 
perfect foil to Lamb’s 
sweaty, smelly mess of 
a leadership strategy. 
Weaving gives the role 
a ruthless sense of con-
trol, right down to his 
perfectly manicured 
beard. 
	 In the end though, 
this is a show about a 

family. A dysfunctional, 
chaotic and belligerent 
unit of MI5 rejects, to be 
sure, but a family none-
theless, presided over 
by a messy but deeply 
honorable paterfamilias 
in Lamb.
	 “There’s a jaded-
ness in Lamb, but he’s 
very loyal to these mis-
fits,” Oldman recently 
told the Radio Times. 
“When it really comes 
down to it, he probably 
cares more than most, 
although he gives the 
impression, as a protec-
tion, that he doesn’t.”
	 Do not miss Slow 

Horses. It’s not just one 
of the great British spy 
shows of recent years, 
it’s one of the great 

shows to come out of 
Britain over the last de-
cade.
	 - Nick Stark

Slow Horses gallops 
back, better than ever 
n Season Four of the British spy drama returns to Apple TV

STABLE GENIUS? Gary Oldman returns as the gloriously unkempt, cynical 
but fiercely loyal intelligence officer Jackson Lamb in Slow Horses

RUTHLESS HARKNESS: Hugo Weaving stars as 
the spy troupe’s formidable opponent
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2995 Thousand Oaks Blvd., Thousand Oaks. (parking in rear)
Open: Mon-Sat. 10.30-5.30 • Sun: 10-6 • Tel: (805) 495-4042

Teas • Candy • Pastries • Bangers • 
Meat Pies • Heinz Beans • 

China Teapots • Tea Cozies • Gifts
Now featuring delicious, traditional handmade pies and 

pasties from Deli-SA. Chicken curry pasties, Cornish 
pasties, Steak & Kidney...and much more

Quality Imports from the British Isles...

Direct Contact: 
Annie 

(310) 710 8224

The Hare 
and Hounds

ARIES: You rams are passionate, confident and motivated people but of-
ten find the best way to relax is to travel. You might have some unexpected 
free time coming soon, but don’t rush into decisions....keeping a low profile 
might be just the tonic you need.
TAURUS: Now that Mercury is moving faster it’s time to get anything past 
due in any area completed. Just try to keep a handle on your finances.
GEMINI:  Busy people do not have time to always do what they want to. 
You will have plenty of time now your boss Mercury is assisting you in the 
several days ahead.
CANCER: You should be looking at your plans are for the next week or so. 
Best to discard what is past and get ready to move in a new direction.
LEO: You should know by now that one of life’s greatest gift is patience. 
Yours has been tested over the last week or so but remember that nothing 
lasts forever.
VIRGO: Mercury going forward again will push you to fix or to discard dead 
wood. This is in any area of life and it’s best you get moving as mid-month 
you will be busy. Happy Birthday!
LIBRA: Trying to change others or to get them to see things your way is ulti-
mately a waste of time. Now that Mars is poking his nose into your business 
you are better off surrendering.
SCORPIO: You should always trust your intuition, especially now that your 
boss Mars is helping you. Be sure you know you are slowly but surely get-
ting nearer to your goal.
SAGITTARIUS: There are some people in your life that can be frustrating. 
Be aware that it’s best to keep your distance from them. Don’t worry about 
things beyond your control...it’s not your problem.
CAPRICORN: With Mercury in Virgo cruising forward a thorny issue will 
finally unravel. Put some space between yourself and those who are not serv-
ing your highest good.
AQUARIUS: The current times are uncertain and you can be stubborn and 
set in your ways at times. This is not the time for being rigid. It’s best you get 
that workload under control and then relax.
PISCES: You could have some stress in your life or with those around you. 
This can make life somewhat chaotic. But this will send soon and an uptick 
in your social life is coming.

Stargazing with 
Annie Shaw

Need a little reset?

Join us in our cozy Join us in our cozy 
Tea Room for Tea Room for 
Afternoon Tea  Afternoon Tea  
Wed-Sat 11.30-4pmWed-Sat 11.30-4pm

Enjoy a selection of sandwiches, pastries, 
sausage rolls and a glass of 

bubbly! Private parties available.

Ye Olde Kings Head • 116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica • 310.451.1402

Local News

Time Tunnel of 
Death pipped No 
Way Sis to the trivia 
title at the latest Brits 
in LA Pub Quiz but 
everyone’s a winner 
at the popular Tues-
day night game.
	 That’s because each 
player leaves Sandro 
Monetti’s weekly quiz 
at O’Briens in Santa 
Monica with magical 
memories.
	 Come see what all 
the fun is about by 
joining next time on 
Tuesday September 
10 at 8, immediately 
after the Presidential 
debate. 
	 (Photos by Cathari-
na Santasilia).

Everyone’s 
a winner at 
the Trivia...

Winning Team Time Tunnel of Death (above) basked in victory, while (below) 
runners-up No Way Sis kept looking on the bright side
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of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024172711. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Totally Loud 
Productions, 216 S Ramona Ave Apt E, 
Monterey Park CA 91754. County: Los 
Angeles. Charles James Turner, 216 S 
Ramona Ave Apt E, Monterey Park CA 
91754. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Charles James 
Turner, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/16/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024172731. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Twins Art 
Cinema, 18312 Collins St Apt 222, Tar-
zana CA 91356. County: Los Angeles. 
Nasser Zamiri, 18312 Collins St Apt 
222, Tarzana CA 91356; Nedae Asa-
di, 18312 Collins St Apt 222, Tarzana 
CA 91356. This business is conducted 
by: a married couple. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Nasser Zamiri, husband. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 08/16/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024173017. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Direct Ap-
praisal Network, 19745 E. Colima Rd. 
#1158, Rowland Heights CA 91748. 
County: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 4065888. 
Right Works Inc, 19745 E. Colima Rd. 
#1158, Rowland Heights CA 91748. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Yunhua Wang, CEO. 
Registrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024173099. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Love To 
Hydrate, 33165 Decker School Rd., 

Malibu CA 90265. County: Los Ange-
les. AI#ON: 202463115903. Harvard 
House Apartments LLC, 33165 Decker 
School Rd., Malibu CA 90265. State of 
organization: California. This business 
is conducted by: a limited liability com-
pany. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 12/2021. Signed: Steven Stein, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024173102. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Social Light 
Media, 22543 Ventura Blvd. Ste. 220-
C10, Woodland Hills CA 91364. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Social Light Media 
Partners, Inc., 22543 Ventura Blvd. Ste. 
220-C10, Woodland Hills CA 91364. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: n/a. Signed: Jennifer Krainman, 
Secretary. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/16/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024173309. Current file: 2024096371. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Universal Translation & Notary Ser-
vices, 334 North Central Avenue Suite 
109, Glendale CA 91203. Yelisaveta 
Kyuchukyan, 334 North Central Ave-
nue Suite 109, Glendale CA 91203. 
The fictitious business name referred to 
above was filed on: 05/03/2024, in the 
County of Los Angeles. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. Signed: 
Yelisaveta Kyuchukyan, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/16/2024. 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024173330. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Universal 
Translation & Notary Services, 334 
North Central Avenue Suite 109, Glen-
dale CA 91203. County: Los Angeles. 
Victoria Shpak, 334 North Central Av-
enue Suite 109, Glendale CA 91203. 
This business is conducted by: an indi-
vidual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Victoria Shpak, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/16/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 

prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024173510. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Mimic Me-
dia, Nail Flex, 265 S Western Ave 
Unit 741063, Los Angeles CA 90004. 
County: Los Angeles. Ying Zhou, 265 S 
Western Ave Unit 741063, Los Angeles 
CA 90004. This business is conduct-
ed by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Ying 
Zhou, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/16/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of Use of 
Fictitious Business Name: 2024173610. 
Current file: 2023250841. The following 
person has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: Universal Fur-
niture And Mattress, 200 S. Barrington 
Avenue Unit 49750, Los Angeles CA 
90049. Franklin Lincoln Construction, 
Inc., 200 S. Barrington Avenue Unit 
49750, Los Angeles CA 90049. The fic-
titious business name referred to above 
was filed on: 11/20/2023, in the County 
of Los Angeles. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. Signed: Alex 
Soofer, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024173611. Current file: 2023249604. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Core Services, 200 S. Barrington Av-
enue Unit 49750, Los Angeles CA 
90049. Abundant Blessings, Inc., 200 
S. Barrington Avenue Unit 49750, Los 
Angeles CA 90049. The fictitious busi-
ness name referred to above was filed 
on: 11/17/2023, in the County of Los 
Angeles. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. Signed: Alex Soof-
er, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024173612. Current file: 2024110482. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Core Services, 200 S. Barrington Ave-
nue #49750, Los Angeles CA 90049. 
Prosperity Ventures NO 01, LLC, 200 
S. Barrington Avenue #49750, Los 
Angeles CA 90049. The fictitious busi-
ness name referred to above was filed 
on: 05/22/2024, in the County of Los 
Angeles. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. Signed: Alex Soof-
er, CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024173613. Current file: 2024156775. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Catering Systems, 200 S. Barrington 
Avenue #49750, Los Angeles CA 
90049. Franklin Lincoln Construction, 
Inc., 200 S. Barrington Avenue #49750, 
Los Angeles CA 90049. The fictitious 
business name referred to above was 
filed on: 07/25/2024, in the County of 
Los Angeles. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. Signed: Alex 
Soofer, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of Use of 
Fictitious Business Name: 2024173614. 
Current file: 2023070468. The follow-
ing person has abandoned the use of 
the fictitious business name: Lapiana 
Consulting, BATZ CCTV, Armed Elite 
Services, Armed Elite Services, BATZ 
CCTV, Lapiana Consulting, 10880 
Wilshire Blvd. 1101, Los Angeles CA 
90024. Franklin Lincoln Construction, 
Inc., 10880 Wilshire Blvd. 1101, Los 
Angeles CA 90024. The fictitious busi-
ness name referred to above was filed 
on: 03/30/2023, in the County of Los 
Angeles. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. Signed: Alexander 
Soofer, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024173996. Current file: 2023029159. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Brighton Construction, 200 S. Barrign-
ton Avenue #49750, Los Angeles CA 
90049. Franklin Lincoln Construction, 
Inc., 200 S. Barrington Avenue #49750, 
Los Angeles CA 90049. The fictitious 
business name referred to above was 
filed on: 02/08/2023, in the County of 
Los Angeles. This business is conduct-
ed by: a corporation. Signed: Alexander 
Soofer, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of Use of 
Fictitious Business Name: 2024173998. 
Current file: 2023251545. The following 
person has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: Utah Group, 
200 S. Barrington Avenue Unit 49750, 
Los Angeles CA 90049. Alexander 
Soofer, 200 S. Barrington Avenue Unit 
49750, Los Angeles CA 90049. The 
fictitious business name referred to 
above was filed on: 11/21/2023, in the 
County of Los Angeles. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. Signed: 
Alexander Soofer, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/19/2024. 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024173999. Current file: 2023249730. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Jetro Carry 1, 200 S. Barrington Av-
enue Unit 49750, Los Angeles CA 
90049. Franklin Lincoln Construction, 
Inc., 200 S. Barrington Avenue Unit 
49750, Los Angeles CA 90049. The fic-
titious business name referred to above 
was filed on: 11/17/2023, in the County 
of Los Angeles. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. Signed: Alex 
Soofer, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 

that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024174008. Current file: 2023236049. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Revolution Kitchen, 200 S. Barrington 
Avenue #49750, Los Angeles CA 
90049. Franklin Lincoln Construction, 
Inc., 10880 Wilshire Blvd. 1101, Los 
Angeles CA 90024. The fictitious busi-
ness name referred to above was filed 
on: 10/31/2023, in the County of Los 
Angeles. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. Signed: Alexander 
Soofer, CEO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024174063. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Carver Frank-
lin, Inc., 3053 Rancho Vista Blvd Suite 
H-178, Palmdale CA 93551. County: 
Los Angeles. Carver Franklin, 3053 
Rancho Vista Blvd Suite H-178, Palm-
dale CA 93551. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Shawn 
Cabey, President. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the state-
ment is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los An-
geles County on: 08/19/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. A 
new Fictitious Business Name State-
ment must be filed prior to that date. 
The filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of Use of 
Fictitious Business Name: 2024174286. 
Current file: 2023248255. The following 
person has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: Utah Services 
Group, 200 S. Barrington Avenue Unit 
49750, Los Angeles CA 90049. Alexan-
der Soofer, 200 S. Barrington Avenue 
Unit 49750, Los Angeles CA 90049. 
The fictitious business name referred 
to above was filed on: 11/16/2023, in 
the County of Los Angeles. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
Signed: Alexander Soofer, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/19/2024. 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of Use of 
Fictitious Business Name: 2024174290. 
Current file: 2020013948. The following 
person has abandoned the use of the 
fictitious business name: Wilshire Real 
Estate Services, 200 S. Barrington Av-
enue #49750, Los Angeles CA 90049. 
Franklin Lincoln Construction, Inc., 200 
S. Barrington Avenue #49750, Los An-
geles CA 90049. The fictitious business 
name referred to above was filed on: 
01/17/2020, in the County of Los An-
geles. This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. Signed: Alexander Soof-
er, President. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 

2024175212. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Eastville 
Handyman Services, 1217 W Rose-
crans Ave 8, Gardena CA 90247. 
County: Los Angeles. Vicente Zornosa, 
1217 W Rosecrans Ave 8, Gardena CA 
90247. This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names list-
ed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Vicente 
Zornosa, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/20/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of it-
self authorize the use in this state of 
a fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under feder-
al, state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024 
and 09/14/2024

Statement of Abandonment of 
Use of Fictitious Business Name: 
2024176297. Current file: 2020097469. 
The following person has abandoned 
the use of the fictitious business name: 
Debeikes Insurance Agency, 23241 
Ventura Blvd Ste 224C, Woodland Hills 
CA 91364. Richard A Debeikes, 7560 
St Helena Highway, Napa CA 94558. 
The fictitious business name referred to 
above was filed on: 06/19/2020, in the 
County of Los Angeles. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. Signed: 
Richard A Debeikes, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County Clerk 
of Los Angeles County on: 08/21/2024. 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024176577. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The Purple 
Rose, 805 Palm Ave, West Hollywood 
CA 90069. County: Los Angeles. The 
Purple Rose, Inc, 805 Palm Ave, West 
Hollywood CA 90069. State of incor-
poration: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact busi-
ness under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Margarita Vardanian, Pres-
ident. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/21/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious Busi-
ness Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the use 
in this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/24/2024, 08/31/2024, 
09/07/2024 and 09/14/2024

T.S. NO.: 631-019708 Loan No.: 
1717469326 APN: 4282-026-013 Prop-
erty Address: 1445 9TH STREET, SAN-
TA MONICA, CA 90401 NOTICE OF 
UNIFIED TRUSTEE’S SALE YOU 
ARE IN DEFAULT UNDER A DEED 
OF TRUST DATED 9/22/2016 AND 
SECURITY AGREEMENT DATED 
9/22/2016. UNLESS YOU TAKE AC-
TION TO PROTECT YOUR PROPER-
TY, IT MAY BE SOLD AT A PUBLIC 
SALE. IF YOU NEED AN EXPLANA-
TION OF THE NATURE OF THE PRO-
CEEDINGS AGAINST YOU, YOU 
SHOULD CONTACT A LAWYER. On 
9/24/2024, 10:30 AM, PLM LOAN 
MANAGEMENT SERVICES, INC., as 
duly appointed Trustee under and pursu-
ant to Deed of Trust recorded on 
9/23/2016, as Document No. 
20161161164, and UCC Financing Ste-
ment recorded on 9/23/2016 as Document 
No. 20161161167 of Official Records in 

News from Britain



The british Weekly, Sat. September 7, 2024 Page 13

LEGAL NOTICES

the Office of the Recorder of Los Ange-
les, California, executed by 1445 9TH 
STREET, LLC , A LIMITED LIABILI-
TY COMPANY ORGANIZED AND 
EXISTING UNDER THE LAWS OF 
DELAWARE, as Trustor, ARBOR RE-
ALTY SR, INC., A CORPORATION 
ORGANIZED AND EXISTING UN-
DER THE LAWS OF MARYLAND, as 
Beneficiary. WILL SELL AT PUBLIC 
AUCTION TO THE HIGHEST BID-
DER FOR CASH (payable at time of sale 
in lawful money of the United States, by 
Cash, a Cashier’s check drawn by a state 
or national bank, a check drawn by a state 
or federal credit union, or a check drawn 
by a state or federal savings and loan asso-
ciation, savings association, or savings 
bank specified in section 5102 of the Fi-
nancial Code and authorized to do busi-
ness in this state). At: Behind the fountain 
located in Civic Center Plaza located at 
400 Civic Center Plaza, Pomona, CA 
91766, all right, title and interest con-
veyed to and now held by it under said 
Deed of Trust in the property situated in 
said County, California, describing the 
land therein: As more fully described on 
said Deed of Trust. A.P.N.: 4282-026-013 
The property heretofore described is be-
ing sold “as is”. The street address and 
other common designation, if any, of the 
real property described above is purported 
to be: 1445 9TH STREET, SANTA 
MONICA, CA 90401 The undersigned 
Trustee disclaims any liability for any in-
correctness of the street address and other 
common designation, if any, shown here-
in. Said sale will be made, but without 
covenant or warrant, expressed or im-
plied, regarding title, possession or en-
cumbrances, to pay the remaining princi-
pal sum of the note(s) secured by said 
Deed of trust, with interest thereon, as 
provided in said note(s), advances, if any, 
under the terms of the Deed of trust, esti-
mated fees, charges and expenses of the 
Trustee and of the trust created by said 
Deed of Trust, to-wit: $5,225,405.04 (es-
timated as of the first publication date). 
Accrued interest and additional advances, 
if any, will increase the figure prior to 
sale. Beneficiary hereby elects to conduct 
a unified foreclosure sale pursuant to the 
provisions of California Commercial 
Code section 9604, et seq., and to include 
in the non judicial foreclosure of the real 
property interest described in the Security 
Agreement dated 9/22/2016, between the 
original trustor and the original beneficia-
ry, as it may have been amended from 
time to time, and pursuant to any other 
instruments between the trustor and bene-
ficiary referencing a security interest in 
personal property. Beneficiary reserves its 
right to evoke its election as to some or all 
of said personal property and/or fixtures, 
or to add additional personal property 
and/or fixtures to the election herein ex-
pressed, as Beneficiary’s sole election, 
from time to time and at any time until the 
consummation of the Trustee’s Sale to be 
conducted pursuant to the Deed of Trust 
and this Notice of Trustee’s Sale. See the 
Deed of Trust, if applicable. The personal 
property which was given as security for 
trustor’s obligation is described ALL 
GOODS, ACCOUNTS, CHOSES OF 
ACTION, CHATTEL PAPER, DOCU-
MENTS, GENERAL INTANGIBLES 
(INCLUDING SOFTWARE), PAY-
MENT INTANGIBLES, INSTRU-
MENTS, INVESTMENT PROPERTY, 
LETTER OF CREDIT RIGHTS, SUP-
PORTING OBLIGATIONS, COMPUT-
ER INFORMATION, SOURCE 
CODES, OBJECT CODES, RECORDS 
AND DATA, ALL TELEPHONE 
NUMBERS OR LISTINGS, CLAIMS 
(INCLUDING CLAIMS FOR INDEM-
NITY OR BREACH OF WARRANTY), 
DEPOSIT ACCOUNTS AND OTHER 
PROPERTY OR ASSETS OF ANY 
KIND OR NATURE RELATED TO 
THE LAND OR THE IMPROVE-
MENTS, INCLUDING OPERATING 
AGREEMENTS, SURVEYS, PLANS 
AND SPECIFICATIONS AND CON-
TRACTS FOR ARCHITECTURAL, 
ENGINEERING AND CONSTRUC-
TION SERVICES RELATING TO THE 
LAND OR THE IMPROVEMENTS, 
AND ALL OTHER INTANGIBLE 
PROPERTY AND RIGHTS RELAT-
ING TO THE OPERATION OF, OR 

USED IN CONNECTION WITH, THE 
LAND OR THE IMPROVEMENTS, 
INCLUDING ALL GOVERNMENTAL 
PERMITS RELATING TO ANY AC-
TIVITIES ON THE LAND. No warranty 
is made that any or all of the personal 
property still exists or is available for the 
successful bidder and no warranty is 
made as to the condition of any of the per-
sonal property, which shall be sold “as is” 
“where is”. The beneficiary under the 
Deed of Trust heretofore executed and 
delivered to the undersigned, a written 
Declaration of Default and Demand for 
Sale, and a Written Notice of Default and 
Election to Sell. The undersigned caused 
said Notice of Default and Election to Sell 
to be recorded in the County here the real 
property is located and more than three 
months have elapsed since such recorda-
tion. NOTICE TO POTENTIAL BID-
DERS: If you are considering bidding on 
this property lien, you should understand 
that there are risks involved in bidding at 
a trustee auction. You will be bidding on a 
lien, not on the property itself. Placing the 
highest bid at a trustee auction does not 
automatically entitle you to free and clear 
ownership of the property. You should 
also be aware that the lien being auctioned 
off may be a junior lien. If you are the 
highest bidder at the auction, you are or 
may be responsible for paying off all liens 
senior to the lien being auctioned off, be-
fore you can receive clear title to the prop-
erty. You are encouraged to investigate 
the existence, priority, and size of out-
standing liens that may exist on this prop-
erty by contacting the county recorder’s 
office or a title insurance company, either 
of which may charge you a fee for this 
information. If you consult either of these 
resources, you should be aware that the 
same lender may hold more than one 
mortgage or deed of trust on the property. 
NOTICE TO PROPERTY OWNER: 
The sale date shown on this notice of sale 
may be postponed one or more times by 
the mortgagee, beneficiary, trustee, or a 
court, pursuant to Section 2924g of the 
California Civil Code. The law requires 
that information about trustee sale post-
ponements be made available to you and 
to the public, as a courtesy to those not 
present at the sale. If you wish to learn 
whether your sale date has been post-
poned, and, if applicable, the rescheduled 
time and date for the sale of this property, 
you may call (844)477-7869 or visit this 
Internet Website www.stoxposting.com, 
using the file number assigned to this case 
631-019708. Information about post-
ponements that are very short in duration 
or that occur close in time to the sched-
uled sale may not immediately be reflect-
ed in the telephone information or on the 
Internet Website. The best way to verify 
postponement information is to attend the 
scheduled sale. NOTICE TO TENANT: 
You may have a right to purchase this 
property after the trustee auction pursuant 
to Section 2924m of the California Civil 
Code. If you are an “eligible tenant buy-
er,” you can purchase the property if you 
match the last and highest bid placed at 
the trustee auction. If you are an “eligible 
bidder,” you may be able to purchase the 
property if you exceed the last and highest 
bid placed at the trustee auction. There are 
three steps to exercising this right of pur-
chase. First, 48 hours after the date of the 
trustee sale, you can call (844)477-7869, 
or visit this internet website www.stox-
posting.com, using the file number as-
signed to this case 631-019708 to find the 
date on which the trustee’s sale was held, 
the amount of the last and highest bid, and 
the address of the trustee. Second, you 
must send a written notice of intent to 
place a bid so that the trustee receives it no 
more than 15 days after the trustee’s sale. 
Third, you must submit a bid so that the 
trustee receives it no more than 45 days 
after the trustee’s sale. If you think you 
may qualify as an “eligible tenant buyer” 
or “eligible bidder,” you should consider 
contacting an attorney or appropriate real 
estate professional immediately for ad-
vice regarding this potential right to pur-
chase. 8/22/2024 PLM LOAN MAN-
AGEMENT SERVICES, INC., as 
Trustee Phone: (408) 370-4030 5446 
Thornwood Drive, 2nd Floor San Jose, 
CA 95123 Elizabeth Godbey, Vice Presi-
dent

NOTICE OF PETITION TO 
ADMINISTER ESTATE OF 
JENNIFER LYNN COLE

Case No. 24STPB09511
	 To all heirs, beneficiaries, credi-
tors, contingent creditors, and per-
sons who may otherwise be inter-
ested in the will or estate, or both, 
of JENNIFER LYNN COLE
	 A PETITION FOR PROBATE 
has been filed by Paula Eulan Fitch 
in the Superior Court of California, 
County of LOS ANGELES.
	 THE PETITION FOR PROBATE 
requests that Paula Eulan Fitch be 
appointed as personal representa-
tive to administer the estate of the 
decedent.
	 THE PETITION requests author-
ity to administer the estate under 
the Independent Administration 
of Estates Act. (This authority will 
allow the personal representative 
to take many actions without ob-
taining court approval. Before tak-
ing certain very important actions, 
however, the personal representa-
tive will be required to give notice 
to interested persons unless they 
have waived notice or consented 
to the proposed action.) The inde-
pendent administration authority 
will be granted unless an interested 
person files an objection to the peti-
tion and shows good cause why the 
court should not grant the authority.
	 A HEARING on the petition will 
be held on Sept. 26, 2024 at 8:30 
AM in Dept. No. 62 located at 111 
N. Hill St., Los Angeles, CA 90012.
	 IF YOU OBJECT to the granting 
of the petition, you should appear at 
the hearing and state your objec-
tions or file written objections with 
the court before the hearing. Your 
appearance may be in person or by 
your attorney.
	 IF YOU ARE A CREDITOR or a 
contingent creditor of the decedent, 
you must file your claim with the 
court and mail a copy to the per-
sonal representative appointed by 
the court within the later of either 
(1) four months from the date of 
first issuance of letters to a general 
personal representative, as defined 
in section 58(b) of the California 
Probate Code, or (2) 60 days from 
the date of mailing or personal de-
livery to you of a notice under sec-
tion 9052 of the California Probate 
Code.
	 Other California statutes and le-
gal authority may affect your rights 
as a creditor. You may want to con-
sult with an attorney knowledgeable 
in California law.
	 YOU MAY EXAMINE the file 
kept by the court. If you are a per-
son interested in the estate, you 
may file with the court a Request for 
Special Notice (form DE-154) of the 
filing of an inventory and appraisal 
of estate assets or of any petition 
or account as provided in Probate 
Code section 1250. A Request for 
Special Notice form is available 
from the court clerk.

Attorney for petitioner:
JOHN C LANSING ESQ

SBN 257182
LAW OFFICES OF

JOHN LANSING
4165 E THOUSAND OAKS BLVD

STE 201
WESTLAKE VILLAGE CA 91362
CN109706 COLE Aug 31, Sep 

7,14, 2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

111 N Hill St
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of De-
nise Germaine Australia James, 
an adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 11/15/2024. Time: 10.00am 
Dept. 86 Room 836

It appearing that the following per-

son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Denise 

Germaine Australia James. And 
a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 

from 
Denise Germaine Australia 

James to 
Denise Australia Ballard

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: Aug 20, 2024.
Curtis A. Kin, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24STCP02651
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME
Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
312 N. Spring Street
Los Angeles CA 90012

In the Matter of the Petition of Maa-
nasi Dhiraj Narayan, an adult over 
the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/28/2024. Time: 9.30am 
Dept. 9 Room 9

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is over 18 years of age: Maanasi 
Dhiraj Narayan. And a petition for 
change of names having been duly 
filed with the clerk of this Court, and 
it appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have 
their name changed from Maanasi 
Dhiraj Narayan to Maanasi Harini 
Dhiraj

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: Aug 26, 2024.
Elaine Lu
Judge of the Superior Court

24STCP02729
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME
Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
1427 West Covina Parkway
West Covina CA 91790

In the matter of In the Matter of the 
Petition of  Gege Zeng and Min-
grun Shang, an adult over the age 
of 18 years, on behalf of Shawn 
Shang, a minor under the age of 
18 years.

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 
is under 18 years of age: Shawn 
Shang. And a petition for change 
of names having been duly filed 
with the clerk of this Court, and it 
appearing from said petition that 
said petitioner(s) desire to have the 
name changed from Shawn Shang 
to Sheean Shang

​Date: 10/18/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. 6

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names 
appear before the above-entitled 
court to show cause why the peti-
tion for change of name(s) should 
not be granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 12, 2024.
Lynette Gridiron Winston
Judge of the Superior Court
24PSCP00379
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024143535. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Earth Art LA, 7007 
3rd Ave, Los Angeles CA 90043. 
County: Los Angeles. Maria 
Ksendzov, 7007 3rd Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90043. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 06/2024. 
Signed: Maria Ksendzov, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/08/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/17/2024, 08/24/2024, 
08/31/2024 and 09/07/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024158331. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 

as: Bricks And Minifigs Burbank, 
1919 W Magnolia Blvd, Burbank 
CA 91506. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 5919731. Burbank Bricks 
Inc., 1919 W Magnolia Blvd, Bur-
bank CA 91506. State of incorpo-
ration: California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: n/a. Signed: Vanagan 
Gaboudian, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
07/08/2024. NOTICE - This ficti-
tious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, 
in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize 
the use in this state of a fictitious 
business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, 
state or common law (see Section 
14411, et seq., B&P Code.) Pub-
lished: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024158777. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Lupita Mexican Food, 
2620 W. Valley Blvd, Alhambra 
CA 91803. County: Los Angeles. 
Idolina Barete-Garfias, 2620 W. 
Valley Blvd, Alhambra CA 91803. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 10/2018. 
Signed: Idolina Barete-Garfias, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/29/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024158781. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Salsa Picante Mexican 
Restaurant, Picante Mexican 
Restaurant, 1251 N Lake Ave, 
Pasadena CA 91104. County: Los 
Angeles. Idolina Barete Garfias, 
1251 N Lake Ave, Pasadena CA 
91104. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 10/2019. 
Signed: Idolina Barete-Garfias, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/29/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024159580. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
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business as: Game Of Foams 
Detailing, 9020 W Avenue J Spc 
29, Lancaster CA 93536. County: 
Los Angeles. Maritrini Arcila, 9020 
W Avenue J Spc 29, Lancaster CA 
93536. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Maritrini Arcila, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/30/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024160541. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Hollywood House of 
Beauty, 7547 1/2 Santa Monica 
Blvd, West Hollywood CA 90046. 
County: Los Angeles. Olha 
Osadcha, 1241 N Flores St Apt 
7, West Hollywood CA 90069. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
06/2024. Signed: Olha Osadcha, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 07/31/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024164542. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Elderlife, 4525 W 
135th St, Hawthorne CA 90250. 
County: Los Angeles. Choudhery 
Group LLC, 4525 W 135th St, 
Hawthorne CA 90250. State of 
organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Muhson Choudhery, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/06/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024166665. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Hutton Law Offices, 

Law Office Of Rebecca Hutton, 633 
W. 5th St Ste 5710, Los Angeles 
CA 90071. County: Los Angeles. 
Rebecca Hutton Allen, 633 W. 
5th St Ste 5710, Los Angeles CA 
90071. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 01/2015. 
Signed: Rebecca Hutton Allen, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/08/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024167072. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Alternative Natural, 
14650 Parthenia St, Panorama 
CA 91402. County: Los Angeles. 
Silvia T Penaloza, 13980 Rex St, 
Sylmar CA 91342. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: 12/2019. 
Signed: Silvia T Penaloza, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/08/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024170031. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: God Care Security, 
239 E 104 St, Los Angeles CA 
90003. County: Los Angeles. 
Cory Phipps Sr, 239 E 104 St, 
None, Los Angeles CA 90003. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
08/2024. Signed: Cory Phipps Sr, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/13/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024170835. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Golden State Blueprint 
& Printing, 8055 Lankershim Blvd. 
Unit #10, North Hollywood CA 

91605. County: Los Angeles. 
Vanessa Avila, 8055 Lankershim 
Blvd. Unit #10, North Hollywood CA 
91605. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Vanessa Avila, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/14/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024171249. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: C & S Auto & Tire 
Service, 1412 N Wilminton Blvd, 
Wilmington CA 90744. County: 
Los Angeles. Maria Teresa Paz 
Carranza, 2630 Phipps Ave Apt 
B, Simi Valley CA 93065. This 
business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Maria Teresa Paz 
Carranza, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/14/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024171630. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Emily Morgan 
Creative, 5742 1/2 Fountain Ave 
5742 1/2, Los Angeles CA 90028. 
County: Los Angeles. Emily 
Morgan, 5742 1/2 Fountain Ave 
5742 1/2, Los Angeles CA 90028. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Emily Morgan, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/14/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024172033. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: KCDale & Associates, 
Quickbooks® For Greeks, Seeds 

of Faith, The Diva Accountant, The 
Diva CPA, 2390 Crenshaw Blvd 
Suite 268, Torrance CA 90501. 
County: Los Angeles. KCDale & 
Associates LLC, 2390 Crenshaw 
Blvd Suite 268, Torrance CA 90501. 
State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Kiva 
Dale, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/15/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024172141. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Assortments Of Mine, 
11657 Wakeman St, Whittier CA 
90606. County: Los Angeles. 
Evanne Daniel Thistlewood, 11657 
Wakeman St, Whittier CA 90606. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Evanne Daniel Thistlewood, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/15/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024172525. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Cowboi Creative, 
5742 1/2 Fountain Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90028. County: Los 
Angeles. Emily Morgan, 5742 1/2 
Fountain Ave, Los Angeles CA 
90028. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Emily Morgan, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/15/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024173731. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 

business as: BLUUESTHETICS, 
3215 Overland Ave 8163, Los 
Angeles CA 90034. County: Los 
Angeles.  Cheyenne Bluford, 
3215 Overland Ave #8163, Los 
Angeles CA 90034. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Cheyenne Bluford, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/19/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024174270. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Sona Butterfield, 9465 
Wilshire Blvd Ste 300, Beverly Hills 
CA 90212. County: Los Angeles. 
Alicia Butterfield, 9465 Wilshire 
Blvd Ste 300, Beverly Hills CA 
90212. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Alicia Butterfield, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/19/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024174698. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Nyvia Projects, 12616 
Terra Bella St, Pacoima CA 91331. 
County: Los Angeles. Nyvia Inc, 
12616 Terra Bella St, Pacoima 
CA 91331. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Gevorg Atoyan, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/20/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024174892. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Light On Glass, 519 

South Brand Blvd, San Fernando 
CA 91340. County: Los Angeles. 
Kim Segel, 519 South Brand 
Blvd, San Fernando CA 91340. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Kim Segel, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/20/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024175653. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Van Dyke Coffee 
Roasters, 3182 W Olympic Blvd, 
Los Angeles CA 90006. County: 
Los Angeles. JD2025 Inc, 3182 
W Olympic Blvd, Los Angeles CA 
90006. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Dongjun Cho, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/21/2024. NOTICE - This 
fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed 
prior to that date. The filing of 
this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024175990. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Safeworld Security 
Services, 5153 Hesperia Ave, 
Encino CA 91316. County: Los 
Angeles.  Secureplus Services 
Inc, 5153 Hesperia Ave, Encino 
CA 91316. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is 
conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the 
fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2024. Signed: 
Larisa Notkin, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/21/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024176805. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
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business as: Keebhut, 14106 
Pontlavoy Ave, Santa Fe Springs 
CA 90670. County: Los Angeles. 
AA International Ventures LLC, 
14106 Pontlavoy Ave, Santa 
Fe Springs CA 90670. State of 
organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Aryan Manish Khemani 
managing member. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in 
the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/22/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date 
it was filed on, in the office of the 
County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024176838. 
The following person(s) is/
are doing business as: 1881 
Club; Speakeasy1881, 1881 E 
Washington Blvd, Pasadena CA 
91104. County: Los Angeles. 
Speakeasy 1881 LLC, 1881 E 
Washington Blvd, Pasadena CA 
91104. State of organization: 
California. This business is 
conducted by: a limited liability 
company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2017. 
Signed: Gail Casburn, managing 
member. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/22/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024176848. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: West Coast Yacht 
Services, 12707 Mitchell Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90066. County: Los 
Angeles. Rooster Panda LLC, 
12707 Mitchell Ave, Los Angeles 
CA 90066. State of organization: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Jennifer Gayosso, managing 
member. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/22/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024176944. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Joy And 
Bliss Crystals, 741 W 24th St Apt 
1, San Pedro CA 90731. County: 
Los Angeles. Thania Bogarin, 741 
W 24th St Apt 1, San Pedro CA 
90731. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Thania Bogarin, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/22/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024177483. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Gotu 
Records, 8306 Wilshire Blvd #8072, 
Beverly Hills CA 90211. County: 
Los Angeles. Bernadette Cooper, 
8306 Wilshire Blvd #8072, Beverly 
Hills CA 90211. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Bernadette Cooper, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/22/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178064. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Klear, 22120 
Clarendon St., #205, Woodland Hills 
CA 91367. County: Los Angeles. T L 
V Marketing Inc., 22120 Clarendon 
St., #205, Woodland Hills CA 91367. 
State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 06/2023. 
Signed: Lior Edri, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178067. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Strongwork 
Healthcare Consultants, 8201 
Canoga Ave., #9504, Canoga Park 
CA 91309. County: Los Angeles. 
Janina Sukhu, 8201 Canoga Ave., 
#9504, Canoga Park CA 91309. 

This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Janina Sukhu, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/23/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178069. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Emrich 
Apartments, 8722 Moorcroft Pl, West 
Hills CA 91307. County: Los Angeles. 
Friedericke Emrich, 8722 Moorcroft Pl, 
West Hills CA 91307. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Friedericke Emrich, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/23/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178315. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: The Dog 
Library, 4568 Falcon Ave, Long Beach 
CA 90807. County: Los Angeles. 
Shawna Baskette, 4568 Falcon Ave, 
Long Beach CA 90807. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Shawna Baskette, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/23/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178615. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Chat Rays 
Media, 3437 Crooked Creek Dr, 
Diamond Bar CA 91765. County: 
Los Angeles. T.E.F. International 
Investment, Inc., 3437 Crooked 
Creek Dr, Diamond Bar CA 91765. 
State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 11/2018. 
Signed: Long Ye, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 

with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/26/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178687. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Britzman 
Permit Services, 2162 Crawford 
Ave, Altadena CA 91001. County: 
Los Angeles. Aurora Britzman, 
2162 Crawford Ave, Altadena CA 
91001. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Aurora Britzman, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/26/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178734. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Breakpoint 
Interactive; Breakpoint Entertainment, 
604 Glenwood Rd Apt 4, Glendale CA 
91202.  County: Los Angeles. Arnis 
Manassian, 604 Glenwood Rd Apt 4, 
Glendale CA 91202. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Arnis Manassian, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/26/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178897. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Neetu Gillespie Real Estate, 403 
Torrance Blvd. Redondo Beach 
CA 90277.  County: Los Angeles. 
SKG Worldwide Inc., 403 Torrance 
Blvd. Redondo Beach CA 90277. 
State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Neetu Gillespie, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/26/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 

date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178984. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Senior 
Helpers Of North Valley, 7410 Cliffside 
Ct, West Hills CA 91307. County: 
Los Angeles. Elder Care Holdings 
Corporation, 7410 Cliffside Ct, West 
Hills CA 91307. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Jyoti Suhag, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/26/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179242. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: MTT 
Photography, 4424 Murietta Ave 12, 
Sherman Oaks CA 901423. County: 
Los Angeles. Marcus T. Thomas, 
4424 Murietta Ave 12, Sherman 
Oaks CA 901423. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Marcus T. Thomas, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/26/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179479. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: SVR 
Group; SVR Global, 5460 Sierra 
Vista Ave Unit 212, Los Angeles CA 
90038. County: Los Angeles. Suren 
Vardanyants, 325 N Larchmont 
Blvd Ste 110, Los Angeles CA 
90004. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Suren Vardanyants, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/26/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 

09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179806. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Wrigley 
Exchange, 338 W Willow St, Long 
Beach CA 90806. County: Los 
Angeles. Mharljoy Mendoza Macias, 
338 W Willow St, Long Beach CA 
90806. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 04/2014. 
Signed: Mharljoy Mendoza Macias, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/27/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179989. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Quinto 
Technology, 2101 Grant Ave Apt 
H, Redondo Beach CA 90278. 
County: Los Angeles. Mark Quinto, 
2101 Grant Ave Apt H, Redondo 
Beach CA 90278. This business is 
conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
01/2024. Signed: Mark Quinto, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/27/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name 
Statement: 2024180081. The 
following person(s) is/are doing 
business as: Mother Hen’s 
Marshmallows, 2720 Walnut 
St, Huntington Park CA 90255. 
County: Los Angeles. Jose 
Barraza Camargo, 2720 Walnut 
St, Huntington Park CA 90255. 
This business is conducted by: 
an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Jose Barraza Camargo, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/27/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name 
statement expires five years from 
the date it was filed on, in the office 
of the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must be 
filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in violation 
of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024180139. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: PUNKU, 
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17336 Roscoe Blvd., Northridge CA 
91325. County: Los Angeles. Pablo 
Ivan De La Cruz, 17336 Roscoe Blvd., 
Northridge CA 91325. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Pablo Ivan De La Cruz, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/27/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024180281. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Tutti, 
Tutti Made In USA, Tutti Bowling 
Wear, 850 S Broadway Ste 400, 
Los Angeles CA 90014. County: 
Los Angeles. Adwear, Inc, 850 S 
Broadway Ste 400, Los Angeles 
CA 90014. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 04/2019. 
Signed: Yassaman Hariri, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/27/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024180701. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Inhype 
Sanctuary, 110 E. WIlson Ave., 
Glendale CA 91206. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: C4046287. Kevin 
Do, 110 E. WIlson Ave., Glendale CA 
91206. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
08/2024. Signed: Kevin Do, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/27/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024180708. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: AM 
Investigative Services, 15037 San 
Feliciano Dr., La Mirada CA 90638. 
County: Los Angeles. Albert M. 
Maldonado, 15037 San Feliciano Dr., 
La Mirada CA 90638. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 

transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Albert 
M. Maldonado, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/27/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024180771. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Public 
Health Partners, 6455 Clybourn Ave, 
North Hollywood CA 91606. County: 
Los Angeles. David Flores, 6455 
Clybourn Ave, North Hollywood CA 
91606. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: David Flores, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/28/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181097. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Busy And 
Bumbling, 10864 Marklein Ave, 
Mission Hills CA 91345. County: 
Los Angeles. Serly Khodabakhshi, 
10864 Marklein Ave, Mission Hills CA 
91345. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Serly Khodabakhshi, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/28/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181344. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Carbon 
Remodeling, 6133 Bristol Parkway 
Suite 110, Culver City CA 90230. 
County: Los Angeles. Carbon 
Development Group, Inc., 6133 
Bristol Parkway Suite 110, Culver 
City CA 90230. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Charles Finkelstein-Sharpe, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 

with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/28/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181408. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Hopeless Music Academy, 
15918 Arminta Street, Van Nuys 
CA 91406. County: Los Angeles. 
The Hopeless Foundation, 15918 
Arminta Street, Van Nuys CA 91406. 
State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: 
a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Louis David Posen, 
President. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/28/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181780. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Biometrics 
818, 8335 Winnetka Ave 118, 
Winnetka CA 91306. County: Los 
Angeles. Elizabeth Essington, 8335 
Winnetka Ave 118, Winnetka CA 
91306. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Elizabeth Essington, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/28/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 08/31/2024, 09/07/2024, 
09/14/2024 and 09/21/2024.

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles

825 Maple Ave
Torrance CA 90503

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Kathryn Ann Stratford, an 
adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 10/18/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. P Room 440

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: 
Kathryn Ann Stratford. And a 

petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 

from Kathryn Ann Stratford to 
Kathryn Stratford McCarthy

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 29, 2024.
Judge David K. Reinert
Judge of the Superior Court
24TRP00342
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024

ORDER TO SHOW CAUSE FOR 
CHANGE OF NAME

Superior Court of California
County of Los Angeles
300 East Walnut Street
Pasadena CA 91101

In the Matter of the Petition 
of Nicholas Matthew Mlachnik, 
an adult over the age of 18 years.

​Date: 11/08/2024. Time: 8.30am 
Dept. P

It appearing that the following per-
son whose name is to be changed 

is over 18 years of age: 
Nicholas Matthew Mlachnik. And 
a petition for change of names hav-
ing been duly filed with the clerk of 
this Court, and it appearing from 

said petition that said petitioner(s) 
desire to have their name changed 
from Nicholas Matthew Mlachnik 

to NiKlaus Matthew Green

IT IS HEREBY ORDERED that all 
persons interested in the above-en-
titled matter of change of names ap-
pear before the above-entitled court 
to show cause why the petition for 
change of name(s) should not be 
granted.

Any person objecting to the name 
changes described must file a 
written petition that includes the 
reasons for the objection at least 
two court days before the matter 
is scheduled to be heard and must 
appear at the hearing to show 
cause why the petition should not 
be granted. If no written objection is 
timely filed, the court may grant the 
petition without a hearing.

IT IS FURTHER ORDERED that a 
copy of this order be published in 
the British Weekly, a newspaper of 
general circulation for the County 
of Los Angeles, for four successive 
weeks prior to the date set for hear-
ing of said petition. 

Dated: August 30, 2024
Robin Miller Sloan, judge
Judge of the Superior Court
24NNCP00511
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024174196. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Agency At 
Your Service, Sev Travel And Tours, 
Turkish Travel And Tours, 3901 W 
4th Street 2, Los Angeles CA 90020. 

County: Los Angeles. Sevim Acun 
Cameron, 3901 W 4th Street 2, Los 
Angeles CA 90020. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: 
n/a. Signed: Sevim Acun Cameron, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/19/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024175687. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Auto Part 
Recycler, 7711 S Alameda St, Los 
Angeles CA 90001. County: Los 
Angeles. Mr. Ford Auto Dismantling 
Inc., 7711 S Alameda St, Los Ange-
les CA 90001. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 07/2024. 
Signed: Jesus Cadena, President. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/21/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024177603. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Raw Power 
Electric, 5908 Lorelei Ave, Lakewood 
CA 90712. County: Los Angeles. 
Dennis D Wilson, 5908 Lorelei Ave, 
Lakewood CA 90712. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious business 
name or names listed herein on: n/a. 
Signed: Dennis D Wilson, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/22/2024. NOTICE - 
This fictitious name statement expires 
five years from the date it was filed 
on, in the office of the County Clerk. 
A new Fictitious Business Name 
Statement must be filed prior to that 
date. The filing of this statement does 
not of itself authorize the use in this 
state of a fictitious business name in 
violation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178351. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: RI Supercar, 
2121 Rosecrans Ave Ste 2310, El 
Segundo CA 90245. County: Los An-
geles. Russel Islam, 2121 Rosecrans 
Ave Ste 2310, El Segundo CA 90245. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business under 
the fictitious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Russel 
Islam, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 

is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/23/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178393. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: JC Advising 
Services, 1131 1/2 W 85th St, Los 
Angeles CA 90044. County: Los An-
geles. Jose C Villafranco, 1131 1/2 W 
85th St, Los Angeles CA 90044. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 10/2019. Signed: Jose C Villa-
franco, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/23/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024178998. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Mental 
Health Forward, 3633 E. Broadway, 
Long Beach CA 90803. County: Los 
Angeles. AI#ON: 0509985. Mental 
Health America of Los Angeles, 3633 
E. Broadway, Long Beach CA 90803. 
State of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 08/2024. Signed: Shu-Yung 
Kung, CFO. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/26/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179283. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Ricky’s PR 
Auto Body Shop, 2411 Sichel St Unit 
B, Los Angeles CA 90031. County: 
Los Angeles. Ricardo Silva, 2411 
Sichel St Unit B, Los Angeles CA 
90031. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2023. 
Signed: Ricardo Silva, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/26/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The fil-
ing of this statement does not of itself 
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authorize the use in this state of a ficti-
tious business name in violation of the 
rights of another under federal, state 
or common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024 
and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179675. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: What A 
Sweet Art, Gift Wana, 2108 N Gle-
noaks Blvd., Burbank CA 91504. 
County: Los Angeles. Pina Group 
Inc., 2108 N Glenoaks Blvd., Burbank 
CA 91504. State of incorporation: 
California. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Ivette Mesrobi, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/27/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024179731. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: Hogan 
Events, Yard Cards By Star Party, 
Event Suite, 1590 Rosecrans Ave 
D166, Manhattan Beach CA 90266. 
County: Los Angeles. Hogan Evengs 
Group LLC, 1590 Rosecrans Ave 
D166, Manhattan Beach CA 90266. 
State of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Monique Hogan, Member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and correct. 
This statement is filed with the Coun-
ty Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/27/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Statement of Abandonment 
of Use of Fictitious Business 
Name: 2024181687. Current file: 
2024002717. The following person 
has abandoned the use of the ficti-
tious business name: The World of 
Bakery And Restaurant; The World 
of Bakery, 6001 Hooper Ave, Los 
Angeles CA 90001. The World of 
Bakery And Restaurant Corp, 6001 
Hooper Ave, Los Angeles CA 90001. 
The fictitious business name referred 
to above was filed on: 01/04/2024, in 
the County of Los Angeles. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
Signed: Delfino Martinez Gutierrez, 
CEO. Registrant(s) declared that all 
information in the statement is true 
and correct. This statement is filed 
with the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 08/28/2024.  Published: 
09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024 
and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name Statement: 
2024181834. The following person(s) 
is/are doing business as: HAL, 1300 
S Broadway Unit G, Glendale CA 
91205. County: Los Angeles. Hayk 

Kirakosyan, 1300 S Broadway Unit 
G, Glendale CA 91205. This busi-
ness is conducted by: an individual. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed here-
in on: 08/2024. Signed: Hayk Kirako-
syan, owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/29/2024. NO-
TICE - This fictitious name statement 
expires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the Coun-
ty Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior to 
that date. The filing of this statement 
does not of itself authorize the use in 
this state of a fictitious business name 
in violation of the rights of another un-
der federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024181894. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Crumbl-Hastings Ranch, 3827 E 
Foothill Blvd, Pasadena CA 91107. 
County: Los Angeles. Ellevee LLC, 
7111 Santa Monica Blvd B411, 
West Hollywood CA 90046. State 
of organization: California. This 
business is conducted by: a limited 
liability company. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Daniel Vine, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/29/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182178. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Front Door Escrow, A Non-Indepen-
dent Broker Escrow, 2121 Rose-
crans Ave Ste 2310, El Segundo CA 
90245. County: Los Angeles. Front 
Door Ltd, 2121 Rosecrans Ave Ste 
2310, El Segundo CA 90245. State 
of incorporation: California. This 
business is conducted by: a corpora-
tion. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Rus-
sel Islam, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182197. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Diagnostic Radiology Specialists, 
1201 S Hope Street Apt 3420, Los 
Angeles CA 90015. County: Los An-
geles. AI#ON: 6223856. Diagnostic 
Radiology Specialists, A Profession-
al Medical Corporation, 1201 S Hope 
Street Apt 3420, Los Angeles CA 

90015. State of incorporation: Cal-
ifornia. This business is conducted 
by: a corporation. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Arpan Jitendra Desai, CEO. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/29/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182218. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Kahn’s Bazaar, 5112 Sepulve-
da Blvd 201, Sherman Oaks CA 
91403. County: Los Angeles. Ash-
khan Aref, 5112 Sepulveda Blvd 
201, Sherman Oaks CA 91403. 
This business is conducted by: an 
individual. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Ashkhan Aref, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/29/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182234. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
QT Real Estate Photography, 795 
Gaviota Avenue, Long Beach CA 
90813. County: Los Angeles. Quiet 
Thunder Media LLC, 795 Gaviota 
Avenue, Long Beach CA 90813. 
State of organization: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
limited liability company. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 06/2017. Signed: Angela Ann 
Valley, managing member. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/29/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182815. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Ava’s Apothecary, 1730 Cami-
no Palmero Street Apt 106, Los 
Angeles CA 90046. County: Los 
Angeles. True Apothecary, 1730 
Camino Palmero Street Apt 106, 
Los Angeles CA 90046. State of 
incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 

The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the ficti-
tious business name or names listed 
herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Tonya 
Lariviere, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182851. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
JC Auto Sales, 2817 Everest Way 
535, Pine Mountain Club, CA 93222. 
County: Kern. Jose Francisco Cam-
bronero, 18375 Ventura Blvd 535, 
Tarzana CA 91356. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 06/2024. Signed: Jose 
Francisco Cambronero, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182866. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Gluten Free Meister; glutenfreenoo-
dle.com, 8104 Maxine St, Pico Rive-
ra CA 90660. County: Los Angeles. 
AI#ON: 3694313. Kobayashi Noo-
dle International, Inc., 8104 Maxine 
St, Pico Rivera CA 90660. State of 
incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: 08/2014. Signed: 
Aya Y Sugiura, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182955. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Truvella Cosmetics; Truvella 
Beauty, 6300 Variel Ave., Ste 102, 
Woodland Hills CA 91367. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. AI#ON: 4794550. 
More Water Inc., 6300 Variel Ave., 
Ste 102, Woodland Hills CA 91367. 
State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-

der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Joseph Caputo, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182958. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
B&B Mobile Notary, 23261 Erwin St. 
Woodland Hills CA 91367. County: 
Los Angeles. Joanne Lynn Bowland, 
23261 Erwin St. Woodland Hills CA 
91367. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Joanne Lynn Bowland, owner. Reg-
istrant(s) declared that all informa-
tion in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182960. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Heart2Serve, 21221 Oxnard Street 
Apt. 628, Woodland Hills CA 91367. 
County: Los Angeles. Linda Kay 
Larson, 21221 Oxnard Street Apt. 
628, Woodland Hills CA 91367. This 
business is conducted by: an individ-
ual. The Registrant(s) commenced 
to transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Linda 
Kay Larson, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024182962. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Angels Van, 7403 Jason Ave, West 
Hills CA 91307. County: Los Ange-
les. Angels Group of Companies 
LLC, 7403 Jason Ave, West Hills 
CA 91307. State of organization: 
California. This business is conduct-
ed by: a limited liability company. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 
transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Joji 
M. Jacob, manager. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 

Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024183119. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Apex Balcony Inspection, 4645 Van 
Nuys Blvd. #201, Sherman Oaks CA 
91403. County: Los Angeles. Apex 
Adu Builders, 4645 Van Nuys Blvd. 
#201, Sherman Oaks CA 91403. 
State of incorporation: California. 
This business is conducted by: a 
corporation. The Registrant(s) com-
menced to transact business un-
der the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Oren Diamant, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
08/30/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024183272. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
From A Prince, 15590 Marie Place, 
Westminster CA 92683. County: Los 
Angeles. Deandre Kerell Adkins, 
15590 Marie Place, Westminster CA 
92683. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Deandre Kerell Adkins, 
owner. Registrant(s) declared that 
all information in the statement is 
true and correct. This statement is 
filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 08/30/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024183511. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Lucky-Charm, 611 Wilshire Blvd 
Suite 900 PMB #538, Los Angeles 
CA 90017. County: Los Angeles. 
Yoori Kim, 611 Wilshire Blvd Suite 
900 PMB #538, Los Angeles CA 
90017. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 
Signed: Yoori Kim, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 09/03/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
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Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024183588. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Mandy Nail Studio, 887 N Lake Ave 
Ste 101, Pasadena CA 91104. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Xuemei Cao, 887 N 
Lake Ave Ste 101, Pasadena CA 
91104. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Xuemei Cao, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/03/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024183942. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Hayley’s House, 865 Via de 
la Paz Unit #69, Pacific Palisades 
CA 90272. County: Los Angeles. 
Sober Is Sexy, LLC, 865 Via de la 
Paz Unit #69, Pacific Palisades CA 
90272. State of organization: Cali-

fornia. This business is conducted 
by: a limited liability company. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 01/2023. Signed: Hay-
ley Mortison, CEO. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/03/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024184558. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Eckeard’s Mobile Service, 2020 
Nichols Street, Pomona CA 91768. 
County: Los Angeles. Chris Eckeard, 
2020 Nichols Street, Pomona CA 
91768. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name or 
names listed herein on: n/a. Signed: 
Chris Eckeard, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/03/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-

lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024184653. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
Ely Realty, 4413 Coldwater Canyon 
Ave, Studio City CA 91604. County: 
Los Angeles. LMW Construction Inc, 
4413 Coldwater Canyon Ave, Studio 
City CA 91604.  State of incorpora-
tion: California. This business is con-
ducted by: a corporation. The Reg-
istrant(s) commenced to transact 
business under the fictitious busi-
ness name or names listed herein 
on: 08/2024. Signed: Lee Meydan 
Weinstein, CEO. Registrant(s) de-
clared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/03/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024184656. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
AEVA; Akiva Films, Kivy Media, 
12439 Magnolia Blvd., Suite 100, 
Valley Village CA 91607. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Magnafilm, Inc., 
12439 Magnolia Blvd., Suite 100, 
Valley Village CA 91607. State of 
incorporation: California. This busi-
ness is conducted by: a corporation. 
The Registrant(s) commenced to 

transact business under the fic-
titious business name or names 
listed herein on: n/a. Signed: Meir 
Sharony, President. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/03/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024185207. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Comme Des Garfield; Reelboy, 
1611 Glendon Avenue Apt 2, Los 
Angeles CA 90024. County: Los 
Angeles. Demetrios Tzamaras, 
1611 Glendon Avenue Apt 2, Los 
Angeles CA 90024. This business 
is conducted by: an individual. The 
Registrant(s) commenced to trans-
act business under the fictitious 
business name or names listed 
herein on: 08/2024. Signed: Deme-
trios Tzamaras, owner. Registrant(s) 
declared that all information in the 
statement is true and correct. This 
statement is filed with the County 
Clerk of Los Angeles County on: 
09/04/2024. NOTICE - This fictitious 
name statement expires five years 
from the date it was filed on, in the 
office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 

federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024185215. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
34 North Collectibles, 21301 Erwin 
Street Unit 522, Woodland Hills 
CA 91367. County: Los Angeles. 
Chris Duhancioglu, 21301 Erwin 
Street Unit 522, Woodland Hills CA 
91367. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Chris Duhancioglu, owner. 
Registrant(s) declared that all infor-
mation in the statement is true and 
correct. This statement is filed with 
the County Clerk of Los Angeles 
County on: 09/04/2024. NOTICE 
- This fictitious name statement ex-
pires five years from the date it was 
filed on, in the office of the County 
Clerk. A new Fictitious Business 
Name Statement must be filed prior 
to that date. The filing of this state-
ment does not of itself authorize the 
use in this state of a fictitious busi-
ness name in violation of the rights 
of another under federal, state or 
common law (see Section 14411, 
et seq., B&P Code.) Published: 
09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 09/21/2024 
and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024185674. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business 
as: Lawrence Mobile Detail, 6215 
Overhill Dr Suite C, Los Angeles CA 
90043. County: Los Angeles. Law-
rence Deshuan Daniels Jr., 6215 
Overhill Dr Suite C, Los Angeles CA 
90043. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 08/2024. 

Signed: Lawrence Deshuan Daniels 
Jr., owner. Registrant(s) declared 
that all information in the statement 
is true and correct. This statement 
is filed with the County Clerk of Los 
Angeles County on: 09/04/2024. 
NOTICE - This fictitious name state-
ment expires five years from the 
date it was filed on, in the office of 
the County Clerk. A new Fictitious 
Business Name Statement must 
be filed prior to that date. The filing 
of this statement does not of itself 
authorize the use in this state of a 
fictitious business name in viola-
tion of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024.

Fictitious Business Name State-
ment: 2024185745. The following 
person(s) is/are doing business as: 
JP Builds, 19442 Baelen Street, 
Rowland Heights CA 91748. Coun-
ty: Los Angeles. Joshua Park, 19442 
Baelen Street, Rowland Heights CA 
91748. This business is conducted 
by: an individual. The Registrant(s) 
commenced to transact business 
under the fictitious business name 
or names listed herein on: 09/2024. 
Signed: Joshua Park, owner. Regis-
trant(s) declared that all information 
in the statement is true and cor-
rect. This statement is filed with the 
County Clerk of Los Angeles County 
on: 09/04/2024. NOTICE - This fic-
titious name statement expires five 
years from the date it was filed on, in 
the office of the County Clerk. A new 
Fictitious Business Name Statement 
must be filed prior to that date. The 
filing of this statement does not of 
itself authorize the use in this state 
of a fictitious business name in vio-
lation of the rights of another under 
federal, state or common law (see 
Section 14411, et seq., B&P Code.) 
Published: 09/07/2024, 09/14/2024, 
09/21/2024 and 09/28/2024. 

WE CANCEL TIMESHARES
Many people believe their timeshares cannot be cancelled, but they
often can be. Our founder and CEO, Chuck McDowell, has successfully
helped over 30,000 families get rid of their timeshare and he can
likely help you too. If you were misled, lied to, or pressured, you
may have an easy exit with a 100% money back guarantee.

•  Start with a FREE consultation to tell your story.

•  If we see that the circumstances of your situation qualify
   you to exit the timeshare, you’ll be assigned a specialist to walk
   you through the process. Don’t think for another minute that you

are stuck with this. What we do is help
you cancel your timeshare along with all
of the debt and fees associated with it.
Guaranteed.

“Wesley Financial was awesome 
to work with. They were pro-
fessional and very understanding
of the situation we were in.
Thank you all so much. This has
been a huge burden and you 
all helped relieve that burden.
Thank you.”

- Kyle S
Wesley Financial Group, LLC client

Chuck McDowell, Founder & CEO

•  Our Resolution Department works quickly to have your
  timeshare and all related fees permanently terminated.   

We’ve been able to help many timeshare owners that 
contact us. You could be one phone call away from complete
peace of mind.

We have a dedicated team waiting for your call.

How Does the Cancellation Process Work?  

Call 1.877.854.0943

4.7 based on 1,103 reviews 4.9 based on 463 reviews 4.7 based on 833 reviews

Get your free information kit and see if you qualify:

*This is an Advertisement. Wesley Financial Group, LLC (“WFG”) and/or its a liates, successors, or assigns are
not lawyers and/or a law firm and does not engage inthe practice of law or provide legal advice or legal

representation. Actual results depend on each client’s distinct case and no specific outcome is guaranteed. 

Aging in Place?
Consider an AmeriGlide stair lift 
to keep you safe on your stairs.

Benefits of an AmeriGlide stair lift:

Eliminate the risk of falls. 

Enjoy a comfortable ride up  
and down all of your home.

Enjoy comfortable, safe  
and easy access to all of 
your home.

More affordable than 
options such as moving.

Custom fit to 
your staircase

Indoor and  
Outdoor options

Fast delivery 
and installation

SAVE $200

1-866-654-6288

CALL NOW TO Call today to get your FREE, 
no obligation quote  
in minutes!ON ANY STAIR LIFT!
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Brits in LABW SPORT

Weekend Football Results

Monday’s ResultsNorthern Ireland 
opened their Nations 
League campaign with 
a comfortable 2-0 victo-
ry over Luxembourg at 
Windsor Park in Group 
C3 on Thursday. 
	 Paddy McNair gave 
Northern Ireland the 
lead in the 11th minute 
when he poked home 
from a corner.
	 Dan Ballard dou-
bled the advantage five 
minutes later when the 
defender flicked home 
George Saville’s low 
free-kick.

	 Northern Ireland 
could not add to their 
tally in the second half 
but were rarely trou-
bled by the visitors.
	 The victory is Mi-
chael O’Neill’s first in 
the Nations League, 
and only Northern Ire-
land’s second win in 17 
matches in the competi-
tion.
	 It is also a fourth 
win in six matches 
as O’Neill’s youthful 
squad continue to de-
velop in his second 
stint as manager.

ENGLAND cantered to 
victory in the Second 
Test against Sri Lanka at 
the weekend, fired by a 
remarkable performance 
from the country’s latest 
star, Surrey’s Gus Atkin-
son.
	 Atkinson was on fire at 
Lord’s as England’s new 
golden all-rounder helped 
seal a stunning series win.
	 The 26-year-old bridged 
a 40-year gap to join an 
elite club of players by 
scoring a century and tak-
ing a five-for in the same 
Test.
	 Atkinson put the finish-
ing touches to a 190-run 
victory in the Second Test, 
bagging 5-62 to bowl Sri 
Lanka out for 292.
	 And in doing so he stole 
the Player of the Match 
award from former skip-
per Joe Root, who had hit 
back-to-back centuries.
	 Atkinson said: “To get 
on both honours boards 
will take a while to sink 
in. 
	 “My first red-ball games 
have gone well here and 
I enjoy playing with the 
slope.
	 “We just like to attack 
and, as a bowler, it’s great 
not to worry about con-

ceding too many runs.
	 “I’ve enjoyed it so 
much. Long may it contin-
ue.” While Root is having 
the time of his life with the 
bat, Atkinson is doing the 
same with bat and ball, 
amassing 33 wickets in 
five Tests. 
	 Having burst on the 
scene with a 12-wicket 
haul against the West In-
dies earlier this year he 
has not looked back. His 
Lord’s display has put 
him on a different level 
and in the international 
limelight.
	 It was a pity there was 
such a paltry crowd to see 
his latest heroics, which is 
a major embarrassment 
for cricket’s hierarchy. 
	 The decision to price 
adult tickets at £95 certain-
ly did not help encourage 
the fans to turn up.
	 Sri Lanka resumed on 
53-2 but were never in 
with a chance of stopping 
England, who did not 
need a pumped-up gath-
ering to spur them on to a 
2-0 series lead. 
	 Dimuth Karunaratne 
(55), Dinesh Chandimal 
(58) and Dhananjaya de 
Dilva (50) showed stom-
ach for the fight.

	 Karunaratne’s luck ran 
out, though, when he 
gloved a catch off Olly 
Stone into the grateful 
hands of Jamie Smith. 
	 Angelo Mathews and 
Chandimal built a decent 
partnership until spinner 
Shoaib Bashir struck, hav-
ing the former caught by 
Chris Woakes for 36.
	 Atkinson lured Chan-
dimal into gifting Dan 
Lawrence a catch close in, 
and followed up with the 
wicket of the in-form Ka-
mindu Mendis, snapped 
up by Ben Duckett.
	 Skipper De Silva had no 
answer to Atkinson’s pace 
and skill as he played on 
to give him a fourth wick-
et.
	 The fast bowler then re-
moved Milan Rathnayake 
slashing outside the off-
stump, caught by Smith. 
The smiling Atkinson 
raced with arms out wide 
to be mobbed by his team-
mates.
	 Woakes wrapped up 
the win when Lahiru Ku-
mara holed out as Sri Lan-
ka were dismissed for 292. 
	 Now England will hope 
to make it a 3-0 whitewash 
in the final Test starting at 
The Oval on Friday.

ed in the manner it did 
beggars belief. And not 
only because Scotland 
seemed a defeated team 
after a frustrating first 
half.
	 Clarke’s side played 
with much more intent 
than they had in Ger-
many but lost two poor 
goals to trail. 
	 First, Szymanski was 
not closed down quickly 
enough by Scott McK-
enna as he lined up a 
30-yarder that bounced 
off a post and past An-
gus Gunn.
	 Scotland then looked 
suspect again as Zalews-
ki drove into the box and 
was felled by a clumsy 
Anthony Ralston chal-
lenge. 
	 Veteran Lewandows-
ki’s conversion was con-
fident and classy as he 
sent Gunn the wrong 
way.
	 Scotland needed to 
respond early in the sec-
ond half and respond 
they did. John McGinn 
forced the ball into a 
dangerous area and 
Christie set up Gilmour 
to strike.
	 That got the home fans 
back onside but hearts 
were in mouths when 
Szymanski sent another 
long-range effort inches 
wide.
	 McTominay continued 
to be Scotland’s main 
threat and he timed 
his run superbly to tap 
home Ben Doak’s low 
centre, the 18-year-old 
having come on for his 
debut alongside Ryan 
Gauld. 
	 Roared on by the 
Hampden crowd, 
Clarke’s men looked the 
most likely to win.
	 However, McGinn 
conceded possession in 
his own half in the pre-
amble to Zalewski’s run 
into the box and Hanley 
led with the wrong foot 
as he fouled the forward 
near the bye-line. 
	 Gunn guessed correct-
ly but could not keep the 
Pole’s penalty out and 
Scotland were consigned 
to another defeat.

Scotland:
cont. from back page

Gus Atkinson: heroics with bat and ball guided 
England to victory at Lords this week

Gus-to! A star is born at Lords
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PUB & RESTAURANT:
116 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 451-1402
Happy Hour Mon-Fri. 4-7

(food specials)
SHOPPE:

132 Santa Monica Blvd.
Santa Monica CA 90401

(310) 394-8765
Open 10am-6pm

Thurs/Fri/Sun: 10am-7pm
Sat: 10am-8pm

cont. on page 19, col. 1

Fri 9/6 Nations League 
11.45am Italy vs France 

11.45am Belgium vs Israel  
11.45am Wales vs Turkey 

 
Sat 9/7 Nations League 
9am Ireland vs England 

11.45am Netherlands vs Bosnia 
11.45am Germany vs Hungary 

World Friendly 
1pm USA vs Canada 

6pm Mexico vs New Zealand 
 

Major League Socer 
5.30pm Houston vs LAFC

 

Sun 9/8 Nations League 
11.45am Portugal vs Scotland 
11.45am Sweden vs Estonia 

 

Mon 9/9 Nations League 
11.45am France vs Belgium 

11.45am Montenegro vs Wales 
 

Tue 9/10 Nations League 
11.45am England vs Finland 
11.45am Ireland vs Greece 

11.45am Netherlands vs Germany 
 

World Friendly 
4pm USA vs New Zealand

BW SPORT/Football

LEE CARSLEY has de-
livered a rabble-rousing 
speech to his England 
players and promised to 
get the best out of them.
	 Carsley called a meet-
ing with the squad when 
they arrived at St George’s 
Park and made it clear he 
wants to deliver an attack-
ing style of play. 
	 But the new interim 
manager also said he 
wanted to shoulder the 
responsibility so that his 
youngsters could go out 
and express themselves 
in England’s Nations 
League clash with the Re-
public of Ireland on Satur-
day. 
	 Manchester City full-
back Rico Lewis, 19, re-
vealed: “The manager 
said, ‘Remember we are 
here to get the best out of 
every player but we need 
to be on it’. He was em-
phasizing that there is a 
lot of pressure on us, but 
he wanted to put pressure 
on themselves as a coach-
ing staff to get the best out 

of us as well.
	 “Even when I was with 
him with the Under-21s 
he wanted to control the 
game and he wanted to 
win games and be excit-
ing. 
	 “He always talked 
about playing exciting 
football so I don’t see why 
not this time.
	 “The players like it, defi-
nitely. Attackers, wingers 
just want to be able to go 
and do their thing. That is 
what he wants to do.” 
	 Lewis also gave a 
ringing endorsement of 
Carsley and says his ex-
perience of working with 
them at Under-21 level 
will stand him in good 
stead in his six-game au-
dition as interim manag-
er.
	 Lewis added: “Most 
of the younger players 
know him, which will 
help us understand him 
more. But I don’t think it 
will take long for the rest 
of the team to get used to 
him.”

Scotland’s miserable 
2024 continued in ag-
onizing fashion on 
Thursday as Poland 
were gifted a stop-
page-time penalty to 
quell a valiant Nations 
League comeback at 
Hampden and secure a 
3-2 victory.
	 Billy Gilmour and 
Scott McTominay had 
scored second-half goals 
for the revived Scots 
to cancel out Sebastian 
Szymanski’s long-range 
effort and Robert Le-
wandowski’s perfectly 
executed spot-kick for 
the visitors.

	 However, as Steve 
Clarke’s side pushed for 
a winner, Nicola Zalews-
ki was the victim of a 
rash challenge by Grant 
Hanley and the Pole - 
who also won the earlier 
penalty - picked himself 
up to score the 97th-min-
ute winner.
	 Scotland, who meekly 
exited this summer’s Eu-
ros with one point from 
three group games, now 
must travel to face Portu-
gal on Sunday with a re-
cord of just one win in 13 
and five defeats in 2024.
	 How this game end-

‘Fresh energy’ 
as Bellamy 
era begins 
with Wales

CONNOR ROBERTS 
says Craig Bellamy 
has already brought a 
fresh energy to Wales 
– just like he did at 
Burnley.
	 The Clarets’ wing-
back Roberts has the 
inside track on Bella-
my (pictured, above), 
given the two seasons 
the pair spent at Turf 
Moor together. And he 
is already telling team-
mates what they can 
expect from their new 
manager, following 
Bellamy’s appointment 
as Rob Page’s successor 
in the summer.
	 Ahead of Wales’ 
opening Nations 
League games against 
Turkey and Monte-
negro, Roberts said: 
“You can see there is 
a new energy around 
the place. Everyone is 
excited to see what a 
Craig Bellamy team 
looks like, how they 
play.
	 “It’s the same with 
the players. We all love 
playing for Wales and 
we all have to impress 
the boss by tuning in 
to his ideas and want 
to be part of something 
successful. I know for 
a fact when there were 
whispers of the gaffer 
coming in, some people 
asked questions – ‘was 
it right, was it not?’
	 “I can assure you I 
thought it was 100 per-
cent the right decision 
to bring in the boss. 
He’s a fantastic coach 
who absolutely loves 
football. He lives and 
breathes it.”

Carsley to let Three 
Lions off the leash

Lee Carsley makes his debut as England’s interim coach this weekend

Darts League Is Back! Tues @7.30pm starting Sept 10
Free Round Of Beers For All Players - Win Or Lose

Complimentary Appetizers

More misery for Scots
n Clarke’s men pay penalty 
and spoil heroic fightback


